

TABULATION OF BIDS  
 MEDICAL EQUIPMENT  
 BID # 5302  
 12 JULY 2019

NAMES OF BIDDERS

ITEM NUM.	DESCRIPTION	BOUND TREE MEDICAL LLC		EVER DIXIE FEM SUPPLY		LIFE-ASSIST INC		MEDICAL SUPPLIES DEPOT		MEDLINE INDUSTRIES INC		PORT CITY MEDICAL LLC		SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY INC		STOP HEART ATTACK
		AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
1.	1000 BAG C-COLLAR LA RESCUE NAVY BLK EA.	21.38		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
2.	6932 BOX MEDICAL PLAND 747-004 EA.	131.82		136.90		128.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		NO BID		NO BID		248.75		NO BID		
3.	17727 CLIPPER SURGICAL 3M 9661L EA.	55.33		104.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		96.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		NO BID		66.66		75.00		NO BID		
4.	17728 WIPE ANTIMICIDAL PDI # Q 55172 12 CANNISTERS CS	72.96 <sup>(X)</sup>		85.00		68.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		64.95		78.03		70.00		95.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		
5.	17729 CHACRA SURGICAL 3M 9662L EA.	55.33		105.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		70.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		NO BID		61.19		70.15		NO BID		
6.	16082 STRETCHER FERN MODEL 9 EA.	895.99		995.90 <sup>(X)</sup>		895.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		NO BID		2147.22		NO BID		NO BID		
7.	4339 PULMON WINDOW # AN 360 EA.	4.91		2.90 <sup>(X)</sup>		5.15 <sup>(X)</sup>		NO BID		NO BID		11.50		NO BID		
8.	6951 BAGS RED BIO MED CS	36.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		45.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		33.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		36.95		44.26		35.73 <sup>(X)</sup>		NO BID		
9.	13637 SODIUM CHLORIDE 250 ml BAG 24/cs CS	59.76 <sup>(X)</sup>		72.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		110.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		63.25 LOCAL PREF.		105.87		69.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		NO BID		
10.	16086 BOX MEDICAL FLAMBEM 2072 EA.	74.89		NO BID		58.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		NO BID		67.34		128.75		NO BID		
11.	16302 M MASK INFANT # RCI 395407 50/cs CS	194.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		154.90		167.00 <sup>(X)</sup>		171.00		360.67		425.00		NO BID		
12.	16147 DRESSING SAM ONKST SEAL # 65062011 2/PK PACK	26.00		22.90 <sup>(X)</sup>		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		34.11		NO BID		

(X) COMMENT

TABULATION OF BIDS		NAMES OF BIDDERS														
Bio # 5302		B.T.	EVER DIXIE	L.A.	M.S.D.	MEDLINE	P.C.M.	S.N.S.	S.H.A.	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
ITEM Num.	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT
13.	16265 Tourniquet CAT # 6515-01-521-7976 EA.	23.91	24.90	21.25 <sup>⊗</sup>	No Bid	27.01	No Bid	25.50 <sup>⊗</sup>	No Bid							
14.	16301 MASK PEDI #1058 50/cs CS	53.50 <sup>⊗</sup>	50.00	49.00 <sup>⊗</sup>	68.00	133.17	166.46	No Bid								
<i>SAME AS LINE 11</i>																
15.	<del>16302 MASK INFANT # 395407 50/cs CS</del>	<del>194.00<sup>⊗</sup></del>	<del>154.90</del>	<del>167.00<sup>⊗</sup></del>	<del>171.00</del>	<del>360.67</del>	<del>425.00</del>	<del>No Bid</del>								
16.	16385 HOLDEN Suction # 22002 EA.	70.45	No Bid	84.00 <sup>⊗</sup>	No Bid	No Bid	102.48	No Bid								
17.	16469 BLANKET DISPOSABLE 6mm 60x80 24/cs CS	112.80 <sup>⊗</sup>	120.00 <sup>⊗</sup>	112.50 <sup>⊗</sup>	No Bid	138.97	112.50 <i>LOCAL PREF.</i>	No Bid								
18.	16481 BOTTOM REPLACEMENT FRAM 5156 BLACK EA.	No Bid	18.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid								
19.	16508 ROOPER CONVERSION # 2311 EA.	16.79	No Bid	30.00 <sup>⊗</sup>	No Bid	20.02	35.36	No Bid								
<i>NOT AWARDED 20. ON THIS BID</i>																
20.	<del>16388 TRIANGLE ROAR WARNING KIT EA.</del>	<del>6.44</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>	<del>No Bid</del>
21.	6887 THOMAS TUBE HOLDER ROAR # 600-10000 25/BOX BOX	68.50 <sup>⊗</sup>	59.75	64.50 <sup>⊗</sup>	No Bid	88.07	93.43	No Bid								
22.	6888 THOMAS TUBE HOLDER PEOI # 600-20000 25/BOX BOX	68.50 <sup>⊗</sup>	59.75	64.50 <sup>⊗</sup>	No Bid	No Bid	93.43	No Bid								
23.	13607 TUBE SHIRLEY 7mm RADIAL 10/BOX BOX	No Bid	95.00 <sup>⊗</sup>	No Bid	No Bid	114.01	164.87	No Bid								
24.	16052 HAND SPLITTER # 34136 1.5 OZ BOTTLE 24/cs CS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	94.00	No Bid	98.77	No Bid								

⊗ - COMMENT

TABULATION OF BIDS		NAMES OF BIDDERS														
BID # 5302		B.I.	EVER DIXIE	L.A.	M.S.D.	MEDLINE	P.C.M.	S.N.S.	S.H.A.							
ITEM NUM.	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	AMOUNT	
25.	16053 HAND SANITIZER # 45827 180Z BOTTLE 4/CS CS	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		60.00		73.10		63.04		No Bid		No Bid
26.	16058 IV PRESSURE INFUSOR CUMAPRES 25/CS 1000ML CS	177.50 <sup>⊕</sup>		54.00 <sup>⊕</sup>		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		120.56		No Bid		
		350310		QUOTING 5/CS												
27.	16084 Box NARCOTICS CNB-200 EA.	40.08		No Bid		40.00 <sup>⊕</sup>		No Bid		79.78		82.48		No Bid		
						LA# ID200										
28.	16182 INFUSION SET SV 523 BLS 50/Box BOX	20.00 <sup>⊕</sup>		54.90		No Bid		47.50		57.49		48.00		No Bid		
		602023														
29.	15003 AIRWAY KING SIZE 3 5/CS CS	160.55 <sup>⊕</sup>		<del>130.00</del>		157.50 <sup>⊕</sup>		No Bid		228.81		286.18		No Bid		
						LA# AC433KIT										
30.	16440 AIRWAY KING SIZE 4 5/CS CS	160.55 <sup>⊕</sup>		<del>130.00</del>		157.50 <sup>⊕</sup>		No Bid		228.81		286.18		No Bid		
						LA# AC434KIT										
31.	16441 AIRWAY KING SIZE 5 5/CS CS	160.55 <sup>⊕</sup>		<del>130.00</del>		157.50 <sup>⊕</sup>		No Bid		228.81		286.18		No Bid		
						LA# AC435KIT										

⊕ - COMMENT      X NOT ACCEPTABLE, SEE EVALUATION SHEET.      \* BACKED OUT OF BID