

BID # 5396

Equip Irrigation

12 SEPT 19

REQ#
14733

FIS
OUTDOOR

JERRY
PAYE

SIZE
ONE

EWING
IRRIGATION

1. 30 EA.
VALVE BOX

7.95

8.78

9.956

9.88

2. 168 EA.
SWING JOINT

20.74

23.74

22.15

28.996

3. 400 EA.
SPlice TUBES

1.00

1.10

1.145

1.087

4. 6 EA.
WIRE-12-2
RED

978.475

1100.00

.467 FT.
1167.50/spool

1089.453

5. 3 EA.
CABLE 14-2
YELLOW

658.602

780.00

.304 FT.
760.00/spool

730.435

6. 84 EA.
SWING JOINT
EL

15.444

12.65

9.497

12.024

7. 84 EA.
1.5" TEE

4.044

1.70

4.352

4.55

8. 1 EA.
COPPER
GROUNDING
PLATE

120.43

85.00

NO BID

149.83

9. 2 EA.
6MM
GROUNDING
POWER KEY

34.634

43.75

NO BID

44.80

10. 30 EA.
COPPER
GROUNDING

12.269

32.50

33.765

26.676

11. 30 EA.
ONE STOP
CONNECTOR

11.097

13.46

11.516

11.71

* - COMMENT

BIO # 5336
Equip Irrigation

REQ #
14725

FIS
OUTDOOR

JERRY
PATE

SITE
ONE

FWING

1. 168 EA.
R.B. 206E-95
N0226E 26

231.172 *

NO
BID

NO
BID

NO
BID

2. 1 EA.
CONTROL
INTERFACE ICI

7,002.251 *

NO BID

NO BID

NO
BID

3. 30 EA.
CONTROL SURGE
DEVICE

40.506 *

NO BID

NO BID

NO
BID

4. 1 EA.
GOURNING
PLATE ASSEMBLY

95.81 *

NO BID

NO BID

NO
BID

5. 1 EA.
MAXI SURGE
PIPE

160.954 *

NO BID

NO BID

NO
BID

* - COMMENT