

## BID TAB FOR BID #5344

### “OIL CHANGE, TIRE ROTATION AND BALANCING, AND VEHICLE INSPECTION”

| <u>COMPANY</u>                    | <u>PASSENGER CARS, SUV'S, AND VEHICLES W/OIL CHANGE UP TO 5 QUARTS OF OIL</u> | <u>CARS, SUV'S, LIGHT TRUCKS, VANS, AND VEHICLES W/OIL CHANGES UP TO 8 QUARTS OF OIL</u> | <u>LIGHT TRUCKS, VANS, DIESEL POWERED VEHICLES W/OIL CHANGE UP TO 14 QUARTS OF OIL</u> | <u>VEHICLES, LIGHT TRUCKS, VANS, DIESEL POWERED VEHICLES W/OIL CHANGE OF OVER 14 QUARTS OF OIL</u> | <u>COMMENTS:</u>  |
|-----------------------------------|---|--|--|--|---|
| AMERICAN LUBE FAST, LLC           | CONVENTIONAL: \$50.00<br>SYNTHETIC: \$80.00                                   | CONVENTIONAL: \$65.00<br>SYNTHETIC: \$100.00   | CONVENTIONAL: \$100.00<br>SYNTHETIC: \$140.00  | CONVENTIONAL: \$140.00<br>SYNTHETIC: \$170.00  | PROPOSAL DOES NOT INCLUDE WHEEL BALANCING. NO APPT NECESSARY. WAIT TIME 0 TO 10 MIN. SERVICES TIME 30 MIN OR LESS. 5 LOCATIONS AVAILABLE FOR SERVICE.<br>FREE FLUID TOP OFFS BETWEEN OIL CHANGE SERVICES. |
| FAUSAK TIRES & SERVICE            | \$99.95   | \$119.95   | \$139.95   | \$149.95   |   |
| MCGRIFF TREADING COMPANY INC      | NO BID  | NO BID   | NO BID   | NO BID   | <b>NO BID</b>   |
| TAKE 5 OIL CHANGE                 | \$89.93   | \$115.93   | \$129.93   | \$139.93   | <b>BID NOT ACCEPTED:</b><br>DID NOT SIGN BID  |
| BRIDGESTONE OF AMERICAS/FIRESTONE | \$192.48  | \$216.48   | \$264.48   | \$264.48 +<br>\$8/qt over 14   | <b>BID NOT ACCEPTED:</b><br>*DID NOT SIGN BID<br>*DID NOT RETURN BID FORM<br>*NO CITY OF MOBILE TERMS AND CONDITIONS  |