BID 5365 TABULATION

Delivered Parts

Chuck Stevens Chevrolet U J Chevrolet
2/3/20 CHUCK STEVENS 5% Local Vendor
ltems WITHDREW BID Preference
17559 $42.99 $52.46 $49.84
17491 $140.20 $171.10 $162.55
17560 $42.99 $52.46 $49.84
18751 $177.62 $205.91 $195.61
17807 $5.69 $6.59 $6.26
18815 $148.24 $180.92 $171.87
18816 $116.90 $142.66 $135.53
19675 $116.90 $142.66 $135.53
17561 $94.46 $110.39 $104.87
23606 $140.20 $171.70 $163.12
17489 $151.35 $184.71 $175.47
17490 $151.35 $184.71 $175.47
17686 $92.29 $112.65 $107.02
17488 $148.24 $180.92 $171.87
17687 $148.24 $180.92 $171.87
18750 $177.62 $205.94 $195.64
17585 $164.98 $229.53 $218.05
17584 $164.98 $229.53 $218.05
18728 $93.20 $129.67 $123.19
18729 $93.20 $129.67 $123.19
18741 $185.75 $215.79 $205.00

GMGC (INCOMPLETE RETURN)
No Signature




Pick Up Parts

Chuck Stevens Chevrolet U J Chevrolet

5% Local Vendor

ltems Preference
17559 No Bid $52.46 $49.84
17491 No Bid $171.10 $162.55
17560 No Bid $52.46 $49.84
18751 No Bid $205.91 $195.61
17807 No Bid $6.59 $6.26
18815 No Bid $180.92 $171.87
18816 No Bid $142.66 $135.53
19675 No Bid $142.66 $135.53
17561 No Bid $110.39 $104.87
23606 No Bid $171.70 $163.12
17489 No Bid $184.71 $175.47
17490 No Bid $184.71 $175.47
17686 No Bid $112.65 $107.02
17488 No Bid $180.92 $171.87
17687 No Bid $180.92 $171.87
18750 No Bid $205.94 $195.64
17585 No Bid $229.53 $218.05
17584 No Bid $229.53 $218.05
18728 No Bid $129.67 $123.19
18729 No Bid $129.67 $123.19
18741 No Bid $215.79 $205.00

GMGC (INCOMPLETE RETURN)
No Signature




