

Vendors

ITEM	BAY PAPER			DEES PAPER			MOBILE JANITORIAL					
9658		\$30.1100	44000	0.00068/SHEET		\$44.6800	44000	.0010/SHEET		\$33.2900	44000	0.00075/SHEET
9633		\$16.6000	4800	.0034/FOOT		\$48.3900	9600	.0050/FOOT		\$18.3540	4800	.0038/FOOT
9636		\$32.3500	9600	.00336/FOOT		\$48.3900	9600	.0050/FOOT		\$36.7600	9600	.0038/FOOT
9632		\$17.3400	4000	.0043/TOWEL		\$23.5000	4000	.0058/TOWEL		\$19.1800	4000	.0047/TOWEL
9666		\$22.8700	4000	.0057/TOWEL		\$30.2500	4000	.0075/TOWEL		\$25.9300	4000	.0064/TOWEL
13949		\$18.9000	2550	.0074/SHEET		\$18.9600	2520	.0075/SHEET		\$19.9900	2520	.0079/SHEET
17091		\$42.9800	12	3.58/ROLL		\$59.5800	12	4.96/ROLL		\$49.0000	12	4.08/ROLL
9637	NO SUB	\$15.5400	2400	.0064/TOWEL		\$26.6300	2400	.011/TOWEL		\$17.1800		
9638		\$52.0500	1000	.052/SHEET		\$42.5500	672	.063/SHEET		\$49.4100	902	.054/SHEET
9639		NO BID				\$28.6000	2250	.0127/SHEET		\$24.4000	2250	.010/SHEET
9673		\$52.0500	1000	.052/SHEET		\$47.3400	1008	.0469/SHEET		\$50.1800	1008	.049/SHEET
9698	NO SUB	\$51.0600	1200	.0425/SHEET		\$27.9000	400	.069/SHEET		\$32.3500		
9709		\$28.5200	24000	.0011/FOOT		\$36.5000	24000	.00152/FOOT		\$29.0000	24000	.0012/FOOT
13090		\$44.3900	475	.093/FOOT		\$48.1000	475	.101/SHEET		\$38.5600	943	.040/FOOT
13202		\$25.2200	12000	.0021/FOOT		\$32.4200	12000	.0027/FOOT		\$29.3900	12000	.0024/FOOT
17356		NO BID				\$61.9400	6900	.0089/FOOT		NO BID		
17360		NO BID				\$41.6600	36000	.0011/SHEET		NO BID		

BID 5366

OFFICE SOLUTION

OFFICE DEPOT

ITEM								
9658	\$47.5200	44000	.00108/SHEET			29.01	48000	.0006/SHEET
9633	\$32.1100	4800	.0066/FOOT			15.36	4800	.0032/FOOT
9636	\$46.2600	9600	.0048/FOOT			15.36	4800	.0032/FOOT
9632	\$25.0600	4000	.0062/TOWEL			16.56	4008	.0041/TOWEL
9666	\$31.4300	4000	.0078/TOWEL			21.05	4008	.0052/TOWEL
13949	\$25.6200	3000	.0085/SHEET			17.95	3000	.059/SHEET
17091	\$58.9000	12	4.90/ROLL			20.92	6	3.48/ROLL
9637	\$27.8300	2400	.0115/TOWEL			32.04	2400	.0134/TOWEL
9638	\$41.2700	672	.061/SHEET			35.41	900	.0393/SHEET
9639	\$27.1200	2240	.012/SHEET			28.82	2016	.0143/SHEET
9673	\$45.9200	1008	.045/SHEET			47.34	1008	.047/SHEET
9698	\$32.3000	400	.080/SHEET			49.24	400	.123/SHEET
9709	\$39.9500	24000	.0016/FOOT			24.15	24000	.0010/SHEET
13090	\$49.2600	475	.103/FOOT			42.94	475	.0904/FOOT
13202	\$33.8900	12000	.0028/FOOT			21.96	12000	.0018/FOOT
17356	\$70.9700	6900	.0102/FOOT			20.92	4800	.0044/FOOT
17360	\$43.1200	36000	.0011/SHEET			32.47	36000	.0009/SHEET