Street Name Signs

Locate Delivered

Item Price Bid/LF |Vendor Local Vendor Price  |Purchase [Total
Complete Signs LLc. 9" Sign $51.00 0.5 53.5500 1343| $71,917.65
12" Sign $63.00 0.5 66.1500 460.5| $30,462.08
$102,379.73
Graybar 9" $16.15 0 16.1500 1343| $21,689.45
12" Sign $14.61 0 14.6100 460.5| $6,727.91
$28,417.36
Irby 9" Sign No Bid 1343 $0.00
12" Sign  [No bid 460.5 $0.00
Newman Signs 9" Sign $10.27 0.1 11.2970 1343| $15,171.87
12" Sign $9.07 0.1 9.9770 460.5| $4,594.41
$19,766.28
Vulcan Inc. 9" Sign 11.95 0.5 12.5475 1343 $16,851.29
12" Sign $8.79 0.5 9.2295 460.5 $4,250.18

$21,101.48




Street Brackets

Locate Delivered
Item Price Bid Vendor Local Vendor Price  |Purchase |Total

14.5"-16"

Complete Signs LLc.  |Long Arm $45.00 0.5 47.2500 307| $14,505.75
24" Long

Arm $64.00 0.5 67.2000 151| $10,147.20

$24,652.95
14.5"-16"

Graybar Long Arm $24.64 0 $24.64 307| $7,564.48
24" Long

Arm $45.11 0 $45.11 151| $6,811.61

$14,376.09
14.5"-16"

Irby Long Arm [No Bid $0.00
24" Long

Arm No bid $0.00
14.5"-16"

Newman Signs Long Arm [No Bid $0.00
24" Long

Arm No Bid $0.00

$0.00
14.5"-16"

Vulcan Inc. Long Arm 12.75 0.5 13.3875 307 $4,109.96
24" Long

Arm $20.30 0.5 21.3150 151| $3,218.57

$7,328.53




