BID TAB FOR BID #5698

ltem
Agualung
Drysuit

Aqualung
Dry
Gloves

Agualung
thermal
Gloves X-
Large

Agualung
thermal
Gloves
Large

Fins

Kevlar
Gloves
Large

Diver's

Supply Inc

Amount

$2,350.00

$ 59.95

S 19.95

S 19.95

S 14495

S  49.95

each

pair

pair

pair

pair

pair

Alternate
Item

1st; F4 &
FS-15

Armortex
3mm

Gulf Coast
Divers

Alternate
Amount Item

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Dive Pros

Amount

$2,025.00

S 40.00

S 20.00

S 20.00

S 180.00

$3,134.00

S 54.00

Dive Rescue
International

Alternate Alternate
Iltem Amount Item
$1,830.00
S 52.75
S 15.00
S 15.00
xt fins -
S 145.00 ES510-LG
Diving
Unlimited
Internation
al
111920sig
GL
S 35.70 1650106L

House of
SCUBA

Amount

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

§ 135.53

S  34.99

Alternate
Item



Kevlar
Gloves X-
Large

Shorty/far
mer john

Agualung
Boot

S  49.95 pair
S 339.90 set
S 79.95 pair

Armortex
3mm

NeoSport
3675MF
&
3570MV

No Bid

No Bid

$

89.50

S 54.00
S 343.16
$ 78.00

XS Scuba
MS 760-L

S 3570
No Bid
S  40.00

GL
1650106X
L

S 3499
S 245.96
S 6255

Tilos
S6026BK
Standard
Step-in
Titanium



San Diego Ocen
Enterprises

Alternate
Amount Item

$1,775.00

$  27.00

S 22.00

S 22.00

$ 150.00

$ 37.00



S 33.00

S 305.00

$ 59.00
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