
BID TAB FOR BID #5699

 Diver's 
Supply Inc 

 Gulf Coast 
Divers  Dive Pros 

 Dive 
Rescue 
Internation
al 

 House of 
SCUBA 

Item  Amount 
Alternate 
Item  Amount 

Alternate 
Item  Amount 

Alternate 
Item  Amount 

Alternate 
Item  Amount 

Alternate 
Item

Dive 
Computer  $ 1,159.00  $    975.00 

(discontin
ued - may 
find 
some)  $    975.00 

Shearwat
er Perdix 
2 TI  $    750.00 

Shearwat
er Perdix 
2 TI; 
13301  $    843.75 

new 
version

Transmitt
er  $    425.00  $    388.00  $    270.00 Swift  $    299.00 

Shearwat
er Swift; 
17001  $    324.00 

new 
version

 $ 1,584.00  $ 1,363.00  $ 1,245.00  $ 1,049.00  $ 1,167.75 

Clevis  $    112.50  No Bid  $    109.45  $       89.55 

Ronstan 
& Dive 
rescue 
6711B  $       99.50 

Regulator  $    889.00  $    899.00  $    795.00  $    439.00 

Apeks 
RG12211
2/RG1221
11  $    567.11 

Light 
Monkey  $ 1,040.00  No Bid  $    732.00  No Bid  $    894.38 



Mask  $    835.00  $    899.00  $    778.95  $    499.00 

OTS GRD-
BB-1 
(920001-
001)  $    788.87 

6802  $    454.00  $    439.00 

(No 
Guarante
e it is 
compatibl
e)  $    399.00  $    243.31 

Dive 
Rescue 
6802Y  $    428.03 

6810  $ 1,550.00 Nohoses  $ 1,555.00 No hoses  $ 4,637.00 
unit 
w/hoses  $ 1,275.00 

OTS MK7 
900104-
000  $ 4,818.47 

 $ 2,325.00 hose
 $ 3,600.00 

BCD  $    789.00  No Bid  $    638.00  $    405.00 
Apeks 
Black Ice  $    603.34 Exotec

 $    723.00 
APEKS 
EXOTEC

 
Discontinue
d? 

Raptor 
Shears  $    139.95  No Bid  $       96.50  $       89.00  $       47.50 

High VIZ 
line cutter  No Bid  $       35.00  $       26.00 EEZYCUT  $       37.25 EEZYCUT  $       20.25 

DRI Chest 
Harness  $       52.95  No Bid  $       49.60  $       40.59 

Dive 
Rescue 
6157  $       45.10 
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