BID TAB FOR BID #5700

Diver's Gulf Coast Dive Rescue House of Bay Tech
Supply Inc Divers Dive Pros International SCUBA Industries
Alternate
Item Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount Item
2200 Ib Subvalve
bag $1,009.00 $1,100.00 S 933.00 S 815.00 [EFB2000 No Bid S 871.37
1100 Ib Subvalve
bag S 579.00 S 675.00 S 626.00 S 525.00 |EFB1000 No Bid S 534.04
550 1b Subvalve
bag S 439.00 S 475.00 S 427.00 S 345.00 (EFB500 No Bid S 376.83
Dive
Rescue Intl
Manifold S 799.95 $1,225.00 S 795.00 S 715.00 (6377 No Bid S 759.70
6188 air
line Dive
connectio Rescue Intl
n No Bid No Bid S 165.00 S 125.00 [61880-DRI No Bid
41b XS Scuba
weight S 19.25( [ $ 23.00( | S 14.80 (M4 S 19.00 S 18.20 S 14.25
2 pound XS Scuba
weight S 9.59 S 11.50 S 7.50 (M2 S 9.50 S 9.10 S 14.25
XS Scuba
HP100 +
tank S 390.00 S 425.00 S 349.50 [VA200-34N
S 185.00 | | Shipping
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