BID TABULATION FOR BID #5752

MULTI COLORED BANNERS
ARO DAYS 7 7 10 7 7 7 5
*OUTSIDE 5 MILE
POLICE
JURSIDICTION
Custom
VENDOR Rampant Media Calagaz Printin AGAS MFG Inc Gwins Printin s apitol
g B ' & Source One Design Signworks, Reproductions,
Legal Copy The Plot Shop Image 360 Display, Inc LLC inc
1 8' x3' Banner $ 23.750 | | § 81.00 66.10 | | $ 85.78 | | $ 64.95 || 51.00 || $ 95.00 || $ 119.75 || § 48.00 | | S 167.05
2 8'x8' Banner s 63.75 1§ 215.68 140.10 | | $ 215.90 | [ § 156.20: || $ 132.00 || 5 25000 |15 288005 12800]]8 297.50
3 5'x5' Banner s 24.75 [ | & 84.50 67.50 | | 100.25 | | § 68.49 || $ 53.00 || $ 98.00 || § 123.90 || & 50.00 | | $ 165.50
TOTAL
$ 11225 (| $ 38118 || $ 273.70 || $ 401.93 | | 8 289.64 || § 236.00 || $ 443.00 || $ 53165 || $ 22600 $ 630.05
4 11" x 17" Poster NO BID 5 41.24 | |NO BID NO BID $ 0.53 || 5 037 |8 2.00 ||n/a $ 3.00 | | NOBID
5 24" x 36" Glossy Poster NO BID 5 22.00 [ |[NO BID NO BID s 12.95 || & 19.00 || 5 24.00 ||n/a B 12.00 | | NOBID
TOTAL
S - $ 63.24 | [NO BID of|$ 13.48 || $ 19.37 |1 $ 26,00 ||NO BID $ 15.00 | | NO BID
6 4"x6" Postcard NO BID 0.2598| |NO BID NO BID B 0.2375 || $ 0.20 |5 0.30 [|n/a 5 0.25 | | NOBID




