BID TABULATION

CITY OF MOBILE BID NO.: 5905
AIR MASKS DATE: 10/29/2024
FIRE
Bid Date: 08/08/2024 AIRGAS SUNBELT FIRE 'LADD SUPPLY CO INC.
BID QUANTITIES
TEM DESCRIPTION av. |unir|  BID TOTAL UNIT BID BID UNIT BID TOTAL

MSA G1 SCBA 1 |EACH|S$ 840250 (S 840250 [EACH | $ 9,007.00|$ 9,097.00 [EACH |$ 11,275.00 % 11,275.00

G1 FACE PIECE 1 EACH| S  405.00 | $ 405.00 |EACH S  418.00| S 418.00 |[EACH. | S 546.00 | S 546.00

G1 CYLINDER 1 |EACH|$ 1,259.90 [$ 1,259.90 |[EACH [$ 1,365.00 | $ 1,365.00 |[EACH |S$ 1,692.00|% 1,692.00

TOTAL 10,067.40 | 10,067.40 10,880.00 | 10,880.00 13,513.00 13,513.00
AMERICAN DIVING WESCO GAS &
NAFECO SUPPLY WELDING SUPPLY RITZ SAFETY
UNIT BID |UNIT BID UNIT BID UNIT BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




