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1329

BAGS TRASH, 15 X 9 X 32, WHITE, 0.35 
MIL, 16 GALLON, 500 BAGS PER CASE.  
(BOARDWALK BWK2432EXH, 500/CS.   
PRO-MT331XW-CS) OR EQUAL TO. $19.50 CASE

NORAMCO 
RST2432.45XLW

500/CS 
CALCULATED     

.039/BG $34.58 CS

NORRST2432XLW - LINER, 24X 32, 12-16 
GAL, WHITE, 0.35, CORELESS, STAR, 
1000/CS; SOLD 1000/CS - $34.58/CS

SOLD 1000/CS - $34.58/CS 
CALCULATED .034/BG

2781

DEGREACHSER BETCO ULTRA 2000 #1 
3604.   (SPARTAN SPN203804 4/1 
GAL/CS) OR EQUAL TO. $31.10 CASE

KEMPER 
DYNOMITE 4-1GAL/CS $38.46 CS

SFPN203804 - BH-38 - BUTYL CLEANER. 
INDUSTRIAL STRENGTH, BUTYL - BASED 
CLEANER/DEGREACHSER.  

ECONOMICALLY HANDLES A VARIETY 
OF CLEANING JOBS. 

5068

BUFFING PADS, PADS BUFFING, 20" RED.   
(BOARDWALK BWK4020RED , 5/CS) OR 
EQUAL TO.   $16.87 CASE 17.56$      5/CS

BWK4020RED - PAD, FLOOR, BUFFING, 
20", RD

5076

BUFFING PADS, PADS 
BUFFING/POLISHING, 17", NATURAL 
HAIR, JACKAROO BRAND.   (BOARDWALK 
BWK4017NAT, 5/CASE) OR EQUAL TO.    $18.67 CASE 14.60$      5/CS BWK04017NAT - PAD, FLR, C-17" NT HAIR

5142 COFFEE STIRRER. BWKSTRU 525B10 $10.34 CASE
CRYSTALWARE 

5BSS101000 10/1000/CASE 1.52$        
1/1000/PAC
K COFFEE STIRRER.  BWKSTRU525B10

BWKSTRU525B10 - STRAW, STIR, JMB, 
5.25IN, BK 1000/PK 10/CT

5231

TRASH BAGS, 12-16 GALLON 24 X 32 
PB2432LR 500 P/CASE.  (BWK2432EXH)  
OR EQUAL TO. $19.50 CASE

NORAMCO 
RST2432.45XLW 500/CS 34.58$      1000/CS

NORRST2432XLW - LINER, 24X 32, 12-16 
GAL, WHITE, 0.35, CORELESS, STAR, 
1000/CS; SOLD 1000/CS - $34.58/CS SOLD 1000/CS - $34.58/CS

5328

JANITOR CART,  CART UTILITY, VINYL, 
CAPACITY 500 LBS. SIZE 25 7/8 X 45 1/4, 
BEIGE, RUBBERMAID 4520-88 $234.02 EACH 125.67$    EACH

BWKJCARTGRA - CART, JNTR, W/ZP YL BG, 
GY

6947

HAND SANITIZER,  CLEANER  SANITIZER, 
HAND, WATERLESS, 4 OZ PLASTIC 
BOTTLE, HILL MANUFACTURING "SKIN 
SANITIZER", #3178-24, (24 BOTTLES/CASE 
). $58.46 CASE GOJO 965124 24/CS 51.72$      CASE

GOJ965124 - SANITIZER, HAND PUREL 
4OZ., 24/4OZ.

6990

SOAP, DISHWASHING LIQUID, JOY, 
PROFESSIONAL, 38 OZ. SIZE, P & G 45114, 
OR DAWN 45112 8/38 OZ. CASE **NO 
SUBS** $48.34 CASE 41.29$      CASE

JOY 43606CT - CLEANER, DSHWSH, JOY, 
8/38 OZ. 

6991

DEODERANT, URINAL BLOCKS,   
DEODORANT BLOCKS, PLAIN (NO WIRE).  
(BOARDWALK BWKU03CT, 12/CASE) OR 
EQUAL TO. $10.63 CASE

FRESH 
PRODUCTS 3PB-

F-20-BX 12/CS 7.69$        12/CS BWKU03CT - BLOCK, 3 OZ URINAL

6992

LAVA SOAP BARS,  SOAP LAVA HAND 
SOAP 48 / 4OZ, BARS / CASE. WD 
40/LAVA  WSF10383. $74.32 CASE 67.13$      CASE

WDF10383 - CLEANER; HAND; BAR; LAVA; 
4OZ.

6993
MOPS  WET, 18 OZ., #2289 BWK116C - 
OR EQUAL TO. $39.90 CASE ABCOCD50016

6/CASE 
CALCULATED 

6.65/MOP 4.14$        EACH

CD - 50016 - ABCO COTTON DECK MOP 
#16 WOOD HANDLE W/CLEAR COATING 
12/CS

6994

MOPS 32 OZ., WET MOP M-32 #2063.  
PACKAGES OF 6 MOPS.   (BOARDWALK 
BWK132C)   (ABCO CD50032) OR EQUAL 
TO. $40.73 CASE 7.26$        EACH

CD - 50032 - ABCO COTTON DECK MOP 
#32 WOOD HANDLE W/CLEAR COATING 
6/CS 7.26/MOP = 43.56/CS

6995
60" CLIP-ON DUST MOP HANDLE, WOOD, 
12/CS $76.20 CASE 11.30$      EACH

BWK1460 - HANDLE, DSTMP, CLP, 
15/16X60

NO BID

21950

BAY PAPER
151000

OSI
298761

IMPERIAL DADE
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6996

DUST MOP HEADS,  MOP HEADS ONLY 
FOR DUST MOPS, 36"X5",   O'DELL 
M365CH, EACH.  OR EQUAL TO. $12.42 EACH 6.36$        EACH

DD-91536W - ABCO WHITE DISPOSABLE 
DUST MOP 5" X 36" 12/CS

6999

BOTTLE SPRAY WITH TRIGGER SPRAYER,  
QUART SIZE PLASTIC BOTTLE.   
BOARDWALK BWK00032/BWK58109 
PAIR.  OR EQUAL TO. $1.65 PAIR 1.44$        PAIR

OSIBTLTRIG32 - QT BTL (BWK00032) & 
TRIGGER (BWK58109); CONSISTS OF 
BOARDWALK 32 OZ BOTTLE AND 
BOARDWALK TRIGGER SPRAY

7001

CLEANER, BOWL, 12 QT/CS .  STATE 
MANUFACTURER AND PACKAGING.   
(BETCO REST STOP 07012-00, 12 
QT/CASE.   SPN711603) OR EQUAL TO. $26.80 CASE

NCL BATHROOM 
PLUS 12QT/CS 27.79$      CASE

SPN711603 - NABC - NON ACID 
DISINFECTANT BATHROOM CLEANER. 
READY-TO-USE. 

KILLS HBV AND HCV ON INANIMATE 
SURFACES. EPA REG. NO. 5741-18. 
12/32 OZ./CS INCLUDES MOP

7003

COMET CLEACHNER,  CLEACHNSER 
COMET, 24-21 OZ PER CASE.   COMET 
P&G PGC32987CT, 24/21 OZ/CASE. $43.28 CASE 41.63$      CASE PGC32987CT - 24/21 OZ.

7004

BOWL BLOCK, DEODORANT BLOCK 
W/HANGER LR, 42R OR EQUAL, 4 1/2 OZ. 
CUP.  (BOARDWALK BWKB04BX 12/CS) 
OR EQUAL TO. $15.89 CASE 12.50$      CASE

BWKB04BX - SANITARY, 4OZ. BOWL 
BLOCK/ DZ.

7005

CLEANER, 409, SPRAY BOTTLES, 12-32 OZ. 
PER CASE, 12 SPRAYERS PER CASE,  **NO 
SUBSTITUTE**  $44.00 CASE 46.14$      CASE

CLO35306CT - CLEANER, 409 FORMULA, 32 
OZ. - 12/32OZ.

7006

409 CLEANER, CLEANER REFILL FOR 409, 4
1 GALLON PER CASE.  **NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS** $44.73 CASE 46.44$      CASE

CLO35300CT - CLEANER, FORMULA 409- 1 
GAL (4-128OZ )

7008

PINE OIL, 12-28 OZ PER CASE.  (CLOROX 
CLO60148CT, 12/14 OZ/CASE) OR EQUAL 
TO. $38.72 CASE 30.73$      

CLO60148CT - CLEANER, PINE 14/12,YL, 
12/28 OZ.

7009
PINE OIL ( AMONO PINE )  4-1 GAL / 
CASE. BWK4734 OR EQUAL TO. $30.83 CASE

KROWN BAY 
PINE 4-1GAL/CS 25.52$      CASE

01763-C4002 - KOR CHEM PINE CLEANER 
MULTI-PURPOSE CLEANER & DEODORIZER 
CONCENTRATED W/PINE OIL 4/1 GAL KOR CHEM PINE CLEANER

7012
PADS SOS, 12-15/CS.     CLOROX 
CLO88320CT, 180/CASE.  OR EQUAL TO. $56.78 CASE 46.58$      CASE AMY23318 - STEEL, WOOL, SP PD, 12-18PK

7015
SOAP LAUNDRY, TIDE DETERGENT, P&G 2-
143 OZ/CT, PGC85006CT. $65.08 CASE 58.85$      CASE

PGC16673CT - DETERGENT, TDEWD, HE, 
2/129OZ.

7016

HAND SOAP, KUTOL, PURE POWDER 10-
15 LBS/CASE. (DIAL DIA2561 CT, 
10/5LB/CASE.) OR EQUAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7017

HAND SOAP (4 - 1 GALLON),  ANTISEPTIC, 
4-1 GAL PER CASE.  (BOARDWALK 
BWK410CT, 4/1 GAL/CASE) OR EQUAL 
TO. $25.71 CASE 24.52$      CASE

BWK410CT - SOAP, LOTION, GAL, 4/CT, 4/1 
GAL

7021

DISINFECTANT SPRAY, LYSOL 12-18 OZ 
PER CASE.  (SPN607600, 12/32 OZ/CASE),  
(CHASE 433-4104 12/20 0Z/CASE)   OR 
EQUAL TO. $39.23 CASE 46.67$      CASE

5157 - CHASE PRODUCTS AEROSOL 
QUATERNARY DISINFECTANT SPRAY 
12/16.5OZ

7024

INSECTICIDES  WASP + HORNET SKIDDO 
12-18 OZ PER CASE.       (SPARTAN 
SPN682000, 12/20 OZ/CS)  (CHASE 433-
4108 12/20 OZ/CASE)   OR EQUAL TO. $73.12 CASE 438-5108

12/CS 15OZ 
(6.093/CAN 
0.406/OZ) 55.56$      CASE

438-5102 - CHASE PRODUCTS AEROSOL 
FLYING INSECT KILLER 12/18OZ. (4.63/CAN 0.257/OZ)

7028

CLEANER  SHIMMER STAINLESS STEEL 
CLEANER,  (BOARDWALK BWK 347 ACT 12
18 OZ/CS) OR EQUAL TO. $49.70 CASE 42.23$      CASE BWK347ACT - POLISH, STAINLESS, STEEL
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7033

DUST MOP TREATMENT,  MOP, DUST 
MOP TREATMENT 12-16 OZ / CASE.   
(CHASE 5152, 12/20 OZ/CS) OR EQUAL 
TO.  $45.10 CASE

CHASE DUST & 
MORE 438-5157 12/CS 50.16$      CASE

SPN609900 - DUST MOP/DUST CLOTH 
TREACHTMENT - READY-TO-USE FORMULA 
- 12/20Z CANS., NET 16OZ.

USED TO PICK UP DUST, LINT AND SOIL, 
REDUCING THE WEACHR AND 
ABRASION ON FLOOR FINISHES FROM 
SAND AND SOIL, AND PROLONGING 
THE FLOOR FINISH LIFE. 

7034

FLOOR SWEEP, OIL ABSORBENT, 
MAXIMUM SACK WEIGHT 40 LB. OIL DRI 
BRAND OR EQUAL. NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.41$        BAG

A40G - BALCONES #40 BAG ABSORB-N-DRY 
OIL DRY *MUST BUY FULL PALLET OF 50 
BAGS* 1/BG.

7038

HOUSE HOLD BROOMS,  BROOM 
NATURAL CORN JANITOR BROOM #26, 5 
STITCH, 12" SWEEP FACE. (BWKBR10002) 
OR EQUAL TO. $85.70 CASE 7.76$        EACH

BWKBR10002 - BROOM, MIX, WRHS, LAQ 
HND, 6

7039

BROOM #B28 JANITORIAL, #2033.  
DOZEN.  (O'DELL B10001/ BWKBR10002 
DOZEN) OR EQUAL TO. $85.70 CASE 7.76$        EACH

BWKBR10002 - BROOM, MIX, WRHS, LAQ 
HND, 6

7040

BOWL BRUSH, BRUSH #4533 TOILET 
BOWL.  EACH. ( BOARDWALK BWK00160, 
EACH.   CWZ24418471.) OR EQUAL TO. $1.07 EACH 1.13$        EACH

BWK00160 - MOP, BOWL, 12" HND, 25/CT, 
WH; SOLD 25/CS ($28.25/CS)

7042
MOP  24 OZ. RAYON MOP HEAD LAY FLAT 
#2407 $6.55 EACH 4.87$        EACH

BWKCM22024 - MOP, CTN, 24OZ. SCRW 
TYP, 12

7043

MOP 32 OZ. RAYON MOP HEAD LAY FLAT 
#2408.  (BOARDWALK BWK732R) OR 
EQUAL TO. $0.00 EACH 9.30$        EACH BWK732R - MOP, HD, LF, RYN, 32 OZ.

7044
MOP TOILET BOWL.   BOARDWALK 
BWK00160, EACH. OR EQUAL TO. $1.15 EACH 1.13$        EACH

BWK00160 - MOP, BOWL, 12" HND, 25/CT, 
WH; SOLD 25/CS ($28.25/CS)

7047
DUST PAN, #2005, RUBBERMAID.   
IMPACT IMP4212, EACH.  OR EQUAL TO. $9.95 EACH 2.83$        EACH GJO02406 - DUSTPAN; PLASTIC; HD; 12"

7048

DUST PAN WITH HANDLE,  DUST PAN, 
LOBBY, #2007, RUBBERMAID.   (IMPACT 
IMP2600 EACH) OR EQUAL TO. $9.70 EACH ABCO 361410 11.32$      EACH

PP-LDPBK - PERFORMANCE PLUS LOBBY 
DUST PAN W/36" METAL HANDLE BLACK 

7050

POLISH, FURNITURE, JOHNSON LEMON 
SHINE-UP, 12-16 OZ PER CASE.  (SPARTAN 
SPN611000, 12/20 OZ/CS.  CHASE 433-
4109) OR EQUAL TO. $51.49 CASE CHP5136 12/CS 39.95$      CASE BWK346ACT - POLISH, FURNITURE, LEMON

7053

TRASH CAN, 44 GALLON, NO LID, NO 
CASTERS, DESIGNED FOR RUBBERMAID 
CASTERS, GRAY COLOR RUBBERMAID 
#2643 OR CONTINENTAL #4444.   
(BOARDWALK BWK44GLWRGRA, EACH) 
OR EQUAL TO.    $39.44 EACH 29.64$      EACH

BWK44GLWRGRA - RECEPTACLE, WASTE, 
RND, GY

7066

SPONGES 2" X 6" (APPROX.) 24/2.   
(BOARDWALK BWKCS2, 24/CASE.) OR 
EQUAL TO. $25.09 CASE 14.68$      CASE BWK174 - SPONGE, MED DTY, SCRUB, GN

7067
CLEANSER AJAX, 24-21 OZ. CANS /CASE.  
CLOROX CPC14278CT. $32.63 CASE 32.31$      CASE

CPC14278CT - CLEANER, AJAX, OXGBLCH, 
21 OZ., 24/21 OZ.
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7068

DISINFECTANT, BALL-PHENE SPRAY,  
DISINFECTANT SPARTAN STERI-PHENE  12-
15 OZ. PER CS.     (SPARTAN SPN608100, 
12/20 OZ/CASE),   (CHASE 433-4104) OR 
EQUAL TO. $39.23 CASE 46.67$      CASE

5157 - CHASE PRODUCTS AEROSOL 
QUATERNARY DISINFECTANT SPRAY 
12/16.5OZ

7085
CLEANER, FLOOR, HARDWOOD, BONA 
CLEANER REFILL **NO SUBS** $18.24 GALLON

BNAWM700018
175 17.31$      EACH

BNAWM700018174 - CLEANER, HARDWD 
REFIL

7087

DISINFECTANT LYSOL II FRESH SCENT 
SPRAY (12/18 OZ./CS).   (CHASE 4334104, 
12/20 OZ/CASE) OR EQUAL TO. $39.23 CASE 46.67$      CASE

5157 - CHASE PRODUCTS AEROSOL 
QUATERNARY DISINFECTANT SPRAY 
12/16.5OZ

7096

CLEANER OVEN, MR. MUSCLE, AEROSOL 
(6-19 OZ/CS) NO SUBSTITUTE.  VENDOR 
TO PROVIDE DIVERSY DVOCCBD991206, 
6/19 OZ/CASE. $35.49 CASE 32.78$      CASE

DVOCBD991206 - CLEANER, BREACK UP, 
OVEN

7103
MOP HEAD, 24 OZ. COTTON, LAY FLAT, 
SCREW ON. $4.90 EACH 4.78$        EACH

BWKCM22024 - MOP, CTN, 24 OZ., 
SCRWTYP,12

7104

MOPHEAD HANDLE, FOR LAY FLAT MOP.   
ABCO 60" SCREW ON HANDLE, EACH.  OR 
EQUAL TO. $3.97 EACH 6.72$        EACH BWK834 - HANDLE, MOP, LIEFLAT, SCREW

7112

SOAP, KLEENEX LIQUID HAND SOAP WITH 
MOISTURIZERS (91552), PINK, FLORAL 
SCENT, 1.0L, 6 BOTTLES / CASE 1000 ML. 
CAPACITY, PINK FOAM.  VENDOR TO 
PROVIDE KIMBERLY CLARK KCC91552CT, 
6/1000 ML/CASE.  $63.43 CASE 55.88$      CASE

KCC91552CT - SOAP, FOAM, MOIST, LTFL, 
6/CT

7115

BUCKET MOP, 35 QUART, COMBO 
BUCKET AND WRINGER, YELLOW, 3" 
CASTERS RUBBERMAID FG757788YEL, 
(CONTINENTAL 335-312YW), (IMPACT 
IMP7Y26363Y), OR EQUAL. $57.37 each 92.18$      EACH

IMP7Y26363Y - COMBO SET, 
WRNGR/BCKT

7116

CLEACHNSER SPIC + SPAN, 12-27 OZ PER 
CASE,  POWDERED CLEANSER.    VENDOR 
TO PROVIDE P&G PGC31973CT, 12/27 
OZ/ CASE. $147.83 CASE 115.53$    CASE

PGC31973CT - CLEANER, SPC/SPN, PWDR, 
27 OZ. - 12/27CT.

7118

WAX, FLOOR, JOHNSON COMPLETE OR 
EQUAL, 5 GALLON PAIL.   (SPARTAN 
SPN404505, 5/GAL/CS) OR EQUAL TO.  $79.23 CASE

NCL ONE COAT 
25 59.74$      CASE/PAIL

SPN544504 - SUNNY SIDE - EXTREMELY 
HIGH GLOSS NON-BUFF FINISH THAT 
LEVELS SMOOTHLY TO HIGHLIGHT 
FLOORS. 5 GAL/PAILS

USED TO HIGHLIGHT FLOORS WITH THE 
ULTIMATE SHINE.  CONTAINS NO 
INTENTIONALLY ADDED PFAS.

7131

BUCKET MOP, 44 QUART, COMBO PACK 
WITH WRINGER, BUCKET OT HAVE 3" 
WHEELS, WRINGER TO BE DOWNWARD 
PRESS TYPE, CONSIST OF RUBBERMAID 
BUCKET #6118-88 AND WRINGER #612, 
RUBBERMAID COMBO PACK #6134. 
(RUBBERMAID 757688, EACH) OR EQUAL $247.63 EACH RCP757688YEL 249.91$    EACH

RCPFG757688YEL - BUCKET, DP WRN, 
44QWB2, YL

7133

DISPENSER FOR SCOTT #181 MULTIFOLD 
PAPER TOWELS, PLASTIC DISPENSER, 
SCOTT #998 (SAN JAMAR SJMT1790TBK) 
OR EQUAL. $34.48 EACH 32.15$      EACH

SJMTI790TBK - DISPENSER, TWL, ULTRA, 
BK

7140
TRASH  CAN, 32 GALLON, RUBBERMAID 
#FG2632. BWK32GLWRGRA $25.38 EACH 24.42$      EACH

BWK32GLWRGRA - WASTEBASKET, 32 
GAL, GY
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7163

TRASH CAN, LID, DOME TOP WITH  
SWING DOOR, TO FIT RUBBERMAID  44 
GALLON CONTAINERS { CITY 
COMMODITY #16213} GRAY IN COLOR , 
THIS LID WILL ALSO FIT 55 GALLON 
DRUMS,  RUBBERMAID #2647.     
VENDOR TO PROVIDE RUBR MAID  
RCP264788GRA, EACH. $110.70 EACH 106.23$    EACH

RCP264788GRA - CONTAINER, DOME TP 
F/44GY

7168

SANITARY NAPKIN DISPOSAL BAGS STATE 
MFG + PACKAGING PER CASE.  
ROCHESTER MIDLAND 25025088, 
500/CASE., HOSPECO HS6141 $28.86 CASE 22.68$      EACH HOS6141 - LINER, FEM HYGIENE, BN

7173

CLEANER WINDOW, REFILL (GLASS  PLUS 
OR WINDEX) 4-1 GALLON/CASE, **NO 
SUBSTITUTE** (SC JOHNSON SJN696503, 
4/1 GAL/CASE). $40.93 CASE 38.53$      CASE

SJN696503 - CLEANER, WINDEX, 4/1 
GAL/CASE

7177

DISINFECTANT KROWN DUAL BOWL 
CLEACHNER (NABC BATHROOM 
CLEACHNER -REST STOP),   CLEACHNER 
BOWL, NON-ACID, BETCO 07912, 12-32 
OZ/CASE.   (SPARTAN SPN711603, 12/32 
OZ/CASE) OR EQUAL TO. $26.80 CASE

NCL BATHROOM 
PLUS 12/CS 27.29$      CASE

SPN711603 - NABC - NON ACID 
DISINFECTANT BATHROOM CLEANER. 
READY-TO-USE. 

KILLS HBV AND HCV ON INANIMATE 
SURFACES.  EPA REG. NO 5741-18. 
12/32 OZ./CS INCLUDES MOP

7179

SOAP DIAL LIQUID HAND, 7.5 OZ, PUMP 
BOTTLE, 12-7.5 OZ PER CASE DIAL 
#84014.      VENDOR TO PROVIDE DIAL 
84014CT, 12/7.5 OZ/CASE. $32.67 CASE 32.13$      CASE

DIA84014CT - SOAP, LIQD DIAL GLD, 
12/7.5OZ. /CT

7194

SQUEEGEE FLOOR 18" WITH HANDLE.    
(UNGER OSIFLRSQG18, EACH), 
OSIFLRSQG18 (SQUEEGEE - UNGMW450) 
(HANDLE (UNGAL14T0) OR EQUAL TO. $38.43 EACH 29.51$      EACH

OSIFLRSQG18 - SQUEEGEE, 18" 
(UNGMW450) & HANDLE (UNGAL14T0); 
DUAL ITEM (UNGMW450/UNGAL140) - 
BID PRICE $23.54 COMBINED

7198
DISPENSER ROLL TOWEL FLIP DOWN 
SMOKE COVER SCOTT #9746. $70.51 EACH 57.84$      EACH

KCC09746 - DISPENSER, PAPER TOWEL, 
SKE

7211

FLOOR STRIPPER,  STRIPPER FLOOR, 
BETCO EXTREME  ULTRA #19404.  
(SPARTAN 008404, 4/1/GAL/CS) OR 
EQUAL TO.   $61.03 CASE

NCL BARE 
BONES 4/1GAL 59.51$      CASE

SPN008404 - SHINELINE EMULSIFIER PLUS - 
FINISH AND WAX STRIPPER.  4/1 GAL.

QUICKLY REMOVES HEACHVY BUILD-
UPS AND BURNISHED FLOOR FINISH.  
USE WITH HOT OR COLD WATER.  
LIGHTLY FRAGRANCED

7212

TOILET SEACHT COVER DISPENSERS,   
DISPENSER TOILET SEACHT COVER, 
UNIVERSAL TYPE, SCOTT/ KIMBERLY-
CLARK  TOILET SEACHT DISPENSER 
#09506  **{ The city purchases 
Scott/Kimberly-clark #7410 toilet sEACHt 
covers}*.    VENDOR TO PROVIDE 
BOARDWALK BWKKD100, EACH.   $21.02 EACH 11.77$      EACH

BWKKD100 - DISPENSER, TOILETS CVR, 
WH; SOLD 2/BOX ($23.54/BX)

7214

DUST MOP FRAME/WITH HANDLE,  DUST 
MOP FRAME WITH HANDLE, FRAME SIZE 
5 X 36.    (BOARDWALK BWK1436,  EACH) 
OR EQUAL TO. $10.79 EACH 5.95$        EACH BWK1436 - FRAME, DUSTMP, 36X5, MTL

7218

DEODORIZER GENERAL PURPOSE, 
DEODORANT CONCENTRATE, 4/1 GAL/CS. 
SPARTAN AIRLIFT #302204  **NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS** $72.45 CASE NCL ETERNITY 89.28$      CASE

SPN302204 - AIRLIFT FRESH SCENT- 
GENERAL PURP0OSE DEODORANT 
CONCENTRATE.  4/1 GAL CS FRESH SCENT FRAGRANCE
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7239
TIME MIST MODEL 32-1111 TM 
DISPENSER $24.65 EACH R42 DISPENSER 20.62$      EACH TMS1047717 - DISPENSER, TIMMST, WH

7252
BLEACH, CLOROX, 6-96 OZ PER CASE.  
**NO SUBSTITUTE** NO BID NO BID NO BID

CAN'T FIND 96OZ 
BOTTLES 20.49$      CASE

CLO30966CT - DISINFECTRANT, BLEACH, 
3/121 OZ.

7253

BLEACH GENERIC, 6-96 OZ PER CASE 
GALLON/CS, STATE MANUFACTURER + 
STOCK #.  (KIK KIK11006755042 6/1 
GAL/CS), PUREBRIGHT BLEACH, OR 
EQUAL TO. $17.50 CASE

6 GALLONS PER 
CASE 16.97$      CASE

KIK11006755042 - CLEANER, BLEACH, REG, 
6/1 GAL 6 GALLONS PER CASE

9369

MILDEW REMOVER, TILEX,12EACH. 16OZ 
SPRAY BOTTLES /CASE.    (SPARTAN 
SPN711003, 12/16 OZ/CASE) OR EQUAL 
TO.  $50.83 CASE NCL TRIGGER 12/CS 44.99$      CASE

SPN711003 - RJ8 - TILE & GROUT 
REJUVENATOR.  FIGHTS MOLD AND 
MILDEW STAINS AND SOAP SCUM ON A 
VARIETY OF SURFACES.  

12/32 OZ. CASE - THE SPN ITEM IS 32 
OZ (NOT 16 OZ AS IN YOUR 
DESCRIPTION)

9632

TOWELS, PAPER, MULTI-FOLD, 9x9, 
SCOTT 180 (01804), (SOFIDEL 410164 
4000/CASE), OR EQUAL. $21.24 CASE 19.28$      CASE

GEN1508 - TOWEL, M-FOLD, 9.25X9.5, NT, 
12/334/CT

9633

TOWELS, PAPER, HARD ROLL 8" X 800' 
BROWN, 2" CORE, 6 ROLLS/CASE 
KC32848.  6/CASE.   MORCON MORR6800 
6 ROLLS/CASE.  OR EQUAL TO. $28.87 CASE MARCAL NP6800 6/CS 22.83$      CASE

MORR6800 - TOWEL, HRDWND KFT, 
8X800, (6/800/CT)

9634

CUPS STYROFOAM, 6 OZ. (FOR COFFEE)  
(NT6, W6 DART OR EQUAL), 1000/CS.     
VENDOR TO PROVIDE DART DCC6J6, 
1000/CS.  $25.36 CASE 22.73$      CASE

DCC6J6 - CUP, 6OZ., FOAM, 1M/CTN,WHT - 
1000/CT

9635

CONE CUPS,  CUPS WATER, CONE (LILY 4 
1/2 LR, 42R OR EQUAL) 4 1/2 OZ. CUP.    
(KONIE KC145KR, 5000/CS) OR EQUAL TO. $60.94 CASE 77.31$      CASE

SCC4BRCT - CUP, CONICAL, RLD RIM, 4OZ. - 
5000CT

9636

TOWELS, PAPER, BROWN ROLL, CORE 
SIZE 1.5",  8" X 800' SCOTT #04142 OR 
EQUAL.  VENDOR TO PROVIDE MORCON 
MORR6800, 6 ROLLS/CASE. $28.87 CASE MARCAL NP6800 6/CS 22.83$      CASE

MORR6800 - TOWEL, HRDWND KFT, 
8X800, (6/800/CT)

9637

TOWELS, PAPER, C-FOLD 10.125" X 
13.15", 1 PLY, 2400 TOWELS/CASE, KC 
01510, NO SUBS. $22.95 CASE 49.89$      CASE

KCC01510 - TOWEL, SCOTT, C-FLD PPR, 
WE; BAY PAPER@ $25.94/CT (05/24), 
12/200/CT 12/200 CT

9638

TOWELS SHOP, WYPALL, BLUE, KIMBERLY 
CLARK 05776, 12-1/2" X 12", 56 
SHEETS/PKG, 12PKG/CASE.     VENDOR TO 
PROVIDE BERK DRC3500B-4, 902/CASE. $87.97 CASE 50.31$      CASE

BWKV030QPW - WIPES, DRC, 12X13, QF, 
WH - 1080/CT

9640

TOILET PAPER - SMALL ROLL / 100PER,   
PAPER TOILET, 1 PLY, KC25626, GEN218, 
PACIFIC BLUE 1458001/14500, OR EQUAL 
TO.  $53.64 CASE

GEN218 
96/1000SHT 96/1000SHEET 43.96$      CASE

BWK6145 - TISSUE, 500 2 PLY, 4X3, 96 
ROLLS/1000/CT

9641

DRINKING CUPS *WATER FOUNTAIN 
CUPS*, 7 OZ. WAXED PAPER COLD DRINK, 
2000/CASE. NO BID NO BID NO BID 75.76$      CASE

ECC7-P - EMPRESS PAPER COLD CUP 7 OZ., 
"COOL WAVE" STOCK PRINT 25/100 CS - 
2500/CT

9644
PLASTIC WRAP, 12X2000' ROLL. 
BOARDWALK BWK7202. $10.58 ROLL

WESTERN 
FFCB12BOD2004 12.12$      ROLL

BWK7202 - FILM, FOOD, 12 IN X 2000FT, 
CR

9656

FOIL ALUMINUM, 24" X 1000'.    
REYNOLDS RFP627, 24 X 1000 ROLL.  OR 
EQUAL TO. $214.73 ROLL 63.11$      ROLL

E245-H EMPRESS HEAVY DUTGY ROLL FOIL 
24" X 500' 90 GUAGE 1 - ROLL 1 ROLL - 24" X 500
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9658

PAPER, TOILET, 2 PLY,  KC#04460. 96 
ROLLS TO A BOX.  (BOARDWALK 
BWK6145 96 ROLLS/CASE) OR EQUAL TO. $46.79 CASE MARCAL B50096 96/CS 43.96$      CASE

BWK6145 - TISSUE, 500 2 PLY, 4X3, 96 
ROLLS/1000/CT

9661

KNIVES PLASTIC, HEACHVY DUTY, 
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED (1000/CS).    
GEN GENHYWIWKN, 1000/CS.  OR EQUAL 
TO. $16.88 CASE 23.83$      CASE

BWKKNIHWPPBIW - KNIFE, HWPP, IW, BK - 
1000/CT

9662

SPOONS PLASTIC, HEACHVY DUTY, 
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED (1000/CS).   
(GEN GENHYWIWS,  1000/CS) OR EQUAL 
TO. $16.88 CASE 22.87$      CASE

BWKTSHWPPBIW - TEASPOON, HWPP, 
IW,BK - 1000/CT

9663

FORKS PLASTIC, HEACHVY DUTY, 
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED (1000/CS).     
GEN GENHYWIWF,  1000/CASE.  OR 
EQUAL TO. $16.88 CASE 24.00$      CASE

BWKFORKHWPPBIW - FORK, HWPP, 
BLACK, WH - 1000/CT

9667

NAPKINS COCKTAIL, PACKAGED 4000 PER 
CASE.  GEN, GENCOCKTAILNAPW, 
4000/CASE.  OR EQUAL TO. $11.39 CASE 11.60$      CASE

B8500 - MORCON 9" X 9", BEVERAGE 
NAPKIN WHITE 1 - PLY 8/500 CS

9669
CUPS, 10 OZ INSULATED FOAM CUPS 
10J10. $37.79 CASE 34.57$      CASE

DCC10J10 - CUP 10OZ., FOAM, 1M, CT, 
WHT - 1000/CT

9670
PAPER GROCERY BAGS, 8 1/4 X 5 5/16 X 
16 1/8". #20 KRAFT, QTY: 5 BUNDLES $29.13 BUNDLE 500 PER BUNDLE 27.07$      BUNDLE

BAGGK20500 - BAG, GROC, 20#, KRAFT, 
500/BD

9671

COVER TOILET SEACHT, PAPER ,  
SCOTT/KIMBERLY-CLARK #7410.    
**{MUST FIT SCOTT #9526 SEACHT 
COVER DISPENSERS IN USE IN THE 
CITY}**     VENDOR TO PROVIDE 
BOARDWALK BWKK5000b, 5000/CASE.  $36.43 CASE

CRYSTALWARE 
1150 20/250/CS 45.31$      CASE

BWKK5000B - COVER, TOILETS, 250BX, 
5M/CT - 5000/CT

9673
TOWELS WYP-ALL, #05701. 12.5" X 12", 
WHITE.  KC 05701 .  OR EQUAL TO. $91.58 CASE 50.31$      CASE

BWKV030QPW - WIPES, DRC, 12X13, QF, 
WH - 18/56 CT 

9678

PLATES STYROFOAM 6" (1000/CS).     
DART DCC6PWCR, 1000/CASE.  OR EQUAL 
TO. $20.44 CASE

ECO-PAX 
AP6125 8/125/CS 19.55$      CASE

DCC6PWCR - PLATE, FOAM, 6", 125PK, 
WHT - 1000/CT

9684

TRAYS  STYROFOAM, 3 SECTION CARRY 
OUT, WITH LIDS,    ** STATE YOUR 
PACKAGING PER CASE ** . $21.18 CASE 200 PER CASE 15.33$      CASE

PCTYTD199030000 - CONTAINER, 2 TAB 
CONV, 3CM, WH 150/CT

9686
CUPS, PLASTIC, 12 OZ, 100/PK, 
BOARDWALK $26.14 CASE NCEPTION 1000 PER CASE 29.95$      CASE

PP12 - 12OZ PLASTIC CUP - 
POLYPROPYLENE - 1000/CT

9690
CUPS, CLEACHR PLASTIC, 7 oz size, 
100/SLEEVE. $41.48 CASE NCEPTION 2500 PER CASE 50.43$      CASE

BWKTRANSCUP7CT - CUP, PLAS, 7OZ., 
25/100,TR - 2500/CT

9693

CUPS, STYROFOAM, 12oz, 1000/CS SCOTT 
#V2-12C.   VENDOR TO PROVIDE DART 
DCC12J12, 1000/CS. $42.09 CASE 39.67$      CASE

DCC12J12 - CUP, 12 OZ., FOAM, 1M, CTN, 
WHT - 1000/CT

9695

CUPS PLASTIC, 12 OZ., TRANSLUCENT, 
1000/CASE SOLO #M22.      BOARDWALK 
BWKTRANSCUP12CT, 1000/CASE.  OR 
EQUAL TO. $26.14 CASE 29.95$      CASE

PP12 - 12OZ PLASTIC CUP - 
POLYPROPYLENE - 1000/CT

9698

TOWELS WYPALL, SIZE 10" X 13 .2", 
CENTER-PULL ROLL, WHITE. 200 SHEETS 
PER ROLL, 2 ROLLS/CASE, SCOTT #05796.  
NO SUBS. $80.44 CASE 71.85$      CASE

KCC05796 - WIPES, C-PLL, 10X13WH, 
2/200 CT
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9709

Toilet Paper Roll, Scott Essential, Jumbo 
Core, 1 Ply,  12/CT, JUNIOR JUMBO 
ROLLS, KIMBERLY CLARK #07223.  
(BOARDWALK BWK6101) OR EQUAL TO. $25.32 CASE MARCAL JRT02 12/CS 35.15$      CASE

BWK6101 - TISSUE, 9" 1 PLY JUMBO, 
12/2000/CT

9796

SOAP ANTI BACTERIAL 
MANUFACTURERED BY  SOFTSOAP 64 OZ. 
SIZE.     (COLGATE PALMOLIVE CPC45993) 
OR EQUAL TO. $43.27 CASE 6 PER CASE 41.99$      CASE

5031-420-02 - INOPAK STYLE 
ANTIBACTERIAL W/.3% PCMX GOLD HAND 
SOAP 4/1 GAL; CPC26991 DISCONTINUED. 4/1 GAL CT

10057

BAGS TRASH, 15" X 9" X 23", BLACK, 0.35 
MIL, 8-10 GALLON, 1000 PER CASE.   
(NOVOLEX H4021RC 1000 PER CASE) OR 
EQUAL TO.   $19.74 CASE

NORAMCO 
RST2423XLB 1000/CS 22.23$      CASE 

NORRST2423XLB - LINER, 24X 23, 7/10 
GAL, BLACK, 0.35, CORELESS, STAR, 
1000/CS 7/10 GAL/1000/CS

10059

BAGS, TRASH, SMALL, 15 X 9 X 32, BLACK, 
0.35 MIL, 16 GALLON, 1000 BAGS PER 
CASE.   (INTEPLAST B73310DXK 1000 
BAGS PER CASE) OR EQUAL TO.  $30.31 CASE

NORAMCO 
RT2432-L 1000/CS 30.30$      CASE

NORRST2432XLB - LINER, 24X32, 12-16 
GAL, BLACK, 0.35, CORELESS, STAR, 
1000/CS

10060

BAGS TRASH, 16 X 14 X 36, WHITE, 0.70 
MIL TUFF TOTE, 30 GALLON,  200 PER 
CASE.  INTEPLAST MT371XW.   PROLINK 
MT371XW.  OR EQUAL TO. $15.30 CASE

NORAMCO 
RST3036LW .65MIL 200/CS 15.15$      CASE

NORRST3036LW - LINER, 30X36+, 20 - 30 
GAL, WHITE, 0.65, CORELESS, STAR, 
200/CS.

10061

BAGS TRASH, 22 X 16 X 58 WHITE, 0.65 
MIL TUFF TOTE, 60 GALLON,  100/CASE. 
INTEPLAST MT601XW.  PRO-MT601XW-
CS.  OR EQUAL TO. $14.74 CASE

NORAMCO 
RST3858LW 100/CS 15.46$      CASE

NORRST3858LW - LINER, 38X58,55 GAL, 
WHITE, 0.65, CORELESS, STAR, 100/CS.

10062

BAGS TRASH, 23 X 10 X 39, WHITE, 0.70 
MIL TUFF TOTE, 33 GALLON,  150 PER 
CASE.  (INTEPLAST MT401XW.    PROLINK 
MT401XW) OR EQUAL TO. $13.98 CASE

NORAMCO 
RST3339LW 150/CS 13.54$      CASE

NORRST3339LW - LINER, 33X39, 33 GAL, 
WHITE, 0.65, CORELESS, STAR, 150/CS

10063

BAGS TRASH, 23 X 17 X 46 WHITE, 0.75 
MIL TUFF TOTE, 45 GALLON,  100 PER 
CASE.   INTEPLAST MT481WX.    PROLINK 
MT481XW.  OR EQUAL TO. $12.31 CASE

NORAMCO 
RST4046LW 100/CS 12.91$      CASE

NORRST4046LW - LINER, 40X46, 40-45 
GAL, WHITE, 0.65, CORELESS, STAR, 
100/CS

10101

BAGS TRASH 55 GALLON, LIGHT DUTY 1.3 
MIL THICKNESS (SUNBELT #PT-1658GY.  
INTEPLAST EC38581135K) OR EQUAL TO. $26.18 CASE

NORAMCO 
RPGB6171 100/CS 22.48$      CASE

NORRT3858XH - LINER, 38X58, 55 GAL, 
BLACK, X-HEAVY, CORELESS, STAR, 100/CS

10113

BAGS TRASH, 22 X 16 X 58, BLACK, 
MEDIUM DUTY 1.7 MIL THICKNESS, 60 
GALLON, 100 PER CASE.    (BWK523, 
100/CASE.   PROLINK EC385817K) OR 
EQUAL TO. $34.49 CASE

NORAMCO 
RPGB6181 100/CS 32.24$      CASE

NORRT3858XXH - LINER, 38X58, 55  GAL, 
BLACK, XX-HEAVY, CORELESS, STAR, 
100/CS.

10116

BAGS TRASH, 23X10X39, BLACK, LIGHT 
DUTY 1.3 MIL THICKNESS, 33 GALLON, 
100 PER CASE.  (BOARDWALK BWK516 
100/CASE.  PROLINK EC385815K) OR 
EQUAL TO. $13.90 CASE

NORAMCO 
RPGB4071 13.12$      CASE

NORRT3339XH - LINER, 33X39, 33 GAL, 
BLACK, X-HEAVY, CORELESS, STAR, 200/CS; 
SOLD 200/CS ($26.24/CS)

10133

PLUNGER FORCE CUP, CUP SIZE 5", 
HANDLE LENGTH 19", RUBBER WITH 
WOOD HANDLE, Mfr. Model #1LNX3. $5.70 EACH BWK09201 3.99$        EACH IMP9201 - PLUNGER, PROFESSIONAL

10220
INSECTICIDE ANT + ROACH.  (CHASE 433-
4106, 12/20 OZ/CS) OR EQUAL TO. $59.94 CASE

SC JOHNSON 
RAID 365961 57.61$      CASE

SJN386220 - INSECTICIDE, RAID, ANT 7 
ROACH. 12/17.5 OZ./CT

10930
RAGS  WIPE, ALL WHITE COTTON 50 
LBS/BOX  STOCK NO. 8543 NO BID NO BID 9.35$        PACK

UFSN250CW01 - WIPES, CLOTH, 
CLEANING, 16 OZ.
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11645
TRASH CAN (GREY),  TENNIS  TIDI-COURT 
TRASH CANS,  CANS ONLY NO BID NO BID 29.64$      EACH

BWK44GLWRGRA - RECEPTACLE, WASTE, 
RND, GY

11820

TOWELS  WYPALL "L40" TOWELS, WHITE, 
IN A POP UP STYLE BOX, 900/CASE.  
VENDOR TO PROVIDE KIMBERLY CLARK 
KC05790, BWKV040CGW, OR EQUAL TO. $113.97 CASE KCC 05790 900/CS 13.72$      CASE

BWKV040CGW - WIPES, 10X11.5, DRC, 
CP,200 200/CT

13006

PLATES PLASTIC, DIVIDED DINNER, 10" 
ROUND, EXTRA HEACHVY DUTY. STATE 
QUANTITY PER CASE. (BOARDWALK 
BWKPLTHIPS10WH3, 500/CASE) OR 
EQUAL. $50.43 CASE 57.91$      CASE

 BWKPLTHIPS10WH3 - PLATE, 3 
COMPRTMNT, 10" , WH

13007

CLEANER MR CLEAN, ALL PURPOSE, 9-24 
OZ PER CASE.  P&G 82707, 9/24 OZ/CASE. 
PGC77130, P&G 9/28OZ/CASE, SPARTAN 
DMQ (GALLON/SPN106204), OR EQUAL 
TO. NO BID NO BID

BOTH P&G 
ITEMS 

DISCONTINUED 46.47$      CASE

SPN106204 - DMZ - DAMP MOP NEUTRAL 
DISINFECTANT CLEANER KILLS HBV AND 
HCV ON INANIMATE SURFACES.  EPA REG. 
#5741-20 - 4/1 GL CT

PGC82707DISCONTINUED -  
SPN106204 (DMQ) - 64 IN USE 
GALLONS PER GALLON OF 
CONCENTRATE AT RECOMMENDED 
DILUTION.

13090

TOWEL SHOP, WHITE ROLL, 475 TOWELS 
PER ROLL, 12.5" X 13.4" KIMBERLY CLARK 
#41025.  VON DREHLE R941 943' 
ROLL/CASE.  OR EQUAL TO. $71.99 CASE 76.61$      CASE

KCC41025 - WIPES, WP X80 SHOP JMB, 
WH - 900/RL

13155

BOWLS STYROFOAM, 5 OZ. SIZE, 1000 
PER CASE.   DART DCC5BWWC, 
1000/CASE.  OR EQUAL TO. $21.62 CASE 20.44$      CASE

DCC5BWWC - BOWL, 5/6 OZ. , NON-LAM, 
CNCORD, 1000/CT

13156

CLEANER MR. MUSCLE OVEN, 32 OZ. 
PUMP SPRAYER, 6-32 OZ. BOTTLES PER 
CASE **NO SUBSTITUTE**    VENDOR TO 
PROVIDE SPARTAN SPN319403, 12/32 
OZ/CS.   . NO BID NO BID CAN'T FIND  43.76$      CASE

SPN319403 - OVENS &  GRILL CLEANER  
12/1 QUART

PROVIDES RAPID PENETRATION AND 
EMULSIFICATION OF TOUGH SOILS 
SUCH AS BAKED-ON CARBON, GREASE 
AND FOOD DEPOSITS.

13160

NAPKINS DINNER, 4 FOLD, 17" X 17" 
WHITE.  EMPRESS DN171713, 3000/CASE. 
BWK8307W.  OR EQUAL TO. $38.55 CASE

3700 PER CASE 
CALCULATED 

$.010/NAPKIN 37.09$      CASE

1717 - MORCON 16"X16" DINNER NAPKIN 
WHITE - 1 - PLY/4 FOLD 12/250 CS - 
3000/CT 3000/CS CALCULATED $.012/NAPKIN

13161

STYROFOAM PLATES, 10-1/2", NON-
COMPARTMENTED, 500 PER CASE. OR 
EQUAL $42.71 CASE ECO-PAX  27.35$      CASE

81000 - GENPAK CELEBRITY 10.25" WHITE 
PLATE POLYSTYRENE FOAM 4/125 CS

13162

PLATES STYROFOAM, 9", NON-
COMPARTMENTED, 500 PER CASE.     
GENPAK GNP80900, 500/CASE.  OR 
EQUAL TO. $21.77 CASE ECO-PAX  20.26$      CASE

80900 - GENPAK CELEBRITY  8.88" WHITE 
PLATE POLYSTYRENE FOAM 4/125 CS - 500 
CT

13202

PAPER, TOILET, 2 PLY, JUMBO ROLL 
TISSUE, 3.55" X 2000' ROLL, 6 ROLLS PER 
CASE, SCOTT/KIMBERLY-CLARK #07827.  
WINDSOFT WIN203, 6 ROLLS/CASE. OR 
EQUAL TO. $78.84 CASE B7827 20.91$      CASE

WIN202 - TISSUE, TOLT, 2 PLY, NPRF, JMB; 
SOLD 12/1000/CT ($41.82/CT)

13204

URINAL SCREEN with ENZYMES BLOCK, 
MANGO ODOR, 10 per BOX.  (CHERRY 
ODOR, DEMOMATIC BY HOSPITAL 
SPECIALTY).   (BOARDWALK BWKNUS, 
12/CS) OR EQUAL TO. $24.57 CASE BWKNUS 12/CS 19.96$      CASE

BWKNUS - SCREEN, URINAL, BLOCK, 
NPARA - 12/BOX

13323

CIDE BET, DISINFECTANT HOSPITAL TYPE, 
FOAMING, GERMICIDAL CLEACHNER, 
PACKAGED 12 AEROSOL CANS PER CASE, 
CIDE-BET, BETCO #08723, **NO 
SUBSTITUTE**    NO BID NO BID 69.50$      CASE

BET0872300 -  DISINFECTANT, FLOR, 19 
OZ, 12, 12/20 OZ./CT
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13322

DISINFECTANT DEODARANT, HOSPITAL, 
12/CASE, GLYBET BETCO #08623, NO 
SUBSTITUTE. NO BID NO BID 60.57$      CASE

BET10862300 - DISINFECTANT, CTR, 15.5 
OZ, 12

13325

CLEANER ANTI-BACTERIAL, 12 QUARTS 
PER CASE, FIGHT-BAC, BETCO #31112.  
**NO SUBSTITUTE**    NO BID NO BID 46.88$      CASE

BET3901200 - BETCO GE FIGHT BAC RTU - 
12/1 QUART/CT

13339

CLEANER, HAND, WIPES, SANI-TUFF 
HAND CLEANING WIPES, SANI-
FRESH/SCOTT/KIMBERLY CLARK #58310, 
8/50/CS.  $86.06 CASE 59.03$      CASE

NICP92084CT - WIPES, HAND INSTNT 
SNTZNG 6/300/CT

13517
CLEANER / DEGREASER  SIMPLE GREEN, 
55 GALLON DRUM $469.56 CASE SMP13008 442.62$    CASE

SMP13008 - CLEANER, SMPL GRN, 55 LIQ - 
6/1/CT

13611

SOAP ANTIMICROBIAL, LIQUID, DIAL 
PROFESSIONAL GOLD PUMP, #80790, 16 
OZ., 12/CASE $66.77 CASE 37.70$      CASE

DIA35470 - SOAP; HAND; LIQ; ANTIBAC; 
11OZ. 12/11  OZ./CT

13949

TOWELS PAPER, KITCHEN, ROLLS, TOWEL 
SIZE 11" WIDE X 9" BETWEEN 
PERFORATIONS, 2 PLY.   (BOARDWALK 
BWK6273 12 ROLLS/CASE) OR EQUAL TO. $33.28 CASE EMPRESS 21251 12/CS 28.67$      CASE

BWK6273 - TOWEL, ROLL, 2 PLY, 12/250 CT 
WH

14115

CLEANER, WINDOW, (GLASS PLUS OR 
WINDEX) 12-32 OZ. BOTTLES WITH 
SPRAYERS PER CASE, **NO 
SUBSTITUTE**   SC JOHNSON SJN695155, 
12/32 OZ/CASE.   SJN322338 8/32 
OZ/CASE $31.48 CASE 32.78$      CASE

SJN322338 - CLEANER, WINDEX GLASS, BE 
8/32  OZ./CT

15563

SCRUBS IN A BUCKET DYM 42230.    (ITW 
PRO ITW4223OCT, 6/30/CASE) OR EQUAL 
TO.  $54.53 CASE 44.84$      CASE

ITW42230CT - WIPES, CLEAN, HAND, 
6/30/CT

15564

SIGN FLOOR FOLDING, "CAUTION WET 
FLOOR", YELLOW WITH BLACK LETTERS, 
CONTINENTAL #CM119, RUBBERMAID 
C112-77, CARLISLE #3690904.    IMPACT 
IMP9152W, EACH.  OR EQUAL TO. $5.28 EACH 10.86$      EACH IMP9152W - SIGN, WET FLR, BILNGL

15568

TRASH CAN DOLLY,   DOLLY ONLY FOR 
RUBBERMAID 44 GALLON BRUTE TRASH 
CAN, RUBBERMAID #2640 OR 
CONTINENTAL #3255.     (IMPACT 
IMP7704, EACH.)     OR EQUAL TO. $37.67 EACH 31.43$      EACH IMP7704 - DOLLY, GATOR, PLAS, BK

15573

FLOOR  SWEEP OIL ABSORBANT, OIL DRI, 
SACK WEIGHT 50LBS OIL DRI BROWN 
BAG, OIL DRI #01050 NO BID NO BID 8.41$        EACH

A40G - BALCONES #40 BAG ABSORB-N-DRY 
OIL DRY *MUST BUY FULL PALLET OF 50 
BAGS* 1/BG.

15713

LARGE TRASH BAGS, BAGS TRASH 22 X 16 
X 58  60 GALLON CLEACHR, 1.7 MIL, 100 
PER CASE.     (NOVOLEX 17658WKR) OR 
EQUAL TO.    NO BID NO BID 35.67$      CASE

NORRST3858X1C - LINER, 38 X 58, 55 GAL, 
CLEAR, 1.5, CORELESS, STAR, 100/CS

15746

DEODORIZER  ODOR COUNTERACTANT 
ODOR ELIMINATOR CONCENTRATED 
EUCALYPTUS SCENT. 1-GALLON JUGS 
PACKAGED 4-1 GALLONS/CASE ODOBAN 
#911061-G4 (OR) ODOBAN ODO911062-
G4. $72.45 CASE NCL ETERNITY 4-1GAL/CS 40.15$      CASE

911062-G4 - CLEAN CONTROL ODOBAN 
DEODORIZER & DISINFECTANT 
CONCENTRATE EUCALYPTUS 4/1 GAL/CT
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15919

WIPES, BLEACH FREE, DISINFECTANT, 
CLOTH, 7" X 8", 35 WIPES PER 12 
CANISTERS PER CASE.  CLOROX #01593.  
BOARDWALK 454W75.  OR EQUAL TO. $23.03 CASE 20.82$      CASE GJOW75F - WIPES; DISINFECTING; 6/75/CT

15947

PLATES, PAPER 6" WHITE, UNCOASTED, 
UNDIVIDED/NON-
COMPARTMENTALIZED. 1000/CASE $21.57 CASE 16.04$      CASE

AJMPP6AJKWH - PLATE, PPR, UNCTD, 
61000 WH 1000/CT

15970

DEODORANT, AEROSOL, REFILL CLEAN & 
FRESH, FOR USE WITH TIME MIST MODEL 
32-1111TM DISPENSER TIME MIST 
MODEL 33-2502 TMCA 12/CASE.      
VENDOR TO PROVIDE TIME MIST 
TMS1042771, 12/CASE. $79.95 CASE 38.15$      CASE

PPMAFL-05 - PERFORMANCE PLUS 
METERED AEROSOL FRESH LINEN 7 OZ. 
CAN AIR FRESHENER 12/CS

15971

DEODORANT,  AEROSOL, REFILL, 
CINNAMON, FOR USE WITH TIME MIST 
MODEL 32-1111 TM DISPENSER.    TIME 
MIST TMS1042746 12/CASE.  OR EQUAL 
TO. $79.95 CASE 38.15$      CASE

PPMAOS-02 PERFORMANCE PLUS 
METERED AEROSOL ORCHARD SPICE 7 OZ. 
AIR FRESHENER 12/CS

15972

DEODORANT, AEROSOL, REFILL, CITRUS, 
FOR USE WITH TIME MIST MODEL 32-
1111 TM DISPENSER.    VENDOR TO 
PROVIDE TIME MIST TMS1042781, 
12/CASE. $79.95 CASE 38.15$      CASE

PPMACG-03 - PERFORMANCE PLUS 
METERED AEROSOL CITRUS GROVE 7 OZ. 
CAN AIR FRESHENER 12/CS

15973

DEODORANT, AEROSOL, REFILL, MANGO, 
FOR USE WITH TIME MIST MODEL 32-
1111TM DISPENSER TIME MIST 
TMS1042781 12/CASE.     VENDOR TO 
PROVIDE TIME MIST TMS1042810 
12/CASE. $79.95 CASE 38.15$      CASE

PPMAM-01 - PERFORMANCE PLUS 
METERED AEROSOL MANGO 7 OZ. CAN 
AIR FRESHENER 12/CS

15974

DEODORANT, AEROSOL, REFILL, 
LAVENDER LEMONADE, FOR USE WITH 
TIME MIST MODEL 32-1111TM 
DISPENSER TIME MIST MODEL 33-5327 
TMCAPT 12/CASE.     TIME MIST 
TMS1042757, 12/CASE.  OR EQUAL TO. $79.95 CASE 38.15$      CASE

PPMALM-04 - PERFORMANCE PLUS 
METERED AEROSOL LAVENDER MEADOW 
7 OZ. CAN AIR FRESHENER 12/CS

15975

DISPENSER, AIR FRAGRANCING, 
AUTOMATIC, FULL SIZE, 30 DAY REFILL 
LIFE, USES 2 "C" CELL BATTERIES, TIME 
MIST MODEL 32-1111TM, **NO SUBS**    
VENDOR TO PROVIDE TIME MIST 
1047717, EACH. $25.05 EACH 20.62$      EACH TMS1047717 - DISPENSER, TIMMST, WH

15976
BOWLS,  STYROFOAM, 12 OZ., 1000 CASE. 
GENPAK82100.  OR EQUAL TO. $27.08 CASE 23.94$      CASE

82100 - GENPAK CELEBRITY 12 OZ. BOWL 
POLYSTYRENE FOAM 8/125 CT - 1000/CT

16039

BROOM  AS SPECIFIED: BROOM THAT 
STORES INSIDE DUST PAN AND CLIPS TO 
HANDLE (FITS INSIDE OPEN-LID PAN AND 
LOCKS IN AN UPRIGHT POSITION). 
OVERALL DIMENSIONS: 40.25"H X 
12.00"W X 3.25"D.   Libman Broom with 
Dustpan, Model # 00919.  Libman 
Commercial 919 Lobby Dust Pan and 
Broom Set (Open Lid), Black/Red.  
(UNGER- UNGEDPBR- INCLUDES CLIP-ON 
LOBBY BROOM AND DUST PAN.)  OR 
EQUAL TO.   NO BID NO BID 53.19$      EACH UNGEDPBR - DUSTPAN; W/BROOM; BK
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16093

HAND SANITIZER, 4 OZ SQUEEZE BOTTLE, 
CLEACHR COLOR, (24 EACH PER CASE), 
PURELL #9651-24-B5P00, OR GRAINGER 
#20W448. **NO SUBS** $58.46 CASE 51.72$      CASE

GOJ965124 - SANITIZER, HAND PUREL 
4OZ., 24/4OZ.

16094

HAND SANITIZER, 8 OZ PUMP BOTTLE, 
12/CASE, COLOR CLEACHR, PURELL 
#9652, HOJ365912CT 12-12OZ/CT, OR 
EQUAL TO. NO BID NO BID

ITEM 
DISCONTINUED 

BY PURELL 61.39$      CASE
GOJ365912CT - SANITIZER, PURELL, ORGL, 
CLR 12/12 OZ./CT

16263

BAND-AIDS 1", BANDAGES CURITY 
ADHESIVE, FLEXIBLE, CLOTH, 1", 50/BOX, 
KENDALL HEACHLTHCARE, **NO SUBS**  $0.00 10.31$      BOX

JOJ4444 - BAND AID; FLEXIBLE; 1" - 100 
BOX

17091

TOWELS PAPER, WHITE ROLL, 8" X 800 FT 
ROLL DIAMETER, 1.5" CORE DIAMETER,  
MUST FIT KIMBERLY CLARK 09746 
DISPENSERS, 800' PER ROLL, 12 
ROLLS/CASE.  KIMBERLY CLARK 01040 OR 
EQUAL.     VENDOR TO PROVIDE 
MORCON MORW6800 6 ROLLS/CASE. $36.99 CASE MARCAL 880-B 6/CS 29.96$      CASE

MORW6800 - TOWEL, HARD RL, 7.87", 
1PLY 6/800/CT

17279

SOAP, FOAM, REFRESH MOISTURIZING 
800 ML REFILL, 6/CASE. STOKO 29932 
6/800ML/CS. **NO SUB**  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

17339

GLOVES, DISPOSABLE LATEX, LIGHTLY 
POWDERED, THICKNESS 5 MIS, LENGTH 
9.25", COLOR NATURAL, SIZE MED, 
100/BX, ANSELL 69-318. NO BID NO BID 5.57$        BOX

BWK345MCT - GLOVES, LATEX, 
PF,M,NT,1K  100/BOX

17340

BROOM, PUSH WITH HANDLE FOR INSIDE 
FLOORS ABCO BH 11004 AND ABCO 
01104.   (BOARDWALK OSIPSHBRM2460, 
EACH.) OR EQUAL TO. $2.92 EACH

THREADED 
HANDLE 15.65$      PAIR

OSIPSHBRM2460 - PUSH BROOM, 24" 
(BWK20124) & HANDLE (BWK122); DUAL 
ITEM (BWK20224/BWK122)

17341

SOAP-REFILL, HAND SOAP (KLEENEX), 
FOAM SKIN CLEANSER, CASSETTE, PINK, 
1200ML 2/CASE, KCC 91592, 
6/800ML/CS.  **NO SUBS**  $44.10 CASE 38.13$      CASE

KCC91592 - SOAP, KLNX LUX FOAM 
SKCLNS 2/1200 ML/CT

17342

HANDS FREE SOAP DISPENSER FOR 
#17341,  DISPENSER SOAP, FOAM, 
TOUCHLESS ELECTRONIC CASSETTE, 
1200ML KCC 92148.  EACH.  **NO 
SUBS**       NO BID NO BID 39.69$      EACH KCC32504 - DISPENSER, SKIN CARE, BK 

17356

TOWELS, PAPER, HARD ROLL 7.5" X 1150', 
CORE SIZE 1.75", WHITE 6 ROLLS/CASE 
KC25702.    $111.55 CASE 101.90$    CASE

KCC25702 - TOWEL, SCOTT, HI CAP, 1 PLY 
6/1150/CT

17357

BAGS TRASH, 40 X 46 BLACK, MEDIUM 
DUTY 1.7 MIL., 40-45 GALLON, TO FIT 
RUBBERMAID 40 GALLON SQUARE TRASH 
CONTAINER 100/CASE PROLINK TK46UH 
OR EQUAL.   (BOARDWALK #BWK521)  OR 
EQUAL TO. $19.00 CASE

RPGB4671 
NORAMCO 100/CS 30.01$      CASE

NORRT4047XXH - LINER, 40X 46, 40-45  
GAL, BLACK, XX-HEAVY, CORELESS, STAR, 
100/CS

17360

PAPER TOILET, 2 PLY WHITE, CORELESS 
KC 04007, 36 ROLLS/CASE.   VENDOR TO 
PROVIDE KIMBERLY CLARK 04007 36 
ROLLS/CASE.   **NO SUBSTITUTE** $68.53 CASE 63.97$      CASE

KCC04007 - TISSUE, CORLS2PLY, 1000SHRL 
36/1000/CT
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17373

CLEACHNER, FLOOR, CITRUS SCENT, NON-
ALKALINE, 4 GALLONS/CASE DIVERSEY 
STRIDE N00668.   (SPARTAN SPN301604, 
4/1 GAL/CASE) OR EQUAL TO. $34.00 CASE NCL IMAGE 4-1GAL/CS 32.96$      CASE

SPN301604 - DAMP MOP-FLOOR CLEANER 
CONCENTRATE 4/1 GAL/CT

FOR MAINTENANCE OF HIGH GLOSS 
FINISHES. NO RINSING NEEDED.

17375

BAGS TRASH, 55-60 GALLON, HEACHVY 
DUTY 3 MIL BLACK 40/CASE.    (NOVOLEX 
K7663ZK 40/CASE)  (PROLINK CB6030XK)   
OR EQUAL TO. NO BID NO BID 10.92$      CASE

NORTUFF20 - LINER, 33X48, 55-60 GAL, 
BLACK, 3, CORELESS, STAR, 20/CS

17728

WIPE, GERMICIDAL, SUPER SANI-CLOTH 
GERMICIDAL DISPOSABLE WIPE, LARGE 
CANISTER, CONTAINS 160 WIPES, 6" x 
6.75", P. D. I., SKU #Q55172, CASE, 12 
CANISTERS PER CASE, NO SUBS. $80.29 CASE NICP3872 12/CS 79.67$      CASE

NICP13872 - WIPES, HAND SANIT, CLOTH, 
12/160/CT

17997

BAGS TRASH 65 GALLON, STEEL TUFF 1.7 
MIL. 44Ww X 55h    (PROLINK EC445517K 
100/CASE)  OR EQUAL TO. NO BID NO BID 36.96$      CASE

NORRSB505115B - LINER, 50X51, 65 GAL, 
BLACK, 1.5,CORELESS, STAR, 100/CSS

18018

TOWELS, WYPALL "L40", 10" X 10.8" 
WHITE, IN A POP-UP STYLE BOX.  
KIMBERLY CLARK 3046 9-90/CS.  OR 
EQUAL TO. NO BID 13.72$      CASE

BWKV040CGW - WIPES, 10X11.5, DRC, CP, 
200/CT

18300

PAPER  TOILET, JUNIOR JUMBO 9" ROLLS 
2-PLAY, BOARDWALK #BWK410320 
SCOTT #KCC07805 $25.32 CASE MARCAL JRT02 12/CS 21.58$      CASE

BWK410320 - TISSUE, TT,JUMBO, 2PLY 
12/CT

18309

SOAP TIDE DETERGENT,  FLOOR 
CLEACHNER, P&G PGC02364 TIDE FLOOR 
CLEACHNER 36LB/BOX PER CARTON $129.14 BOX 119.55$    BOX

PGC02364 - CLEANER; ALL-PRPSE; FLR 
36LB/EA

18490
2 IN 1 SQUEEGEE PUSH BROOM; MODEL 
Quickie #635SU NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

18491 32 oz SPRAY BOTTLE 96/CS OFF-SET NECK NO BID NO BID 1.44$        PAIR

OSIBTLTRIG32 - QT BTL (BWK00032) & 
TRIGGER (BWK58109); CONSISTS OF 
BOARDWALK 32 OZ BOTTLE AND 
BOARDWALK TRIGGER SPRAY SEE ITEM 6999

18492

DEODORANTS, ROOM, ALL TYPES, SPRAY 
PAK AIR FRESHENER WITH ORDENONE, 
CLEACHN FRESH FRAGRANCE, 12/15 OZ 
CANS. (#H158G2, #CH-433-41113-CS) OR 
EQUAL TO. NO BID NO BID 47.81$      CASE

SPN601900 - AIRLIFT XCELENTE ODOR 
ELIMINATOR- ODOR NEUTRALIZER FOR 
STRONG, COMPLEX MALODORS SUCH AS 
SMOKE, URINE AND MILDEW. FRESH 
LAVENDER FRAGRANCE. 12/20 OZ. CANS, 
NET 16 OZ.

18493

BLACK, CORELESS ROLL, PLASTIC TRASH 
BAGS, 96 GAL CAPACITY, APPROX SIZE 52 
" WD, 75" HT, 2 MIL THICK, 50 PK 
(TOUGH GUY-6FWH8) OR EQUAL TO. NO BID NO BID 41.78$      CASE

NORRSB57752B - LINER, 57X75, 90-96 
GAL, BLACK, 2, CORELESS, STAR, 100/CS

18494

SPONGE, HEAVY-DUTY SCRUB, 4 1/2 X 2 
7/10 X 3/5, GREEN/YELLOW, 20/CASE 
(SCOTCH-BRITE ITEM# 426 OR 
EQUIVALENT) $39.69 CASE 8/5/CS 14.68$      CASE BWK174 - SPONGE, MED DTY, SCRUB, GN MEDIUM DUTY

18495

BAGS TRASH, 61864BP, 4455GY1.6, 
44x55, 1.6 MIL, DK GRAY, 56 GAL LINER, 
100/CS NO BID NO BID 37.54$      CASE

NORRSB445516B - LINER, 44X55, 56 GAL, 
BLACK, 1.6, CORELESS, STAR, 100/CS
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18496

TRAFFIC MASTER, BLACK, 24"x36", FIBER 
AND RUBBER COMMERCIAL DOOR MAT, 
Helps absorb water and scrape 
dirt/debris off shoes, Weather resistant 
indoor/outdoor use, Stays securely in 
place with slip-resistant backing. Model 
#60-885-1907-20000300. OR EQUAL. $27.25 EACH

MLLEGDFB0203
04 19.78$      EACH MLLEGDFB020304 - MAT, 2X3, ECOGUARD

18497

PROCTOR AND GAMBLE DAWN ULTRA 
PLATUNUM POWERWASH DISHWASHER 
DETERGENT LIQUID, FRESH SCENT, 16 oz., 
(52366). OR EQUAL. $7.47 EACH PGC52366 5.88$        EACH

PGC52364 - DAWN DISH SPRAY SK FRESH 
6/16 OZ

18498

COMMERCIAL WINDOW SQUEEGEE, 
POLYETHYLENE BLADE, 8" BLADE WD., 
ALUMINUM FRAME, 6PK. (Mfg. Model 
791506) OR EQUAL. NO BID NO BID 5.05$        EACH BWK824 - SQUEEGEE, 8" HD, 21" HANDLE

18499

MALLORY SQUEEGEE BUCKET: LENGTH 
12" x WIDTH 9" x DEPTH 8 ¾" x 
DIAMETER 9". 2 GALLON BUCKET 
CAPACITY. PLASTIC, BLACK. (Mfg. MODEL: 
864 BLACK) OR EQUAL. NO BID NO BID 19.57$      EACH UNGQB12B - BUCKET; PRO; 3 GAL

25000

KITCHEN LINERS, BWK1DK100, 
DRAWSTRING KITCHEN BAGS, 13 gal, 0.8 
mil, WHITE, 50 BAGS/ROLL, 2 
ROLLS/CARTON $12.57 CASE 12.88$      CASE

BWK1DK100 - BAG, DRWSTRING, KTCHN, 
13G, WH

25001

GARBAGE BAG LINERS, HERK1475QK, 
LINEACHR LOW-DENSITY CAN LINERS, 90-
96 gal, 2 mil, 57 x 75, BLACK, 50/CARTON. NO BID NO BID 41.78$      CASE

NORRSB57752B - LINER, 57X75, 90-96 
GAL, BLACK, 2, CORELESS, STAR, 100/CS

25002

CloroxPro Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, 
Lemon Fresh, 75 Count. Manufacturer 
Part No: 15948. $35.87 CASE 6/CASE 20.82$      CASE

GJOW75F - WIPES; DISINFECTING; 
12/75/CT 12/75/CT

25003

CloroxPro Clean-Up Disinfectant Cleaner 
with Bleach Refill, 128 Ounces (35420). 
Manufacturer Part No: CLO35420. 
UNSPSC: 47131803 $49.66 CASE CLO35420CT 4/CS 45.59$      CASE

CLO35420CT - CLEANER, W/BLEACH, 128 
OZ. - 4/GAL/CT

25004

CloroxPro Clean-Up Disinfectant Cleaner 
with Bleach Spray, 32 Ounces (35417). 
Manufacturer Part No: CLO35417. 
UNSPSC: 47131805 $43.23 CASE 9/CS 45.89$      CASE

CLO35417CT - CLEANER, CLEAN UP, 
W/BLEACH - 9/32/CT

25005

Dawn Ultra Liquid Dish Soap with Sponge, 
Original Scent, 19.4 oz., 4/Carton (89271). 
Manufacturer Part No: 89271. UNSPSC: 
47131810 NO BID 20.94$      CASE

PGC08285CT - DETERGENT; DAWN; OGNL; 
12/7.5 OZ./CT

25006

Scotch-3M, Brite Heavy Duty Scouring 
Pad, Green, 12/Pack. Manufacturer Part 
No: MMM86. UNSPSC: 47131502 $25.18 PACK 7.06$        PACK

BWK186 - PAD, SCOUR, H-DTY, 6X9, GN 
15/CT

25007

BRUTE CONTAINER SQUARE DOLLY, 
250LB CAPACITY 17.25 X 6.25 BK, ITEM: 
RCP3530. $84.68 EACH 80.37$      EACH RCP3530 - DOLLY, SQ BRUTE 28, 40,50G

25008

NATURAL HOG HAIR BURNISHING PADS, 
20" DIAMETER, TAN, 5/C/S, ITEM: 
BWK4020NHE. $22.11 CASE 17.84$      CASE

PNHL20 - PERFORMANCE PLUS ROUND 
BURNISHING PAD NATURAL BLEND LIGHT 
HAIR 20" 5/CS

25009

AMBITEX N5201 Series Nitrile Food 
Service Gloves, Large, Disposable, Blue, 
100/Box. Manufacturer Part No: 
NLG5201. Manufacturer Name: Tradex. 
UNSPSC: 46181504 NO BID 3.86$        BOX

BWK380LCTA - GLOVES, NITRL, PF, L, 1000, 
BE 100/BOX
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25010

Coastwide Professional 8" Lobby Broom, 
Gray (CW58001), Manufacturer Part No: 
CW61069CC/5800. UNSPSC: 47131604. $4.93 EACH

P36960-EACH 
PERFORMANCE 

PLUS 4.13$        EACH
BWK951TEA - BROOM, TOY/LOBBY, CORN, 
39" L

25011

DISPENSER FOR TOILET SEAT COVERS, 
DISPENSER TO FIT SEAT COVER BWK 
K5000 $21.02 EACH BWKKD100 11.77$      EACH

BWKKD100 - DISPENSER, TOILETS CVR, 
WH; SOLD 2/BOX ($23.54/BX)

25012

TRASH CAN, RUBBERMAID BRUTE 32 
GALLON BLUE ROUND TRASH CAN WITH 
LID AND DOLLY.

NO BID NO BID 79.79$      EACH

OSICAN32BLUSET - TRASH CAN, 
RUBBERMAID BRUTE 32 GALLOW BLUE 
ROUND ()RCP263100BE), AND DOLLY 
(RCP264000BK).

25013

44x55 1.6 mil DK GRAY 56 GALLON LINER 
100/CASE. (ITEM #61864BP, 44X55, 1.6 
MIL, DK GRAY, 56 GAL LINER, 100/CS) OR 
EQUAL. NO BID NO BID 37.54$      CASE

NORRSB445516B - LINER, 44X55, 56 GAL, 
BLACK, 1.6, CORELESS, STAR, 100/CS

25014
BWKHURACAN40, POWDER LAUNDRY 
DETERGENT, 40LB/PAIL, FRESH LEMON $21.12 PAIL 21.07$      PAIL

BWKHURACAN40 - SOAP, LAUNDRY, 
PWDR 40LB PAIL, WE

25015

BWK340LP, POWDER LAUNDRY 
DETERGENT, 18 LB/PAIL, CRISP CLEACHN 
SCENT $25.04 PAIL 23.31$      PAIL

BWK340LP - DETERGENT, LAUNDRY, HE, 
PW DR  18/LB/PL
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