

	SAF-T-GLOVE INC NO DOCUMENTATION	BOUND TREE MEDICAL NO DOCUMENTATION	AZARIS UNIFORMS NO DOCUMENTATION	FASTENAL NO DOCUMENTATION	PRIMUS ELECTRONICS CORP NO DOCUMENTATION	MES MUNICIPAL EMERGENCY SERVICES INC
1. 16311 CLASS 3 LIME GREEN	7.75 CORDOVA V3001	NO BID	13.25 OCCUNOMIX	16.99 BODY GUARD	10.00 ERGODYNE 8320Z	NO BID
2. 16312 CLASS 3 ORANGE	7.75 CORDOVA V3001	NO BID	13.25 OCCUNOMIX	16.99 BODY GUARD	10.00 ERGODYNE 8320Z	NO BID
3. 14105 CLASS 2 LIME GREEN	5.00 CORDOVA V241P	NO BID	21.75 OCCUNOMIX	14.99 BODY GUARD	5.00 ERGODYNE 8210Z	NO BID
4. 4700 CLASS 2 ORANGE	5.00 CORDOVA V240P	NO BID	21.75 OCCUNOMIX	14.99 BODY GUARD	5.00 ERGODYNE 8210Z	NO BID