
Tabulation of Bid 

Bid 115159 Police Uniforms 

Qty Item Description 
Long Sleeve Shirt Horace Small 

1 37S 1269 HS1140/HS1191 

2 721 1268 Short Sleeve Shirt HS1238/HS1293 

3 38 12S44 Uniform Hat Military Style with cover 

4 1 13923 Uniform Hat Summer Mesh Top 

5 1 12S39 Uniform Hat Executive Officer, Bayly 9811 

6 1 13344 Cap Band, Gold 

7 1 12490 Cap Band, Silver 

8 1 1248S Corporal Stripe, Gold on Navy 

9 1 12S29 Sergeant Stripe, Gold on Navy 

10 1 13807 Corporal Stripe, Subdued 

11 1 13808 Sergeant Stripe, Subdued 

12 1 1273 Coveralls 

Discontinued Item - Uniform Long Sleeve Shirt 

f' 
Amount 

40.00 

38.9S 

36.9S 

MIDWAY MPO/ REG 

29.00 
MIDWAY 

MPO/ SUMMER 

76.9S 

MIDWAY MPO W/EGGS 

12.9S 

14.9S 

1.99 

1.99 

2.99 

2.99 

34.9S 

R<dKap CP40DN/ 3399 

13 s 13373 HS1449/ HS14S3 N/A 

14 1 

1S 1 

16 39 

1337S Uniform Short Sleeve Shirt HS1231/HS1286 

Uniform Long Sleeve Shirt 

13376 HS1133/HS1185 

13377 Uniform Trousers HS2343/HS2344 

42.9S 

44.95 

42 .95 

I 
'

Nof: P'1" Spec . 
, 

" ... I 
Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount 

1S,OOO.OO 34.70 13,012.SO 37.9S 14,231.2S 36. 7S 13,781.2S 34.7S 13,031.2S No Bid 
-~ 

Z314N/Z9314LCN 35W78Z-86 SU315ZM/SU316ZM 

28,082.9S 32.30 23,288.30 34.24 24,687.04 34.20 24,6S8.20 32.20 23,216.20 No Bid 

Z3314N/9814LC 85R78Z-86 SU310ZM/SU311ZM 

1,404.10 38.10 1,447.80 38.10 1,447.80 38.10 1,447.80 38.10 1,447.80 No Bid 

29.00 38.10 38.10 38. 10 38.10 38.10 38.10 38.10 38.10 No Bid 

76.9S 11S.OO 11S.OO 11S.OO 11S.OO llS 00 11S.OO 11S.OO 11S.OO No Bid 

12.9S 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 No Bid 

14.9S 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 No Bid 

1.99 2.SO 2.SO 2.50 2.SO 2.SO 2.SO 2.SO 2.50 No Bid 

1.99 2.SO 2.50 2.SO 2.SO 2.SO 2.SO 2.SO 2.50 No Bid 

2.99 2.SO 2.SO 2.SO 2.SO 2 so 2.SO 2.SO 2.50 No Bid 

2.99 2.50 2.50 2.SO 2.SO 2.50 2.SO 2.SO 2.50 No Bid 

34.9S 3S.SO 3S.SO 3S.SO 3S.SO 3S.SO 3S.SO 3S.SO 3S.SO No Bid 

N/A N/A N/A N/ A N/A N/ A N/ A N/A N/A N/A 

42.9S 37.9S 37.9S 37.24 37.24 37.9S 37.9S 37.9S 37.9S No Bid 

44.9S 39.95 39.9S 40.00 40.00 39.95 39.9S 39.9S 39.9S No Bid 

1,67S.OS 42.SO 1,6S7.SO 37.SO 1,462.SO 42.50 1,6S7 .SO 42 .SO 1,6S7.SO No Bid 



l'tu..x:..rded. 

j' I j I j I J I I I l l ... . 
Tabulation of Bid ~ 

Bid #5159 Police Uniforms 
. 

Qty Item Description Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount 
FX57300 

17 56 1265 Police Uniform Jacket, HS3350 109.95 6,157.20 107.10 5,997.60 107.10 5,997.60 107.10 5,997.60 107.10 5,997.60 No Bid 

18 13 1304 Jacket CRO with liner, Liberty #568MNV 44.95 584.35 50.00 650.00 50.00 650.00 50 .00 650.00 50.00 650.00 No Bid 

19 1 13905 S.LI.D.E. Tab, Navy with Gold Lettering 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 ·= 1.00 1.00 1.00 No Bid 

20 1 12502 TAl Tab, Navy wi th Gold Lettering 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 No Bid 

21 1 13906 Surveillance Technician 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 No Bid 

22 1 13907 HMI Tab, Navy with Gold Lettering 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 No Bid 

23 1 13908 Traffic Tab 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 No Bid 

24 1 13909 FTO Tab, Navy with Gold Lettering 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 No Bid 

25 1 13910 Auxiliary Tabs 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 IUJO 1.00 1.00 1.00 No Bid 

Special Operations Shoulder Emblems 

26 1 13810 Subdued Color Black/Navy BDU Shirts 4.50 4.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 No Bid 

27 1 13811 Reserve Tab, Navy with Gold Lettering 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 ' 1.00 1.00 1.00 No Bid 

28 1 13812 TRU Tab, Subdued 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 No Bid 

29 1 13813 RANGER Tab, Subdued 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 l .OO - 1.00 1.00 1.00 No Bid 

30 1 13814 JAGUAR Tab, Subdued 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 No Bid 

31 1 13815 Mounted Tab, Subdued 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 No Bid 

MPD Badge Patch for BDU 's Subdued 

32 1 13914 w/Sea led Subdued 2.SO 2.50 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 No Bid 



f't/.L)a.rded 

Tabulation of Bid I I i I i 7 J I I I 1'1 Bid #5159 Police Uniforms 

Qty Item Description Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount 

33 10 13915 Embroideri ng Name on Shirt Gold/Yellow 3.50 35.00 5.00 50.00 5.00 50.00 5 00 50.00 5.00 50.00 No Bid 

34 1 12517 Police Shoulder Communication Patch 2.00 2.00 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 No Bid 

35 1 12479 Cadet Shoulder Emblem 2.00 2.00 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 - 2.50 2.50 2.50 No Bid 

36 1 12478 Shou lder Emblem w/ Sewing Fee 5.95 5.95 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 No Bid 

Shoulder Emblem Subdued - Sewn on 

37 1 13816 Price 3.95 3.95 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 No Bid 

MPD Shoulder Emblem - No Sewing Fee-

38 250 13916 Trade Patch 1.50 375.00 2.50 625.00 2.50 625.00 2 .50 - 625.00 2.50 625.00 No Bid 

M PD Shoulder Emblem - Subdued - No 

39 1 13817 Sewing Fee 4.50 4.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 --:r- 2.50 2.50 2.50 No Bid 

40 1 12482 Gold Service Stripe, 5 Year Increment 1.00 1.00 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 .. -rrn 2.50 2.50 2.50 No Bid 

41 1 12483 Silver Service Stripe 5 Year Increment 1.00 1.00 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 : .. _;-;; 2.50 2.50 2.50 No Bid 

42 18 12512 Uniform Tie Cl ip on or Velcro 4.50 81 .00 5.74 103.32 5.74 103.32 5.74 103.32 5.74 103.32 No Bid 

Samuel Broom~ 90080 Samuel Broome Samuel Broome SamueJ Broome Samuel Broome 

Long Sleeve, White, 2 Pkt . Flying Cross 

43 29 1317 #139R5400 32.95 955.55 32.82 951.78 32.82 951.78 32.82 •l t• 951.78 32.82 951.78 No Bid 

Short Sleeve, White, 2 Pkt . Flying Cross 

44 66 1316 #189R5400 29.95 1,976.70 28.22 1,862.52 28.22 1,862.52 28.22 :. 1,862.52 28.22 1,862.52 No Bid 

Uniform Short Sleeve Executive Shirt 

45 3 1339 White 45W6600 29 .95 89.85 29.55 88.65 28.22 84.66 29.55 
,. 88.65 29.55 88.65 No Bid 

6SRS4.00 HS L2l2 

Uniform Shirt, Long Sleeve, Executive, 

46 6 1340 Whit e Flying Cross #3SWS5400 36.95 221.70 50.60 303.60 50.60 303.60 50.60 - 303.60 50.60 303.60 No Bid 



Qty Item 

47 1 1438 

Tabulation of Bid 

Bid #5159 Pollee Uniforms 

Description 
Uniform Shirt, Long Sleeve, Executive, 

White Flying Cross 

Replacement Button, Gold for 

48 1 8005 Fechheimer, Small 

Replacement Button, Gold for 

49 1 8004 Fechheimer, Large 

f' 
Amount 

36.95 

.so 

.so 

SO 1 13917 Surveillance Tech. Short Sleeve, Light Blue 36.95 

51 1 13918 Surveillance Tech. Long Sleeve, Light Blue 38.95 

CRO Short Sleeve Shirt Light Blue, Flying 

52 104 1297 Cross #139RS42SA 29.95 

Ftylns Cross 189R54-25 

CRO Long Sleeve Shirt, Light Blue Flying 

53 70 1298 Cross #139R5425 32.95 

54 1 12495 CRO Cross-Over Tie, Dark Blue 3.95 

Samuel Broome 

55 1 12497 CRO Shoulder Emblem 2.00 

56 7 12477 CRO Cap, Wave Style, Blue and White 29.95 
ALBOUNWAVE 

CRO Trouser, Dark Blue, No Stripe 

57 79 1272 HS2149/HS2181 32.95 

58 841 17507 Trouser with Stripe HS2149/HS2181 39 .95 

59 11 1267 Cadet Short Sleeve Shirt, Light Blue 34.99 

I i 
Total Amount 

36.95 36.20 

0.50 2.50 

0.50 3.00 

36.95 28.22 

38.95 32.82 

3,114.80 28.22 

Flying Cross 189R54-25 

2,306.50 32.82 

3.95 4.00 

Samuel Broome 900TV-61 

2.00 2.50 

209.65 38.10 

2,603.05 30.30 

Elbeco E314RN/ E9314LCN 

33,597.95 34.30 

Etbeco E314RN/E9314LCN 

384.89 29.55 

Hwc...rde.d.. 

I /{ I 1 I I . " ~ I l l 
Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount 

36.20 36.20 36.20 36.20 - 36.20 36.20 36.20 No Bid 

2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 No Bid 

3.00 3.00 3.00 3.00 - 3.00 3.00 3.00 No Bid 

28.22 28.22 28.22 28.22 - 28.22 28.22 28.22 No Bid 

32.82 32.82 32.82 32.82 32.82 32.82 32.82 No Bid 

2,934.88 28.22 2,934.88 28.22 2,934.88 28.22 2,934.88 No Bid 

Flying Cross 189R54·2S Flytng Cross.J.89_EH_25 Flylns Cross 189RS4·25 

2,297.40 32.82 2,297.40 32.82 ....___ 2,297.40 32 .82 2,297.40 No Bid 

4.00 4.00 4.00 4.00 4.00 4.00 4.00 No Bid 

Samuel Broome 900TV-61 Samuel Br oome 900lV-61 Samuel Broome 900TV-61 

2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 No Bid 

266.70 38.10 266.70 38.10 - 266.70 38.10 266.70 No Bid 

2,393.70 31.40 2,480.60 32.10 2,535.90 30.10 2,377.90 No Bid 

3900·2S Spiewak SU322 

28,846.30 35.40 29,771.40 36.10 30,360.10 34.10 28,678.10 No Bid 

3900·25 Spiewak SU322 

325.05 29.55 325.05 29 .55 ? 325.05 29.55 325.05 No Bid 



Ft~er/.. 

Tabulation of Bid j ' I i I 1 I 1: I , . I l l Bid 115159 Police Uniforms 

Qty Item Descrlp_tlon Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount 
60 5 1299 Cadet long Sleeve Shirt, light Blue 36.95 184.75 33.05 165.25 33.05 165.25 13.05 165.25 33.05 165.25 No Bid 

Honor Guard Trouser w/Gold St r ipe 

61 1 1313 HS2149/HS2181 20.00 20.00 34. 10 34.10 3S.40 35.40 36.10 ".!!'" 36.10 34.10 34.10 No Bid 

Elboco E314RN/E9314LCN 3900-ZS Spi~wak SU322 

Honor Guard Shirt MPD Emblem on left 

62 1 13341 Shoulder 20.00 20.00 34.70 34.70 36.75 36.75 36.75 - 36.75 34.75 34.75 No Bid 
p•~wak 

Elbe<o E314RN/E9314LCN 3SW78Z-86 SU31SZM/SU316ZM 

63 3 13342 Executive Coat, Navy, Fechheimer 34891 200.00 600.00 225.00 675.00 225.00 675.00 225.00 =- 675.00 225.00 675.00 No Bid 

Executive Trouser, Navy, Fechheimer 

64 3 13343 34291 69.95 209.85 75.00 225.00 75.00 225.00 75 00 "~ 225.00 75.00 225.00 No Bid 

Shirt Polo, MPD Badge Patch Shoulder 

65 1 13919 HS5124 on l eft Chest, Tab on left 36.95 36.95 32.50 32.50 32 .50 32.50 32.50 c. 32.50 32.50 32.50 No Bid 

Shirt Polo, Short Sleeve Whi t e Reflective 

66 35 13920 letters on Back HS5126 36.95 1,293.25 35.50 1,242 .50 35.50 1,242.50 35.50 ~· 1,242.50 35.50 1,242 .50 No Bid 

Shirt Polo, Black, Reflective Police on 

67 1 13921 Back, HS5124 36.95 36.95 35.50 35.50 35.50 35.50 35.50 ii;;:;' 35.50 35.50 35.50 No Bid 

Shirt Polo, Short Sleeve MPD Badge on 

l eft Chest HS5123, MPD Emblem on Both 

68 29 13818 Shoulders 34.95 1,013.55 32.50 942.50 32 .50 942.50 32 50 -. 942.50 32.50 942.50 No Bid 

Shirt Polo, l ong Sleeve, MPD Badge on 

l eft Chest HS5127, MPD Emblem on Both 

69 5 13819 Shoulders 36.95 184.75 35.50 177.50 35.50 177.50 35.50 __.;.,, 177.50 35.50 177.50 No Bid 

Sh irt Polo, l ong Sleeve, Black,MPD Badge 

on Chest HS5128, MPD Emblems on Both 

70 1 13820 Shoulders 36.9S 36.9S 35.50 35.50 35.50 35.50 35.50 --· 35.50 35.50 35.50 No Bid 



Awu..(de.rl 

f' I " I J I 1: I , . Ill I' 

Tabulation of Bid 

Bid #5159 Police Uniforms ' 

" ' 
Qty Item Description Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount 

71 1 13821 Shirt Polo, long Sleeve HS5130 36.95 36.95 35.50 35.50 35.50 35.50 35.50 -- 35.50 35.50 35.50 No Bid 

Shirt Long Sleeve, light Grey Animal 

72 15 15205 Control, liberty #722 MGY 29.95 449.25 28.92 433.80 28.92 433 .80 28.92 433.80 28 .92 433.80 No Bid 

Shirt Short Sleeve, light Grey, Animal 

73 15 15207 Control, liberty 732MGY 29.95 449.25 26.72 400.80 26.72 400.80 26.72 400.80 26.72 400.80 No Bid 

Trouser Tactical Cargo Pants, Black, 5.11 

74 19 15225 #74251 43.95 835.05 42.50 807.50 42 .50 807.50 42.50 
~-

807.50 42 .50 807.50 No Bid 

Trouser Tactical Cargo Pants, Khaki, 5.11 

75 18 15226 #74251 42.95 773.10 42 .50 765.00 42 .50 765.00 42 .50 ·'"- 765.00 42 .50 765.00 No Bid 

Trouser Tactical Cargo Pants, Black 

76 1 15273 Women 5.11 #74251 39.95 39.95 42 .50 42.50 42 .50 42.50 42.50 ~ 42.50 42 .50 42.50 No Bid 

Trouser Tactical Cargo Pants, Khaki , 5.11 

77 1 15274 #64358 39.95 39.95 42 .50 42 .50 42.50 42.50 42 .50 ~: 42.50 42 .50 42.50 No Bid 

Trouser Tactical Cargo Pants, Navy, 

78 1 15275 Women 5.11 #64358 39.95 39.95 42.50 42.50 42 .50 42.50 42 .50 };: __ 42.50 42 .50 42.50 No Bid 

Uniform Jacket, Midn ight w/MPD 

79 15 13825 Shoulder Emblems APX #HS3342 129.95 1,949.25 106.50 1,597.50 106.50 1,597.50 106.50 ;'I 1,597.50 106.50 1,597.50 No Bid 

Externa l Body Armor Vest Carrier Pro-Ops 

80 60 15279 HS3537 54.95 3,297.00 79 .95 4,797.00 43 .95 2,637.00 43 .95 --,,:;: 2,637.00 79.95 4,797.00 No Bid 
Elbeco V31148 Spiewak SCRPP93 

81 1 22221 Pro-Ops Base Layer, long Sleeve, HS5537 49 .95 49.95 32.10 32.10 28.00 28.00 28.00 28.00 36.75 36.75 No Bid 
ELBECO UVS101 Spiewak SCLPP35 



Qty 

82 1 

jl 7 j Not 7 "' I IK~p11 I ~ 1: H4~~ <; ..,<' .. ' 

"' .Spec-. " Spec. <!' 
0 It t "' .Spec . ~ Tabulation of Bid .:; 

" " l~ 
Bid #5159 Police Uniforms ' *'<; 

v " ... " ... ~-- ..... ,,,. 
Item Description Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount Total Amount 

22222 Pro-Ops Base Layer, Short Sleeve, HSS538 48.95 48.95 29.33 29.33 25.00 25.00 25 .00 25.00 32.20 32. 20 No Bid 
ELBECO UVS102 Spiewak SPLPP30 

Total Bid $ 110,926.75 110,926.75 $ 100,168.42 100,168.42 $ 101,433.18 101,433.1( $ 101 ,798.69 101,798.69 $ 99,938.64 99,938.64 

"-
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