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Description 

Qty Item Make/Model/Part Number Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount 

Eagle Eye/E E Bridge (2TB Hard Drive)/ Part 

1 1 17531 #325 450 No Bid 

Eagle Eye/E E Bridge (2TB Hard Drive)/Part 

2 1 17532 #334 550 No Bid 

3 1 17533 Eagle Eye/Managed Swch/Part #5 Port 85 No Bid 

4 1 17534 Eagle Eye/Managed Swch/Part #9 Port 165 No Bid 

5 1 17535 ADI/UPS/Part #OE-350V6 85 75 No Bid 

6 1 17536 Axis/Axis/Part #1435 LE 2.8-12 700 482.55 612.06 No Bid 

7 1 17537 Axis/ Axis/Part #1435 LE 8-22 700 522.85 No Bid 

8 1 17538 Axis/ Axis/Part #1428-E 950 804.79 No Bid 

Axis/Axis/Part #Pole Mount T91A47 110-

9 1 17539 400mm 85 63.65 82.11 No Bid 

10 1 17540 Hik Vision/Hik Vision/Part #Turrit 2.8/4/6/8 172.00 93 185 150.00 No Bid 

DS-2CD-3135 FWD-

DS-2CE56D8T-IT3 I 

Hik Vision/ Hik Vision/Part #Conduit Base 

11 1 17541 (CBM) 18.75 28 32 25.00 No Bid 

DS-1280ZJ-M 
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Description 

Qty Item Make/Model/Part Number Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount 

Meyer/Enclosure with 

12 1 17542 Backplate/Thermostat/Fan/Part #FC18610 425 325 .00 No Bid 

13 1 17543 Axis/IR Flood/Part #T90D30 750 643.69 826.00 

14 1 17544 Axis/IR Flood/Part #T90D20 465 361.70 476.00 No Bid 

15 1 17545 Axis/Wall & Pole Mount/Part #T90 110 42.50 No Bid 

16 1 17546 Axis/PTZ/Part #PS624-E MK 1160HZ 1950 1288.15 1626.00 No Bid 

17 1 17547 Axis/Midspan 1 Port/Part #T8124 65 256.98 329.00 No Bid 

18 1 17548 Ubiquiti/Wireless Antenna/Part #MS-16 79.99 85 75.00 No Bid 

NBE-MS-16(US) 

Ubiquiti/Wireless Antenna/Part #MS-HP 

19 1 17549 Phantom 98.75 52 90.00 No Bid 

NBE-MS-19(US) 

Ubiquiti/Wireless Antenna/Part #PBE SAC 

20 1 17550 300 123.99 115 110.00 No Bid 

NBE-MS-30(US) 

21 1 17551 Motorolla/Modem/Part #SB6141 61.99 95 65.00 No Bid 

Netgear/Modem/Part #AC1600Mod 
22 1 17552 C6250 158.99 145 169.00 No Bid 
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Description 

Qty Item Make/Model/Part Number Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount 

ProTec Video, LLC/PTV/Part #Pole Mount 

23 1 17553 (Base) 115 No Bid 

DuPage/Quick Release Hose Clamps/Part 

24 1 17554 #47895/QR248HS 12 37.00 No Bid 

10/box 

Platinum Tools/EZ-RJ45 Crimp Tool/Part 

26 1 17555 #100004C 57.50 50.00 85 43.95 52 .00 No Bid 

Plantinum Tools/EZ-RJ45/Part #TS-

27 1 17556 100003C 49.95 25.00 65 23 27.00 No Bid 

50/pack 

3M/Dual Lock General Purpose PSA (SO 

32 1 17557 YDS) 1 inch/Part #SJ3550 619.00 29 515.00 No Bid 

NOTE: Items 10, 18 and 20 No Sub 

Local Vendor Preference: Item 27 


