

	BID #	DAVISON OIL	RETIF OIL + FUEL	WARING OIL	WARD INTERNATIONAL TANKS LLC	AUTO ELECTRIC + CAB DBA SOUTHEAST DISTRIBUTION	HUNTER OIL CO. DID NOT MEET LOCAL SPEC
	5173	2% TRANS					
1.	13601 OIL S.W.30 BULK API - 5W GAL.	5.19 CAM2 C40911	8.59	5.40	NO BID	NO BID	6.21
2.	5264 TRACTOR - HYDRAULIC FLUID BULK GAL.	5.11 CAM2 C16511	9.55	5.18	NO BID	NO BID	5.38
3.	5258 OIL 30W. H.A. BULK GAL.	6.51 CAM2 C31255	13.19	8.15	NO BID	NO BID	7.86
4.	5261 OIL SERIES3 15W40 BULK C.J.H. GAL.	6.39 CAM2 C32011	11.34	7.19	NO BID	NO BID	6.65
5.	5271 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID BULK GAL.	5.82 CAM2 C90955	12.99	6.93	NO BID	NO BID	8.21
6.	5282 MULTIFAK LUBRICANT 30W90 400 LB. DRUM	446.00 CAM2 C50755	NO BID	574.20	NO BID	NO BID	746.20
7.	5321 OIL 40WT. SERIES 3 55 GAL. DRUM	359.00 CAM2 C31355	NO BID	541.31	NO BID	NO BID	616.00
8.	5313 GREASE EP00 DURALITH 400 LBS. 55 GAL. DRUM	NO BID	NO BID	1424.54 CHEVRON MULTIFAK EP00	NO BID	NO BID	1,102.00
9.	5314 OIL HEAT TRANSFER BULK GAL	NO BID	NO BID	16.18 CHEVRON HEAT TRANSFER HC	NO BID	NO BID	14.06
10.	5277 GREASE MULTIFAK EP2 400 LB. DRUM	569.60 CAM2 C22754	NO BID	1015.34	NO BID	NO BID	971.70

	DAVISON	RETF	WRING	WARD	AUTO ELECT	HUNTER	
11.	5268 OIL SAE15 30W HO 12 QT/CS CASE	2% TEAMS 47.25	NO BID 20.05 6 QTS/CS CHEVRON DEW 400-90	NO BID	NO BID	DID NOT MEET LOCAL SPEC. 29.94	
12.	5293 OIL 10W30 12/QT CASE	24.33 CAM2 C41412	NO BID 20.28 6 QTS/CS	NO BID	28.32	25.65	
13.	5284 GREASE MULTI FAK BR-2 24 TUBS. CASE	81.68 (60/CS) 1.6336 EA.	NO BID 21.21 (10/CS) 2.121 EA.	NO BID	73.68 3.07EA.	22.23	
14.	5263 OIL 15W40 12 QTS CASE	24.83 CAM2 C32012	NO BID 41.78	NO BID	33.84	28.20	
15.	5273 A.T.F. DEXTRAN III 12 QTS CASE	21.42 CAM2 C30912	NO BID 36.23	NO BID	29.40	31.77	
16.	14189 A.T.F. MERCURY(S) 12 QTS CASE	44.49 MOTORCRAFT	NO BID 29.34 6 QTS/CS	NO BID	52.08	42.96	
17.	5301 OIL 40WT 12 QTS CASE	47.25	NO BID 20.55 6 QTS/CS CHEVRON DEW 400-90	NO BID	NO BID	41.40	
18.	13954 A.T.F. MERCURY(S) BULK GAL	12.55 MOTORCRAFT	NO BID 18.75	NO BID	NO BID	11.02	
19.	13564 A.T.F. SYNTHETIC BULK TATF295 GAL	NO BID	NO BID 33.51	32.49 FLEETRITE FLTATF295D	NO BID	28.79	
20.	13565 A.T.F. SYNTHETIC BULK TATF295 CASE	NO BID	NO BID NO BID	122.64 FLEETRITE FLTATF295Q	NO BID	182.70	
21.	16106 DEXRON 6 ATF 12 QTS/ CASE CASE	35.22 CAM2 C29812	NO BID 75.98	NO BID	46.92	39.21	

DAVISON RETIF WARING WARD AUTO ELECT HUNTER

	2% TRANS					DID NOT MEET LOCAL SPEC.	
22.	13602 oil 5W30 API: SM 12 QTS/CASE CASE 1	24.33 CAM 2 C40912	NO BID	25.35	NO BID	29.04	25.17
23.	16126 oil 5W20 API: SM, SL, IL SAC GFN CASE 1 12/05	24.33 CAM 2 C40812	NO BID	25.35	NO BID	29.04	25.17
24.	16288 oil ATF MERCON CV MOTORCRAFT XTTOSLVC CASE	50.69 MOTORCRAFT	NO BID	75.98	NO BID	52.08	39.21

*Walt D...*