# **CITY OF MOBILE**

## **BID SHEET**

This is Not an Order

Mailing Address: P. O. Box 1948 Mobile, Alabama 36633 (251) 208-7434 Purchasing Department and Package Delivery: Government Plaza 4th Floor, Room S-408 205 Government St Mobile, Alabama 36644

DEAD TERMS AND CONDITIONS

READ TERMS AND CONDITIONS
ON REVERSE SIDE OF THIS PAGE
BEFORE BIDDING

nm		Buyer:	007						
Pl	ease quote the le		hich you will furr						
	BID NO.	DEPARTMENT		Commo	dities to be d	lelivered F.C	.B. Mol	oile to:	
1/2018	5168	Vari	ous		As	Specified			
d must be rece	ived and stamp	ed by the Purch	asing office not	later than:	10:30 AM				
ARTICLE				m. Attach	UNIT		_		Cents
At the option may be extend Quote pricing On items with indicate the sp will be entered All substitution of item specific discontinued. being indicate awarded item. If vendor state manufacturers will be entered It is the response	Mobile requests be. Pricing shall remote the City and led for two (2) add as a more than one (1) lecific item that you has a no bid on the construction on the construction of the constru	ids for the follow nain firm until 30 the successful Velitional one (1) yet specified on RF acceptable choice ou are bidding. Fat item.  The substitution and item to be substitution, may substitute that item mumber. Failure that item.	ving items as per June 2019. endor, the award ear periods.  Q. e.e., you must ailure to indicate  ar description has been without that item lose that  nust also state to indicate this e City with the						
City of Mobile  ONE SIGNED CORE SED ENVELOPE	OPY OF THIS BILE	)	State delive Firm Na	me		_ days o	of rec		2.0.
	The City of Mattached RFQ At the option may be extend Quote pricing On items with indicate the sp will be entered All substitution item specific discontinued, being indicate awarded item. If vendor state manufacturers will be entered It is the response necessary cata being bid. If so City of Mobile  ONE SIGNED COSED ENVELOPE  ONE SIGNED COSED ENVELOPE	Please quote the log BID NO.  1/2018  The City of Mobile requests be attached RFQ. Pricing shall remark the option of the City and may be extended for two (2) add Quote pricing & quote units as On items with more than one (1) indicate the specific item that yowill be entered as a no bid on the All substitutions must be indicated items.  If vendor states a vendor item manufacturers make and model will be entered as a no bid on the It is the responsibility of the vennecessary catalogs, samples or I being bid. If sample is request City of Mobile within 48 hours.  ONE SIGNED COPY OF THIS BIG SED ENVELOPE	Please quote the lowest price at w  BID NO.  DEPARTMENT  Type 10 DEPARTMENT  DEPARTMENT  The City of Mobile requests bids for the follow attached RFQ. Pricing shall remain firm until 30 At the option of the City and the successful Vernay be extended for two (2) additional one (1) ye Quote pricing & quote units as specified on RFO.  On items with more than one (1) acceptable choic indicate the specific item that you are bidding. Fawill be entered as a no bid on that item.  All substitutions must be indicated on RFQ ne of item specified. Indicate on your bid if an item discontinued. Vendors found to be substituting, we being indicated on this bid as a substitution, may awarded item.  If vendor states a vendor item number that item manufacturers make and model number. Failure will be entered as a no bid on that item.  It is the responsibility of the vendor to provide the necessary catalogs, samples or literature, to comp being bid. If sample is requested, it must be del City of Mobile within 48 hours.	Please quote the lowest price at which you will furn BID NO.  DEPARTMENT  JOINE  ARTICLES  Bid on this form ONLY. Make no changes on this for any additional information required to this form.  EQUIPMENT MEDICAL  The City of Mobile requests bids for the following items as per attached RFQ. Pricing shall remain firm until 30 June 2019.  At the option of the City and the successful Vendor, the award may be extended for two (2) additional one (1) year periods.  Quote pricing & quote units as specified on RFQ.  On items with more than one (1) acceptable choice, you must indicate the specific item that you are bidding. Failure to indicate will be entered as a no bid on that item.  All substitutions must be indicated on RFQ near description of item specified. Indicate on your bid if an item has been discontinued. Vendors found to be substituting, without that item being indicated on this bid as a substitution, may lose that awarded item.  If vendor states a vendor item number that item must also state manufacturers make and model number. Failure to indicate this will be entered as a no bid on that item.  It is the responsibility of the vendor to provide the City with the necessary catalogs, samples or literature, to compare the items being bid. If sample is requested, it must be delivered to the City of Mobile within 48 hours.  DESERVELOPE  State delivered in the sum of the provide the City with the necessary catalogs.  State delivered to the City of Mobile within 48 hours.	Please quote the lowest price at which you will furnish the article BID NO.  DEPARTMENT  Common DEPARTMENT  DEPARTMENT  Common DEPARTMENT  Department  ARTICLES  Bid on this form ONLY. Make no changes on this form. Attach any additional information required to this as a specified on RFQ.  On items with more than one (1) acceptable choice, you must indicate the specific item that you are bidding. Failure to indicate will be entered as a no bid on that item.  All substitutions must be indicated on RFQ near description of item specified. Indicate on your bid if an item has been discontinued. Vendors found to be substituting, without that item being indicated on this bid as a substitution, may lose that awarded item.  If vendor states a vendor item number that item must also state manufacturers make and model number. Failure to indicate this will be entered as a no bid on that item.  It is the responsibility of the vendor to provide the City with the necessary catalogs, samples or literature, to compare the items being bid. If sample is requested, it must be delivered to the City of Mobile within 48 hours.  DESIGNED COPY OF THIS BID State delivery time we firm Name  Typed Signature  Typed Signature	Please quote the lowest price at which you will furnish the articles listed    BID NO.   DEPARTMENT   Commodities to be of the commodities to be of the commodities to be of the commodities to be of the commodities of the c	Please quote the lowest price at which you will furnish the articles listed below    BID NO.   DEPARTMENT   Commodities to be delivered F.C.     As Specified   Commodities   Commodities	Please quote the lowest price at which you will furnish the articles listed below    BID NO.   DEPARTMENT   Commodities to be delivered F.O.B. Mot As Specified   Must be received and stamped by the Purchasing office not later than: 10:30 AM Friday, June 22,	Please quote the lowest price at which you will furnish the articles listed below    BID NO.

- 1. All quotations must be signed with the firm name and by an authorized officer or employee.
- 2. Verify your bid before submission as it cannot be withdrawn or corrected after being opened. In case of error in extension of prices, the unit price will govern.
- 3. If you do not bid, return this sheet and state reason. Otherwise, your name may be removed from our mailing list.
- 4. The right is reserved to reject any, or all quotations, or any portions thereof, and to waive technicalities if deemed to be in the interest of the City of Mobile.
- 5. This bid shall not be reassignable except by written approval of the Purchasing Agent of the City of Mobile.
- 6. State brand and model number of each item. All items bid must be new and latest model unless otherwise specified.
- 7. If bid results are desired, enclose a self-addressed and stamped envelope with your bid. (All or None bids only)
- 8. Do not include Federal Excise Tax as exemption certificate will be issued in lieu of same. The City is exempt from the Alabama and City sales taxes.
- 9. PRICES ARE TO BE FIRM AND F.O.B. DESTINATION UNLESS OTHERWISE REQUESTED.
- BID WILL BE AWARDED ON ALL OR NONE BASIS UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED.
- 11. Bids received after specified time will be returned un-opened.
- 12. Failure to observe stated instructions and conditions will constitute grounds for rejection of your bid.
- 13. Furnish literature, specifications, drawings, photographs, etc., as applicable with the items bid.
- 14. Vendor May be required to obtain City of Mobile Business License as applicable to City of Mobile Municipal Code Section 34-50. For Business License inquiry contact the Revenue Department at (251) 208-7461 or cityofmobile.org/taxes.php.
- 15. If a bid bond is required in the published specifications, see below: Each Bid Shall be Accompanied By A Cashier's Check, Certified Check, Bank Draft Or Bid Bond For the Sum Of Five (5) Percent Of The Amount Bid, Made Payable To The City Of Mobile And Certified By A Reputable Banking Institution. All Checks Shall Be Returned Promptly, Except The Check Of The Successful Bidder, Which Shall Be Returned After Fulfilling The Bid.
- 16. Contracts in excess of \$50,000 require that the successful bidder make every possible effort to have at least fifteen (15) percent of the total value of the contract performed by socially and economically disadvantaged individuals.
- 17. All bids/bid envelopes must have the bid number noted on the front. Bids that arrive unmarked and are opened in error shall be returned to vendor as an unacceptable bid.
- 18. If successful vendor's principal place of business is out-of-state, vendor may be required to have a Certificate of Authority to do business in the State of Alabama from the Alabama Secretary of State prior to issuance of a Purchase Order. Vendors are solely responsible for consulting with the Secretary of State to determine whether a Certificate is required. See <a href="https://www.sos.alabama.gov/BusinessServices/ForeignCorps.aspx">www.sos.alabama.gov/BusinessServices/ForeignCorps.aspx</a>. Please note that the time between application for and issuance of a Certificate of Authority may be several weeks.
- 19. Vendors do not need a City of Mobile Business License or Certificate of Authority from the Alabama Secretary of State to submit a bid, but will need to obtain the Business License and Certificate of Authority, if applicable, prior to issuance of a Purchase Order

### **BID CONTINUATION SHEET**

Page \_\_\_\_\_ of \_\_\_\_

JUANTITY	Bid on this form ONLY. Make no changes on this form. Addit		UNIT PR	EXTENSION		
ZOANTITY	ARTICLES formation to be submitted on separate sheet and attached h	nereto. UNIT	Dollars	Cents	Dollars	Cents
	Page 2 of 3					
	The City reserves the right to reject any item bid by a vendor due to lack of information in order to compare item (i.e.: no catalogs, literature or specifications). Do not send catalog or literature unless requested.					
	The City reserves the right to reject an item from contract if that item fails to perform as needed or does not meet the best needs of the City of Mobile.					
	All quantities purchased will be based on an as needed basis by City Department.					
	All items/orders to be delivered to departments.					
	All prices quoted are to be delivered prices F.O.B. Mobile.					
	State any special conditions or ordering instructions. (Pay particular attention to instruction #9 on back of page 1).					
	The City will attempt to send purchase orders for higher amounts; however, due to computerized issuance of P.O.'s, some will be for low dollar amounts. Vendor must accept all (large & small) purchase orders for items awarded.					
	<b>Please note:</b> In an effort to update our bid files, vendor(s) who fail to bid may be removed from medical equipment listings.					
	If you do not wish to bid on the following categories, yet wish to remain on bid list for items other than those on the following pages, you must so notify the City of Mobile Purchasing Department in writing as to specific items that you wish to be listed for, otherwise removal may occur.					
	No Bid Bond is required.					
	All vendors will be required to provide verification of enrollment in the E-Verify program. Additional information may be found at <a href="http://immigration.alabama.gov/">http://immigration.alabama.gov/</a>					
	If the successful vendor's principal place of business is out-of-state, vendor may be required to have a Certificate of Authority to do business in the State of Alabama from the Secretary of State prior to issuance of a Purchase Order.					
			то	TAL		+

RETURN ONE SIGNED COPY OF THIS QUOTATION IN ENCLOSED ENVELOPE

READ ABOVE INSTRUCTIONS BEFORE QUOTING

Firm Name	
D	

We will allow a discount \_\_\_\_\_\_ % 20 days from date of receipt of goods and correct invoice of completed order.

### **BID CONTINUATION SHEET**

_				
Page	 	ot.		

	Bid on this form ONLY. Make no changes on this form. Additional in-		UNIT PR	CE	EXTENSION	
PULLITARUE	ARTICLES formation to be submitted on separate sheet and attached hereto.	UNIT	Dollars	Cents	Dollars	Cents
	Page 3 of 3					
	rage 3 01 3					
	Vendors are solely responsible for consulting with the Secretary of					
	State to determine whether a Certificate is required.					
	See: www.sos.alabama.gov/BusinessServices/ForeignCorps.aspx.					
	Please note that the time between application for the issuance of a		*			
	Certificate of Authority may be several weeks.					
	Upon notification, vendor will have 10 business days to provide the					
	Certificate of Authority and the E-Verify numbers to the					
	Purchasing Department before award can be completed.					
	(Vendors will possibly need to pay the expedite fee to meet this					
	requirement because application is not sufficient. We must have a					
	copy of the certificate with your Company ID number).					
	copy of the continuate with your company 12 hamosty.					
	Vendors do not need a City of Mobile Business License or Certificate					
	of Authority from the Alabama Secretary of State, nor the E-Verify for					
	certification to submit a bid, but will need to obtain the Business License					
	and Certificate of Authority verification and/or provide the E-Verify					1
	Certification, if applicable, prior to issuance of a Purchase Order.					
	Commount in approache, prior to issuants of a raisonass of an					
	Be sure to sign and return this page including the terms and conditions					
	on the reverse of page 1.					
	on the reverse of page 1.					
	THE CITY OF MOBILE DOES NOT ACCEPT VENDOR'S TERMS					
	AND CONDITIONS.					
	TO BE AWARDED ON AN ITEM BASIS					
	The Purchasing Department is seeking to make this bid process					
	more acceptable for all parties involved. Recommendations for					
	changes or modifications that could be incorporated into the next	İ				
	Industrial and Safety Supply bid should be submitted under					
	separate cover. Do not submit with or on this bid.					
	separate cover. Bo not submit with or on this ord.					
	State of Alabama Local Vendor Preference Law 41-16-50 (a) and					
	(d) will apply to this purchase.					
	Remember to return this original bid sheet signed along with					
	attached RFQ.					
	annened 19 Å.					
	For additional information contact:					
	City of Mobile Purchasing					
	Jim Neese (Buyer) @ (251) 208-7401			T A 1		
			10	TAL		

RETURN ONE SIGNED COPY OF THIS QUOTATION READ ABOVE INSTRUCTIONS BEFORE QUOTING IN ENCLOSED ENVELOPE

Firm Name	

					Ву
*** **					

We will allow a discount \_\_\_\_\_\_ % 20 days from date of receipt of goods and correct invoice of completed order.

# RFQ FOR MEDICAL BID

	<u>ITEM</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>UOM</u>	PRICE
1	1000	BAGS C-COLLAR, CARRYING BAG, LAERDAL #98 07 00.	EACH	\$
2	2078	EYE WASH, 4 OZ., US 3020.	EACH	\$
3	2080	EYE DROPS, TETRASINE, 1/2 OZ ., ARTIFICIAL TEARS.	вотт	\$
4	4264	KENDRICK FOREHEAD/CHIN RESTRAINTS FOR KED EXTRICATION DEVICE MODEL 125 FERNO PART #039-02 01-00.	EACH	\$
5	4339	PUNCH WINDOW, SPRING LOADED, ADJUSTABLE, MATRX #AN360.	EACH	\$
6	4622	SCISSORS EMT, STAINLESS STEEL, AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC (ADC) MEDICUT, 7 1/4", #320NY, NEON YELLOW HANDLE, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
7	4887	BACKBOARD POLYETHYLENE PLASTIC, RED, IMPRINTED: MOBILE FIRE RESCUE, 251-208-7351; CAPACITY 500 LBS., 22 HANDHOLDS, NAJO REDIWIDE.	EACH	\$
8	6864	FORCEPS ADULT 9 3/4", MAGILIL AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC #316, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$

9	6870	SPLINT TRACTION, ADULT, HARE TYPE ONLY.	EACH	\$
10	6871	BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORPORATION (ADC), BLACK ENAMEL 300 MMHG MANOMETER, CHROME PLATED BRASS AIR RELEASE VALVE LEATHERETTE CARRYING CASE,		
		ADULT, ADC #760-11ABK, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
11	6872	V-VAC STARTER KIT, ONE HAND APPLICATION, SUCTION UNIT, ADAPTER TIP, INSTRUCTIONS, LAERDAL MEDICAL,		
		NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
12	6878	BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORPORATION (ADC), BLACK ENAMEL 300 MMHG MANOMETER, CHROME PLATED BRASS AIR RELEASE VALVE LEATHERETTE CARRYING CASE, PEDIATRIC, (CHILD) ADC #760-9CBK,		
		NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
13	6887	THOMAS TUBE HOLDER, ADULT, 25 PER BOX, PART #500, MATRX #TH04500.	вох	\$
14	6888	THOMAS TUBE HOLDER, PEDI, 25 PER BOX, PART #400.	вох	\$
15	6893	BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORPORATION (ADC), BLACK ENAMEL 300 MMHG MANOMETER, CHROME PLATED BRASS		

		AIR RELEASE VALVE, LEATHERETTE CARRYING CASE, THIGH, ADC #760-13TBK, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
16	6901	SUCTION UNIT, PORTABLE, LAERDAL COMPACT SUCTION UNIT 4, 800 ML DISPOSABLE CANISTER, PATIENT TUBE 6', AC/DC ADAPTER CHARGER, W/AC CORD, BATTERY, DIRECTIONS, CARRY BAG, (FOR 800ML VERSION), WIRE STAND, VACUUM TUBE, LCSU 4 MAIN UNIT,		
		NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
17	6906	FAST STRAP, MEDSPEC, T-STYLE, BLUE, PRODUCT #113820, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
18	6907	IMMOBILIZER FERNO PEDI-PAC FULL BODY IMMOBILIZATION DEVICE, FERNO WASHINGTON, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
19	6909	STRETCHER SCOOP, FERNO, EXL SCOOP STRETCHER WITH PINS, INCLUDES RESTRAINTS, NO SUBS.	EACH	¢
		RESTRAINTS, NO SUBS.	EACH	Ş
20	6915	ALCOHOL PREP PADS, STERILE, MEDIUM, 2-PLY, 70% ISOPROPYL ALCOHOL, MEDLINE, 200/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	Ś
21	6919	RING CUTTER, CHROME HANDLE WITH SAFETY LEVER, LARGE THUMBSCREW AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC #380, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
22	6932	BOX MEDICAL, FOR FIREMEDICS, PLANO #747-004 XL 3 TRAY, 3 PULLOUT DRAWERS,		·

		EXTRA DEEP BOTTOM, 20.83" X 11.5" X 12.75", NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
23	6940	REEVES SLEEVES, #SS 31220.	EACH	\$
24	6944	OB KITS, 12 EACH/CASE.	DOZEN	\$
25	6951	BAGS RED, BIO MEDICAL WASTE BAGS, WITH SYMBOL & WORDS IN BLACK, MEET A.S.T.M. DART TEST REQUIREMENTS, 25 X 34, 20 GAL., 50 EACH PER BOX, 4 BOXES PER CASE.	CASE	\$
26	6966	THERMOMETER WELCH ALLYN. BRAUN THERMOSCAN PRO 6000 EAR THERMOMETER, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
27	6967	BRAUN THERMOSCAN PRO 6000 EAR THERMOMETER DISPOSABLE PROBE COVERS (QTY. 5000): 1 CASE CONTAINS 25 SHELF BOXES, EACH SHELF BOX CONTAINS 10 PACKS, 20 COVERS PER PACK, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
28	6969	INTUBATION DETECTORS, TUBE CHECK AMBU INC #000 172 001, WOLFETORY #EID 100, 20 UNITS PER CASE.	CASE	\$
29	6970	GLOVES ULTRA ONE, HIGH RISK, MEDIUM, MICROFLEX #UL-315-MED, (500/CASE), NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
30	6972	GLOVES ULTRA ONE, HIGH RISK, EXTRA LARGE, MICROFLEX #UL-315-XL, (500/CS),		

		NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
31	6973	GLOVES ULTRA ONE, HIGH RISK, LARGE, MICROFLEX #UL-315-L, (500/CASE) NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
32	6974	GLOVES ULTRA ONE, HIGH RISK, SMALL, MICROFLEX #UL-315-S, (500/CASE) NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
33	9682	BAG EMESIS, SICKNESS CLEAN-UP, CLEAN SACK, GRADUATED MARKING TO MEASURE OZ. AND CC/ML, BLUE IN COLOR, MEDLINE #NON80328, 144/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
34	13194	IMMOBILIZER HEAD, DISPOSABLE, 15"X 4"X 3", 5.0 OZ URATHANE FOAM ADHESIVE FASTENER, 100% X-RAY TRANSLUCENT. STA-BLOCK 260975, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
35	13205	STETHOSCOPE PLATINUM CLINICIAN ADSCOPE 612, ADULT, OVERALL LENGTH 30.5", ADC ITEM 612BK, COLOR-BLACK, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
36	13269	SHARPS-A-GATOR, SMALL, 5 QUART, PACKED 30 PER CASE, TYCO.HEALTHCARE/KENDALL #4838-R, REF #31144-36 #31144010.	CASE	\$
37	13526	GLOVES EXAM, STERLING NITRILE-XTRA, POWDER FREE, KIMBERLY CLARK KC300, 12" LENGTH, 100 PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER		

		CASE, MEDIUM #53139, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
38	13607	TUBE TRACHEAL, ENDOTROL ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH CONTROLLABLE TIP, 7.0MM, 28FR. MALLINCKRODT, 10 PER BOX, NO SUBS.	BOX	\$
39	13609	PILLOW DISPOSABLE, 16" X 22", 10 OZ., LATEX FREE, 12/CASE, MEDLINE #NON24391, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
40	13611	SOAP ANTIMICROBIAL, LIQUID, DIAL PROFESSIONAL GOLD PUMP 16 OZ OZ. 12/CASE, 1 NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
41	13612	WIPES ANTISEPTIC, SANI HANDS ALC, PDI PRODUCT, INDIVIDUAL PACKETS, CONTAINS 65.9% ETHYL ALCOHOL WITH MOISTURIZING ALOE, GLYCERIN & VITAMIN E, 100/BOX, 10 BOXES/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
42	13613	MASK FLUIDSHIELD, FOG FREE PROCEDURE MASK W/WRAP AROUND SPLASHGUARD VISOR, PLEAT-STYLE 2/EARLOOPS, FOAM BAND, ORANGE, 2 BOXES OF 12/CASE, KIMBERLY CLARK 47147, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
43	13614	CATHETER IV, 24 GAUGE X 3/4". STRAIGHT, FEP, INTROCAN SAFETY IV CATHETERS, 200/CASE, BRAUN 4252500, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
44	13615	CATHETER IV, 22 GAUGE X 1", STRAIGHT, FEP, INTROCAN SAFETY IV CATHETERS,		

		200/CASE, BRAUN 4252519, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
45	13616	CATHETER IV, 20 GAUGE X 1-1/4", STRAIGHT, FEP, INTROCAN SAFETY IV CATHETERS, 200/CASE, BRAUN 4252535,	CASE	
		NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
46	13617	CATHETER IV, 18 GAUGE X 1-1/4", STRAIGHT, FEP, INTROCAN SAFETY IV CATHETERS, 200/CASE, BRAUN 4252560,		
		NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
47	13618	CATHETER IV, 16 GAUGE X 1-1/4", , STRAIGHT, FEP, INTROCAN SAFETY IV CATHETERS 200/CASE, BRAUN, 4252586,		
		NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
48	13619	CATHETER IV, 14 GAUGE X 1-1/4", STRAIGHT, FEP, INTROCAN SAFETY IV CATHETERS. 200/CASE, BRAUN 4151890, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
49	13624	STRIPS BLOOD GLUCOSE AND KETONE MONITORING STRIPS, 50/BOX, 12 BOXES/CASE, ABBOTT MEDI-SENSE PRECISION XTRA BLOOD GLUCOSE STRIPS #99695-35, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
50	13627	RESUSCITATOR AMBU SPUR II BAG, ADULT, WITH BAR RESERVOIR, 12/CASE AMBU 520 21100, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
51	13628	RUSUSCITATOR AMBU SPUR II BAG, PEDIATRIC, WITH BAG RESERVOIR, 12/CASE,		

		AMBU 530 213 000B, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
52	13629	RESUSCITATOR AMBU SPUR II BAG, INFANT, WITH BAG RESERVOIR, 12/CASE, AMBU 540 211 000, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
53	13634	IV STARTER KIT, LATEX FREE, INCLUDES: ALCOHOL PREP PAD, PVP AMPULE, DRESSING 2 GAUZE, TOURNIQUET, TAPE, PACKED 100/BOX, MEDLINE DYND740888, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
54	13637	SODIUM CHLORIDE, 0.9% SODIUM CHLORIDE INJECTION USP 250 ML BAG, 24/CASE, BRAND OR MANUFACTURER MAY BE BRAUN, BAXTER OR HOSPIRA, THESE BRANDS ONLY, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
55	13638	SODIUM CHLORIDE, 0.9% SODIUM CHLORIDE INJECTION USP, 1000 ML BAG, 12/CASE, BRAND OR MANUFACTURER MAY BE BRAUN, BAXTER OR HOSPIRA, THESE BRANDS ONLY, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
56	13639	EZ-10 NEEDLE SET 25MM, EACH SET INCLUDES A 15 GAUGE STERILE EZ-10 NEEDLE, EZ-CONNECT, PATIENT WRIST BAND, AND NEEDLE VISE SHARPS BLOCK, 5/BOX, ITEM #9001-VC-005, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
57	13643	GLOVES, EXAM, STERLING NITRILE-XTRA, POWDER FREE, KIMBERLY CLARK KC300, 12" LENGTH, 100 PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE, SMALL #53138, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$

58	14185	GLOVES, EXAM, STERLING NITRILE-XTRA POWDER FREE, KIMBERLY CLARK KC300, 12" LENGTH, 100 PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE, LARGE #53140, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
59	14186	GLOVES EXAM, STERLING NITRILE-XTRA, POWDER FREE, KIMBERLY CLARK KC300,		
		12" LENGTH, 100 PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE, EXTRA-LARGE #53141, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
60	15002	CANNULA LEVER LOCK, #BF303370,		
		100 PER BOX.	BOX	\$
61	15003	AIRWAY KING LTS-D, SUPRAGLOTTIC AIRWAY KIT SIZE 3, KLTSD423, 10/CASE,		
		NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
62	16000	MONITOR DEFIBRILATION PADS, STAT		
		PADZ ADULT MULTI-FUNCTION		
		ELECTRODES, 12 PAIR PER CASE,		
		ZOLL #8900-4003. NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
63	16001	MONITOR DEFIBRILATION PADS, PEDIC		
		PADZ PEDIATRIC MULTI-FUNCTION		
		ELECTRODES, 6 PAIR PER CASE,		
		ZOLL #8900-2065. NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
64	16002	MONITOR DEFIBRILATION PADS, STAT		
		PADZ II, ADULT MULTI-FUNCTION		
		ELECTRODES, 12 PAIR PER CASE, ,		
		ZOLL #8900-0802-01. NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
65	16005	BATTERY M SERIES STANDARD		

		BATTERY, EACH ZOLL #800-299-01.	EACH	\$
66	16007	CORD POWER CORD EXTENSION CABLE (PIGTAIL), 12 INCHES, ZOLL OLD #8000-0743, NEW #8000-0730.	EACH	\$
67	16040	EZ-10 NEEDLE SET 45MM, EACH SET INCLUDES A 15 GAUGE STERILE EZ-10 NEEDLE, EZ-CONNECT, PATIENT WRIST BAND AND NEEDLE VISE SHARPS BLOCK, 5/BOX, ITEM #9079-VC-005, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
		3, BOX, 11EW #3073 VC 003, 140 3003.	БОХ	Ÿ
68	16042	IV ADMINISTRATION SET, 60 DROP, 83" TUBING, NEEDLELESS INJECTION SITE, 50 PER CASE, AMSINO IV#608306,	CASE	
		NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
69	16043	IV ADMINISTRATION SET, 10 DROP, 83" TUBING, 2 INJECTION SITES, LATEX FREE, 50 PER CASE, AMSINO IV #108306,		
		NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
70	16044	IV EXTENSION SET WITH AMSAFE INJECTION SITE, NEEDLELESS INJECTION SITE, LATEX FREE, 100 PER CASE, AMSINO IV EXTENSION #AE3108, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
71	16051	EZ-10 NEEDLE SET 15MM, EACH SET INCLUDES A 15 GAUGE STERILE EZ-10 NEEDLE, EZ-CONNECT, PATIENT WRIST BAND AND NEEDLE VISE SHARPS BLOCK,		
		5/BOX, ITEM #9018-VC-005, NO SUBS.	BOX	\$

72	16052	CLEANER HAND SANITIZER,		
		MOISTURIZING FOAM, KLEENEX ULTRA,		
		CLEAR, 1.5FL OZ BOTTLE, 24 BOTTLES		
			CACE	ė
		PER CASE, ITEM #34604, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
72	16053	CLEANED HAND CANITIZED		
73	10023	CLEANER HAND SANITIZER,		
		MOISTURIZING FOAM, KLEENEX ULTRA,		
		CLEAR, 16 OZ BOTTLE, 6 BOTTLES		
		PER CASE. ITEM #34618, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
74	16055	ET TUBE INTRODUCER, BOUGIE-TO-GO,		
		ADULT WITH COUDE TIP, 15 FR, 60 MM,		
		10 PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
		10.121.007, 110.0000		τ
75	16057	ELECTRODES MONITORING, AMBU EKG		
		ELECTRODE, BLUE SENSOR SP, HIGHLY		
		CONDUCTIVE WET GEL, GENTLE TO SKIN,		
		•	DACK	\$
		50 PER PACK, #AMBU SP 50, NO SUBS.	PACK	\$
76	16058	IV PRESSSURE INFUSER, INFUSIT		
70	10030			
		DISPOSABLE PRESSURE INFUSER WITH		
		THUMBWHEEL, MODEL ZIT 1002,		
		10 PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
	16050	COLLAR CERVICAL INFANT FORER		
77	16059	COLLAR CERVICAL, INFANT, 50 PER		
		CASE, AMBU #264-501, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
78	16060	COLLAR CERVICAL, PEDIATRIC, 50 PER		
70	10000		CACE	A
		CASE, AMBU #264-502, NO SUBS.	CASE	>
79	16061	COLLAR CERVICAL NECKLESS, 50 PER		
, ,	10001	1 Salar	CASE	\$
		CASE, AMBU #264-503, NO SUBS.	CASE	2
80	16062	COLLAR CERVICAL, SHORT, 50 PER		
0.0	10002	2022 11 22111012, 3110111, 301211		

		CASE, AMBU #264-504, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
81	16063	COLLAR CERVICAL, REGULAR, 50 PER CASE, AMBU #264-505, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
82	16064	COLLAR CERVICAL, TALL, 50 PER CASE, AMBU #264-506, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
83	16065	TUBE TRACHEAL, RUSCH FLEXI-SET 2.5 MM, UNCUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET AND MURPHY EYE, RUSCH #506525, 10 EACH PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
84	16066	TUBE TRACHEAL, RUSCH FLEXI-SET 3.0 MM, UNCUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET AND MURPHY EYE, RUSCH #506530, 10 EACH PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
85	16068	TUBE TRACHEAL, RUSCH FLEXI-SET 4.0 MM, UNCUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET AND MURPHY EYE, RUSCH #506540, 10 EACH PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
86	16069	TUBE TRACHEAL, RUSCH FLEXI-SET 5.0 MM, CUFFED ENDOTRACHE AL TUBE WITH STYLET AND MURPHY EYE, RUSCH #504550, 10 EACH PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
87	16070	TUBE TRACHEAL, RUSCH FLIEXI-SET 6.0 MM, CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL		

		TUBE WITH STYLET AND MURPHY EYE, RUSCH #504560, 10 EACH PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
88	16071	TUBE TRACHEAL, RUSCH FLEXI-SET 7.0 MM, CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET AND MURPHY EYE, RUSCH # 504570, 10 EACH PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
89	16072	TUBE TRACHEAL, RUSCH FLEXI-SET 8.0 MM, CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET AND MURPHY EYE, RUSCH #504580, 10 EACH PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
90	16073	TUBE TRACHEAL, RUSCH FLEXI-SET 9.0 MM, CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET AND MURPHY EYE, RUSCH #504590, 10 EACH PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
91	16082	STRETCHER: FERNO MODEL 9, ADJUSTABLE BACKREST EMERGENCY STRETCHER, FOLDING, INCLUDES PATIENT RESTRAINTS, 4" WHEELS @ HEAD END WITH STATIONARY POSTS @ FOOT END, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
92	16083	EZ-10 DRIVER, VASCULAR ACCESS DRIVER FOR USE WITH EZ-10 VASCULAR ACCESS SYSTEM AND EZ-10 NEEDLE SETS, SPECS POWER: SEAL LITHIUM DIMENSIONS: 6.5" X 4.5" X 2.5' (16.5CM x 11.4CM x		

		6.4CM) WEIGHT: 11.1OZ (315 GRAMS) ITEM #9058, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
93	16084	BOX: NARCOTIC BOX WITH LOCK AND KEYS, 6.25"W X 7.25"L X 1.875"H,		
		CNB-100.	EACH	\$
94	16086	BOX MEDICAL, FLAMBEAU 2072.	EACH	\$
95	16145	PENLIGHT DISPOSABLE, DIAGNOSTIC		
		PENLIGHT WITH PUPIL GAUGE, 6 EACH	DACK	ć
		PER PACK, CURAFLEX, NO SUBS.	PACK	\$
96	16146	SPLINT MULTI-PURPOSE UNIVERSAL		
		WITH SELF-ADHERENT ADHESIVE WRAP,		
		ACTISPLINT WITH SENSI-WRAP, DYNAREX,		
		ROLLED SPLINT 4.5" X 36" WITH SENSI-	CASE	ć
		WRAP 2" X 5 YDS., BLACK, 50/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
97	16147	DRESSING SAM CHEST SEAL DRESSING,		
		9.2" X 7.6", DESIGNED FOR OPEN CHEST		
		WOUNDS, LARGE COVERAGE AREA, 2		
		DRESSINGS PER PACK (NON-VALVE		
		VERSION), LATEX FREE, TRANSPARENT 5" X 9" PAD, SAM #CS062011, NO SUBS.	PACK	\$
		5 A 5 TAD, SANT #CS002011, NO 3003.	TACK	Υ
98	16148	CO2 INDICATOR, FENEM CO2 INDICATOR		
		ATTACHES TO EXHALATION PORT OF		
		RESUSCITATOR BAG, 30 MM I.D., BODY		
		MASS RANGE >1 KG, 2 YEAR SHELF LIFE, LATEX-FREE, 10 EACH PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
		2.1.2. Thee, 10 2.1011 En 301, 110 3003.	2011	Υ
99	16171	DRESSING MULTI-TRAUMA DRESSING,		

		12" X 30" ONE STERILE DRESSING PER POUCH, LATEX-FREE, 50 PER CASE, DYNAREX, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
100	16172	BATTERY RECHARGABLE, LAERDAL HIGH CAPACITY RECHARGABLE BATTERY, 12 VOLT DC NIMH FOR LAERDAL COMPACT SUCTION UNIT, 800 ML, LAERDAL ITEM #88007005, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
101	16174	BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, AMERICAN DIAGNOTIC CORPORATION (ADC), BLACK ENAMEL 300 MMHG MANOMETER, CHROMI PLATED BRASS AIR RELEASE VALVE, LEATHERETTE CARRYING CASE, INFANT,		
		ADC #760-71BK, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
102	16175	HANDLE V-VAC, LAERDAL V-VAC REPLACEMENT HANDLE, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
103	16176	CONNECTOR, LAERDAL V-VAC SUCTION UNIT DOUBLE MALE CONNECTORS, PACK OF 10 EACH, NO SUBS.	PACK	\$
104	16177	ADAPTER TIPS, LAERDAL V-VAC REPLACEMENT ADAPTAR TIPS, SUCTION UNIT, 4 EACH PER PACK, NO SUBS.	PACK	\$
105	16178	CATHETERS LAERDAL V-VAC CATHETERS, SHORT, SUCTION UNIT, 8", 18FR, 4 EACH PER PACK, NO SUBS.	PACK	\$
106	16179	CARTRIDGE LAERDAL V-VAC REPLACEMENT CARTRIDGE FOR SUCTION		

		UNIT, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
107	16182	INFUSION SET, KAWASUMI SMALL VEIN		
		INFUSION SET, STANDARD, LATEX-FREE,		
		23 GAUGE NEEDLE, 3/4" LENGTH, TUBING		
		LENGTH 3.5", LUER LOCK, KAWASUMI		
	,	D3KI-23G, 50/BOX, NO SUBS.	BOX	\$
108	16183	BITE BLOCK - TONGUE DEPRESSOR,		*
		UNBREAKABLE, ONE PIECE, EACH		
		PACKAGED IN SANITARY BAG.	EACH	\$
109	16186	GAUZE PETROLATUM, NON-ADHERING,		
		LATEX FREE, FOIL PACKAGE, STERILE,		
		3" X 9", NO SUBS.	BOX	\$
110	16187	BANDAGE CONFORMING, GAUZE,		
		SOF-FORM, STERILE, 4" X 75" MEDLINE,		
		12/BOX, NO SUBS.	BOX	\$
111	16189	ICE PACK, FILLABLE, SMALL WITH		
		VELCRO STRAPS, SECURE-ALL LATEX		
		FREE, 5" X 12", 15 PER BOX, KIMBERLY		
		CLARK #33595, NO SUBS.	BOX	\$
112	16190	TAGS TRIAGE, REPLACEMENT ARIZONA		
		TRIAGE WITH CABLE TIES, 35 PER PACK,		
		REF: BOUNDTREE #441260, NO SUBS	PACK	\$
113	16191	WATER STERILE FOR IRRIGATION, USP		
		SEALED OUTER CLOSURE, STERILE SCREW		
		ON INNER CAP, BAXTER, 500 ML, 18 PER		
		CASE, NDC #0338-0004-03.	CASE	\$

114	16216	NEEDLE HYPODERMIC, REGULAR BEVEL, 18G X 1 1/2", STERILE, 100/BOX, BECTON DICKINSON, REF: BOUNDTREE ITEM T305196. NO SUBS	вох	\$
115	16217	NEEDLE HYPODERMIC, REGULAR BEVEL, 21G X 1 1/2", STERILE, 100/BOX, BECTON DICKINSON, REF: BOUNTREE ITEM 1641-16721, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
116	16218	CANNULA INTERLINK VIAL ACCESS, 15 GAUGE, NEEDLESS ACCESS OF A SINGLE DOSE VIAL, BECTON DICKINSON 100/BOX, REF: BOUNDTREE ITEM 353367, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
117	16220	EXTENSION SET, STANDARD BORE, FEMALE LUER LOCK, FLOW CONTROLLER, 1 SLIDE CLAMP, 1 AMSAFE NEEDLE-FREE Y SITE, ROTATING MALE LUER LOCK, PE POLY POUCH, PRIMING VOLUME: 4.0 ML, 20" STANDARD BORE TUBING, 50/CASE, AMSINO AFS106, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
118	16221	MASK, 3M HEALTH CARE PARTICULATE RESPIRATOR AND SURGICAL MASK 1860 NIOSH APPROVED N95, FDA CLEARED, FLUID RESISTANT AND DISPOSABLE, 120/CASE, 3M ITEM ID70070612364, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
119	16222	LANCET, ACCU-CHEK SAFE-T-PRO LANCET SINGLE USE, 200/BOX, ROUCHE DIAGNOSTICS, REF: BOUNDTREE #170951,		

		NO SUBS.	вох	\$
120	16242	SEAL DRAW TIGHT, RED, AVERAGE BREAKING STRENGTH 15 LB., PRINTABLE AREA (CAN BE WRITTEN ON W/ PERMANENT MARKER), MADE OF NYLON, 100/PKG, 7 - 7/8" LENGTH, HEALTH CARE LOGISTICS, #7951, NO SUBS.		\$
121	16243	SEAL DRAW TIGHT, YELLOW, AVERAGE BREAKING STRENGTH 15 LB., PRINTABLE AREA (CAN BE WRITTEN ON W/ PERMANENT MARKER) MADE OF NYLON, 100/PKG., 7-7/8" LENGTH, HEALTH CARE LOGISTICS #7952, NO SUBS.	PKG	\$
122	16244	SEAL DRAW TIGHT, BLUE, AVERAGE BREAKING STRENGTH 15 LB., PRINTABLE AREA (CAN BE WRITTEN ON W/ PERMANENT MARKER), MADE OF NYLON, 100/PKG., 7-7/8" LENGTH, HEALTH CARE LOGISTICS #7953, NO SUBS.	PKG	\$
123	16250	LUBRICANT STERILE LUBRICATING JELLY, FOIL PACK, 2.7 GRAM, MEDLINE, 144/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
124	16251	PADS ABDOMINAL, ABD PADS, STERILE LATEX FREE, 5" X 9", MEDLINE, 25/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
125	16252	BANDAGE NON-STERILE MATRIX ELASTIC BANDAGES, 4" X 5 YD., VELCRO, LATEX FREE, 10/BOX, MEDLINE #MDS087004LF,		

		NO SUBS.	вох	\$
126	16253	BANDAGE NON-STERILE MATRIX ELASTIC BANDAGES, 2" X 5 YD., VELCRO, LATEX FREE, 10/BOX, MEDLINE ITEM MDS087002LF NO SUBS.	, BOX	\$
127	16254	CARPUJET, STERILE CARTRIDGE UNIT, HOSPIRA, LIST NO. 2049-02.	EACH	\$
128	16258	REMOVER NAIL POLISH REMOVER PADS, 100/BOX, MEDLINE, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
129	16261	TAPE TRANSPORE SURGICAL TAPES, 3M HEALTHCARE, CLEAR, POROUS, HYPOALLERGENIC, 1" X 10 YDS., 12/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
130	16262	BANDAGES CURITY ADHESIVE, FLEXIBLE, 2" X 3 1/2", 50/BOX KENDALL HEALTHCARE NO SUBS.	вох	\$
131	16263	BANDAGES CURITY ADHESIVE, FLEXIBLE, CLOTH, 1", 50/BOX. KENDALL HEALTHCARE, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
132	16264	BAGS SMARTSAFE PROPERTY BAGS, 315 MM X 275 MM, SMALL SIZE, DESIGNED TO SECURE, TRACK AND RETURN PERSONAL BELONGINGS, (JEWELRY, MEDICATION, DENTURES), 25/BOX, TSG ASSOCIATES ITEM, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
133	16265	TOURNIQUET, C-A-T, COMBAT APPLICATION		

		TOURNIQUET, 6.5" L X 2.4" W X 1.5" D, BLAC NSN #6515-01-521-7976, NO SUBS	CK, EACH	\$
134	16267	PILLOW CASE, STANDARD, 17" X 25", 100/CASE, WHITE, TAYLOR HEALTHCARE #90-2PC1722, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
135	16268	CLIPPER 3M SURGICAL, CLIPPER STARTER KIT 9667L KIT CONTAINS 9661L BODY AND STAND, 9662L CHARGER, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
136	16275	PADS MONITOR DEFIBRILLATION, MULTI-FUNCTION ELECTRODE PADS, PLUG-STYLE, PEDIATRIC PLUS, 5 P/BOX, PHILLIPS ITEM #M3717A, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
137	16272	CATHETER ANGIOCATH, 14 GAUGE, 3.25", STERILE, BECTON DICKINSON ITEM #BD382268, 10/BOX.	вох	\$
138	16273	SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9%, 10ML PREFILLED SYRINGE WITH LUER LOCK, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, 30 PER BOX, BECTON DICKINS ON ITEM #BD306546, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
139	162 <b>7</b> 5	PADS MONITOR DEFIBRILLATION, MULTI- FUNCTION ELECTRODE PADS, PLUG-STYLE, PEDIATRIC PLUS, 5 PR/BOX, PHILLIPS ITEM #M3717A, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
140	16277	CUFF BLOOD PRESSURE, REUSABLE NBP KIT, INCLUDES 5 SIZES: INFANT, PEDIATRIC, ADULT, LARGE ADULT, THIGH, PHILLIPS ITEMS 40400B, NO SUBS.	PACK	\$

141	16278	FILTER ETCO2 INTUBATED CIRCUIT, FILTER		
		LINE SET ADULT/PEDIATRIC, 25 SETS/CASE,		
		PHILLIPS ITEM #M1920A, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
		THEE STEM WILLSES, 110 0000.		Υ
142	16279	CIRCUIT NON-INTUBATED, SINGLE		
		PURPOSE, SMART CAPNOLINE PEDIATRIC		
		SIZE, CO2, 25 SETS/CASE, PHILLIPS		
		ITEM #M2524A, NO SUBS.	CASE	¢
		11EW #1012324A, NO 30B3.	CASE	
143	16280	CIRCUIT NON-INTUBATED, SINGLE		
		PURPOSE, SMART CAPNOLINE ADULT		,
		SIZE, CO2, 25 SETS/CASE, PHILLIPS		
Ċ		ITEM #M2526A, NO SUBS.	CASE	¢
		11EW #1012320A, NO 30B3.	CASE	· .
144	16281	PAPER 75MM, CHEMICAL THERMAL		
1-1-1	10201	PAPER, 10 ROLLS/PACK, PHILLIPS		
		ITEM #98903138171.	PACK	ė
		11EW #96903136171.	PACK	3
145	16284	PADS DEFIBRILLATION, SMART PAD III,		
_,,,		FOR THE FR3 DEFIBRILLATOR, 5 SETS PER		
		BOX, PHILLIPS #989803149991, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
		50X, THEER 5 #505005145551, NO 5005.	box	Ψ
146	16285	CUFF BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, TRADITIONAL		
		REUSABLE NBP PEDIATRIC SIZE, PHILLIPS		
		MRX #40401B, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
		,		
147	16286	CUFF. BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, TRADITIONAL		
		REUSABLE NBP LARGE ADULT SIZE, PHILLIPS		
		MRX #40401D, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
148	16287	GAUZE SPONGES, 12 PLY, 4" X 4", STERILE,		
		LATEX FREE, USP TYPE VII, 50/BOX,		
		MEDLINE, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
				* *

149	16300	MASK ADULT 3 IN 1, INCLUDES MASK WITH FLAPPER VALVE, 7' OXYGEN SUPPLY TUBING AND OXYGEN CONNECTOR, ADJUSTABLE NOSE CLIP, 750ML RESERVOIR BAG, HUDSON RCI-TELEFLEX MEDICAL ITEM #1061, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED 50/CASE,	ı	
		NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
150	16301	MASK PEDIATRIC NON REBREATHING WITH SAFETY VENT, ADJUSTABLE NOSE CLIP, 750ML RESERVOIR BAG COMPLETE WITH 7' OXYGEN SUPPLY TUBING, HUDSON RCI TELEFLEX MEDICAL ITEM #1058, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED 50/CASE,		
		NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
151	16302	MASK INFANT HIGH CONCENTRATION WITH 7' TUBING, HUDSON RCI-TELEFLEX MEDICAL ITEM #395407, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, 50/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
152	16303	MASK AEROSOL ELONGATED PEDIATRIC HUDSON RCI-TELEFLEX MEDICAL ITEM #1085, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, 50/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
153	16304	MASK AEROSOL ELONGATED ADULT, HUDSON RCI-TELEFLEX MEDICAL ITEM #1083, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, 50/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
154	16305	NEBULIZER SMALL VOLUME NEBULIZERS MICRO MIST, CONTAINS: NEBULIZER, TEE,		

		MOUTHPIECE, RESERVOIR TUBE, 7' TUBING, STANDARD CONNECTOR, HUDSON RCITELEFLEX MEDICAL ITEM #1883, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, 50/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
155	16306	MASK TRACHESTOMY PEDIATRIC, HUDSON RCI-TELEFLEX MEDICAL ITEM #1076, MASKS ARE INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED 50/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
156	16307	MASK TRACHEOSTOMY ADULT, HUDSON RCI-TELEFLEX MEDICAL ITEM #1075, MASKS ARE INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED 50/CASE. NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
157	16308	HUMIDIFIERS AQUAPAK, RESERVOIR BOTTLES HAVE BUILT-IN OXYGEN TUBING CONNECTORS, AQUAPAK 340ML KIT, 340ML OF STERILE WATER, INCLUDES 000-40 HUMIDIFIER ADAPTOR, HUDSON RCI- TELEFLEX MEDICAL ITEM #003-40, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED 20/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
158	16309	CANNULA SOFTECH NASAL, ADULT, 7' STAR LUMEN TUBING, STANDARD CONNECTOR, HUDSON RCI-TELEFLEX MEDICAL ITEM #1820, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, 50/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
159	16310	CANNULA SOFTECH NASAL, PEDIATRIC, 7' STAR LUMEN TUBING, STANDARD CONNECTOR, HUDSON RCI-TELEFLEX		

		MEDICAL ITEM #1838, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, 50/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
160	16313	PADS ADULT PRE-CONNECT, 10 PER SET, PHILLIPS MRX #989803166021, NO SUBS.	SET	\$
161	16314	CABLE 10-LEAD ECG TRUNK CABLE, 12-PIN CONNECTOR, 1.3 METERS LONG, (3 LEAD PLUS 12 LEAD USE) PHILLIPS MRX #M3525A. NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
162	16315	CABLE 5-LEAD RUGGEDIZED EMS SET, SNAP, SHIELDED (AAMI), LIMB, PHILLIPS MRX #989803176161, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
163	16316	CABLE 5-LEAD RUGGEDIZED EMS SET, SNAP, SHIELDED (AAMI) CHEST, PHILLIPS MRX #989803176171, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
164	16317	CABLES EXTERNAL MULTIFUNCTION CABLES HANDS-FREE PADS CABLE, HEADSTART CONNECTOR, PLUG-STYLE, PHILLIPS MRX #M3508A, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
165	16318	SENSOR SPO2 REUSABLE, ADULT FINGER, (1M) PHILLIPS MRX #M1191B, 1 SENSOR, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
166	16319	SENSOR SPO2 REUSABLE, PEDIATRIC/ SMALL ADULT FINGER, PHILLIPS MRX #M1192A, 1 SENSOR, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
167	16320	ADAPTER CABLE, NELLCOR SPO2 SENSOR (3M) PHILLIPS MRX #M1943A, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$

168	16321	CABLE NIBP INTERCONNECT TUBING, ADULT, PRESSURE (3M) PHILLIPS MRX #M1599B.	EACH	\$
169	16322	CUFF BLOOD PRESSURE, CUFF, TRADITIONAL REUSABLE NBP ADULT, PHILLIPS MRX #40401C, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
170	16323	BATTERY LITHIUM ION BATTERY MODULE, PHILLIPS MRX #M3538A, NO SUBS	EACH	\$
171	16324	CHARGER AC POWER MODULE, PHILLIPS MRX #M3539A, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
172	16326	CASE SOFT CARRYING CASE, MRX BLACK, (PADS ONLY) PHILLIPS MRX #989803172501, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
173	16328	TRAY DATA CARD TRAY, PHILLIPS MRX #M3544A, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
174	16329	CARD DATA CARD AND TRAY, PHILLIPS MRX #989803146981, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
175	16330	HOOK MRX WIDE METAL BEDRAIL HOOK, PHILLIPS MRX #M3549A, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
176	16331	CASE FR3 SYSTEM CASE, RIGID, PHILLIPS #989803149971, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
177	16333	KEY FR3 INFANT/CHILD KEY, PHILLIPS #989803150031, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$

178	16334	BATTERY REPLACEMENT BATTERY FOR THE FR3 DEFIBRILLATOR, PHILLIPS #989803150161, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
179	16376	SHARPS CONTAINER, SHARPS DART, SHARPS CONTAINER WITH ONE TIME LOCKABLE SEAL, 6.5" CURAPLEX, 24/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
180	16377	COLD PACK, STANDARD COLD PACK, 5.75" X 9", LATEX FREE, MEDLINE, 24/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
181	16380	SPLINT, SAM SPLINT, XL, 5.5" X 36", WATERPROOF, REUSABLE, FLATFOLD, RADIOLUCENT SAM MEDICAL PRODUCTS #SP1121XL, 32 PER CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
182	16381	BATTERY, 12V DC NIMH, RECHARGEABLE, FOR LCSC 4: LAERDAL ITEM #886113, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
183	16382	CPAP SYSTEM, FLOW-SAFE II, DISPOSABLE, LATEX FREE, BUILT IN MANOMETER & PRESSURE RELIEF VALVE, LARGE ADULT MASK, HEAD HARNESS, 7' OXYGEN TUBING, BLUE PACKAGE, MERCURY MEDICAL #10-57209, 5 PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
184	16383	CPAP SYSTEM, FLOW-SAFE II, DISPOSABLE, LATEX FREE, BUILT IN MANOMETER & PRESSURE RELIEF VALVE, SMALL ADULT MASK, HEAD HARNESS, 7' OXYGEN		

		TUBING, GREEN PACKAGE, MERCURY MEDICAL #10-57210, 5 PER BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
185	16384	CANISTER SUCTION KIT: 850CC SUCTION CANISTER KIT WITH FLOAT LID AND SUCTION TUBING (1 EACH OF 6' TUBING AND 18" TUBING), MEDLINE INDUSTRIES #HCS7851: 12 KITS PER CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
186	16385	HOLDER SUCTION CANISTER HOLDER, SSCOR/BOARD CANISTER HOLDER - METAL, MFG ITEM #22002, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
187	16386	TRIAGE KIT, ARIZONA, RED FANNY PACK, WITH 35 TRIAGE TAGS/TIES, 15 IMMEDIATE DECALS, 6 ORAL AIRWAYS, 1 PR TRAUMA SCISSORS, 3 PENS, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
188	16387	TRIAGE IMMEDIATE DECAL, WHITE LETTERS ON RED BACKGROUND, 5" X 7", 15 PER PACK, NO SUBS.	PACK	\$
189	16388	TRIANGLE ROAD WARNING KIT, REFLECTIVE, 3 TRIANGLES IN HEAVY DUTY ABS RED CASE.	EACH	\$
190	16389	BUCKET 5 GALLON, PLAIN WHITE (NO WRITING OR DESIGNS) WITH LID AND HANDLE, POLYETHYLENE.	EACH	\$
191	16390	SPLINT TRACTION, PEDIATRIC, FERNO MODEL #443, WITH CARRYING CASE, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$

192	16393	EQUIPLITE RUSCH LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE, DISPOSABLE, LED, TELEFLEX, MACINTOSH SIZE O, COLOR-CODE PEACH, ITEM #004651000, 20/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
193	16394	EQUIPLITE RUSCH LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE, DISPOSABLE, LED, TELEFLEX, MACINTOSH SIZE 1, COLOR-CODE WHITE, ITEM #004651001, 20/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
194	16395	EQUIPLITE RUSCH LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE, DISPOSABLE, LED, TELEFLEX, COLOR-CODE TURQUOISE, ITEM #004651002, MACINTOSH, SIZE 2, 20/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
195	16396	EQUIPLITE RUSCH LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE, DISPOSABLE, LED, TELEFLEX, COLOR-CODE YELLOW, ITEM #004651003, MACINTOSH, SIZE 3, 20/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
196	16397	EQUIPLITE RUSCH LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE, DISPOSABLE, LED, TELEFLEX, COLOR-CODE PINK, ITEM #004651004, MACINTOSH, SIZE 4, 20/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
197	16398	EQUIPLITE RUSCH LARYNGOSOPE BLADE, DISPOSABLE, LED, TELEFLEX, COLOR-CODE PURPLE,		

		ITEM #004650000, MILLER, SIZE 0, 20/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
198	16399	EQUIPLITE RUSCH LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE, DISPOSABLE, LED, TELEFLEX, COLOR-CODE ORANGE, ITEM #004650001, MILLER, SIZE 1, 20/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
199	16400	EQUIPLITE RUSCH LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE, DISPOSABLE, LED, TELEFLEX, COLOR-CODE GRAY, ITEM #004650002, MILLER, SIZE 2, 20/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
200	16401	EQUIPLITE RUSCH LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE, DISPOSABLE, LED, TELEFLEX, COLOR-CODE GREEN, ITEM # 004650003, MILLER, SIZE 3, 20/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
201	16402	EQUILITE RUSCH LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE, DISPOSABLE, LED, TELEFLEX, COLOR-CODE LIGHT LAVENDER ITEM #004650004, MILLER, SIZE 4, 20/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
202	16405	LARYNGOSCOPE HANDLE, WATER RESISTANT, RUSCH DOLPHIN STANDARD LARYNGOSCOPE HANDLE SMALL/ PENLIGHT, "AA" BATTERIES, TELEFLEX ITEM #145100, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
203	16406	LARYNGOSCOPE HANDLE, WATER		

		RESISTANT, RUSCH DOLPHIN, STANDARD LARYNGOSCOPE HANDLE, MEDIUM/ STANDARD, "C" BATTERIES, TELEFLEX ITEM #145000, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
204	16407	GAUZE QUIKCLOT, QUIKCLOT COMBAT GAUZE LE, 3" X 4 YARDS, Z-FOLDED, SOFT, WHITE, NON-WOVEN, HYDROPHILIC GAUZE IMPREGNATED WITH KAOLIN, ITEM #350, IS PACKAGED IN AN EASY-TEAR POUCH, CONTAINS AN X-RAY DETECTABLE STRIP FOR EASY IDENTIFICATION AND HAS FIVE YEAR EXPIRATION, EACH, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
205	16409	GAUZE BANDAGE, STERILE, LATEX FREE, BULKEE II, 4.5" X 4.1 YDS, MEDLINE, 100/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
206	16410	AIRWAY NASOPHARYNGEAL, ROBERTAZZI, LATEX FREE, SOFT AND FLEXIBLE, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, SIZE 20 FR, 10/BOX.	вох	\$
207	16411	AIRWAY NASOPHARYNGEAL, ROBERTAZZI, LATEX FREE, SOFT AND FLEXIBLE, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, SIZE 22 FR, 10/BOX.	вох	\$
208	16412	AIRWAY NASOPHARNYGEAL, ROBERTAZZI, LATEX FREE, SOFT AND FLEXIBLE, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, SIZE 24 FR, 10/BOX.	вох	\$
209	16414	AIRWAY NASOPHARNYGEAL ROBERTAZZI,		

		LATEX FREE, SOFT AND FLEXIBLE, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, SIZE 29 28 FR, 10/BOX.	вох	\$
210	16415	AIRWAY NASOPHARNYGEAL, ROBERTAZZI, LATEX FREE, SOFT AND FLEXIBLE, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, SIZE 30 FR, 10/BOX.	вох	\$
211	16416	AIRWAY NASOPHARYNGEAL, ROBERTAZZI, LATEX FREE, SOFT AND FLEXIBLE, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, SIZE 32 FR, 10/BOX.	вох	\$
212	16417	AIRWAY NASOPHARNYGEAL, ROBERTAZZI, LATEX FREE, SOFT AND FLEXIBLE, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, SIZE 34 FR, 10/BOX.	вох	\$
213	16418	AIRWAY NASOPHARNYGEAL, ROBERTAZZI, LATEX FREE, SOFT AND FLEXIBLE, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, SIZE 36 FR, 10/BOX.	вох	\$
214	16419	SYRINGE DISPOSABLE, WITH 1/5ML GRADUATION, STERILE, SINGLE USE, 10ML, BO LUER-LOK TIP, BECTON DICKINSON ITEM #309604, 100/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
215	16420	SYRINGE DISPOSABLE, HAS 1 ML, 3/4 OZ. IN 1/8 OZ GRADUATION, STERILE SINGLE USE, 20 ML BD LUER-LOK TIP, BECTON DICKINSON #302830, 48/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$

216	16421	AIRWAY NASOPHARYNGEAL, ROBERTAZZI, LATEX FREE, SOFT AND FLEXIBLE, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED, SIZE 26 FR, 10/BOX.	вох	\$
217	16422	SYRINGE WITH DETACHABLE NEEDLE, 23G X 1" BD ECLIPSE HYPODERMIC NEEDLE WITH PIVOTING SHIELDING MECHANISM, 3 ML BD LUER-LOK, BECTON DICKINSON		
		#305782, 50/BOX, NO SUBS.	BOX	\$
218	16423	SYRINGE WITH DETACHABLE NEEDLE, 27G X 1/2" BD ECLIPSE HYPODERMIC NEEDLE WITH PIVOTING SHIELDING MECHANISM, 1 ML BD LUER-LOK, BECTON DICKINSON #A305789, 50/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
219	16424	SUCTION UNIT, MECONIUM ASPIRATOR, SINGLE HAND, THUMB PORT, NEOTECH PRODUCT, ELIMINATES MOUTH SUCTIONING OF MECONIUM OF NEW BORNS, 40/BOX, REF: BOUNDTREE #590101		
		NO SUBS	BOX	\$
220	16425	CATHETER SUCTION, COILED, GRADUATED WITH CONTROL TIP, FROSTED SURFACE, KINK RESISTANT, SIZE: 8	CASE	\$
221	16426	CATHETER SUCTION, COILED, GRADUATED WITH CONTROL TIP, FROSTED SURFACE, KINK RESISTANT, SIZE: 10, FRENCH,	CASE	¢
		50 PER CASE.	CASE	3
222	16428	CATHETER SUCTION, COILED, GRADUATED		

		WITH CONTROL TIP, FROSTED SURFACE, KINK RESISTANT, SIZE: 14 FRENCH, 50 PER CASE.	CASE	\$
223	16429	CATHETER SUCTION, COILED, GRADUATED WITH CONTROL TIP, FROSTED SURFACE, KINK RESISTANT, SIZE: 16 FRENCH, 50 PER CASE.	CASE	\$
224	16430	CATHETER SUCTION, COILED, GRADUATED WITH CONTROL TIP, FROSTED SURFACE, KINK RESISTANT, SIZE: 18 FRENCH, 50 PER CASE.	CASE	\$
225	16431	YANKAUER, STANDARD BULB TIP WITH CONTROL VENT, SINGLE USE, STERILE DYNAREX, 50/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
226	16432	AIRWAYS BERMAN, COLOR-CODED, DISPOSABLE, 40MM, SIZE 4, PINK, 50 PER BAG, NO SUBS.	BAG	\$
227	16433	AIRWAYS BERMAN, COLOR-CODED, DISPOSABLE, 50MM, SIZE 5, LT. BLUE, 50 PER BAG, NO SUBS.	BAG	\$
228	16434	AIRWAYS BERMAN, COLOR-CODED, DISPOSABLE, 60MM, SIZE 6, BLACK, 50 PER BAG, NO SUBS.	BAG	\$
229	16435	AIRWAYS BERMAN, COLOR-CODED, DISPOSABLE, 70MM, SIZE 7, WHITE, 50 PER BAG, NO SUBS.	BAG	\$

230	16436	AIRWAYS BERMAN, COLOR-CODED, DISPOSABLE, 80MM, SIZE 8, GREEN, 50 PER BAG, NO SUBS.	BAG	\$
231	16437	AIRWAYS BERMAN, COLOR-CODED, DISPOSABLE, 90MM, SIZE 9, YELLOW, 50 PER BAG, NO SUBS.	BAG	\$
232	16438	AIRWAYS BERMAN, COLOR-CODED, DISPOSABLE, 100MM, SIZE 10, PURPLE, 50 PER BAG, NO SUBS.	BAG	\$
233	16439	AIRWAYS BERMAN, COLOR-CODED, DISPOSABLE, 110MM, SIZE 11, ORANGE, 50 PER BAG, NO SUBS.	BAG	\$
234	16440	AIRWAY KING LTS-D, SUPRAGLOTTIC AIRWAY KIT SIZE 4, KLTSD424, 10/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
235	16441	AIRWAY KING LTS-D, SUPRAGLOTTIC AIRWAY KIT SIZE 5, KLTSD425, 10/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
236	16442	RESTRAINTS LIMB, ADULT, WRIST/ANKLE, 2 D-RINGS, ADJUSTABLE, DISPOSABLE, POLY, WHITE, 48 PER CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
237	16443	SHEET BURN, LARGE, 60" X 96", STERILE, TO PROTECT PATIENT FROM INFECTION, DISPOSABLE, NON-WOVEN, LAMINATED TISSUE FIBERS, RESISTANT TO TEARING, 12 PER CASE.	CASE	\$

238	16444	CATHETER SUCTION, COILED, GRADUATED WITH CONTROL TIP, FROSTED SURFACE, KINK RESISTANT, SIZE: 12 FRENCH, 50 PER CASE.	CASE	\$
239	16445	BANDAGE TRIANGULAR, LATEX FREE, POLYBAGGED, 2 SAFETY PINS, 40" X 40" X 56", 12 PER CASE.	CASE	\$
240	16447	BLADE 3M SINGLE-USE PIVOTING BLADE 3M #9660, ASSEMBLY FOR CLIPPER 9661L, 50 PER CASE.	CASE	\$
241	16468	CABLE TRUNK, 10 LEAD, ECG TRUNK, 6.5' WITH 2 PIN, PHILLIPS #M1663A, REF: MATRX #4996623, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
242	16469	BLANKET 100% POLYESTER, DISPOSABLE, GRAY, 60" X 80", DYNAREX, 24 PER CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
243	16471	BANDAGE EMERGENCY, FIRST CARE, WHITE, 4" COMPRESSION, STERILE 100 PER CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
244	16472	GLUTOSE 15, ORAL GLUCOSE GEL, 15G GLUCOSE PER TUBE, 3 TUBES PER PACK, 12 PACK\$ PER CASE, GRAPE FLAVOR, NDC #0574-0070-30. NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
245	16474	GLUTOSE 15, ORAL GLUCOSE GEL, 15G GLUCOSE PER TUBE, 3 TUBES PER PACK, 12 PACK\$ PER CASE, LEMON FLAVOR, NDC #0574-0069-30, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$

246	16476	OINTMENT TRIPLE ANTIBIOTIC, 0.9 GRAM FOIL PACKET, DYNAREX, 144/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
247	16477	BAG FERNO, PROFESSIONAL ALS BAG SYSTEM WITH THE ADDITION OF 4 MINI- BAGS: MEDICATION MINI-BAG 5114/ INTUBATION MINI-BAG 5115 AND TWO INTRAVENOUS MINI-BAG 5116, BLUE FERNO ITEM #0819791, OR RED FERNO ITEM #0819790, COLOR AND PART NUMBER TO BE SPECIFIED AT TIME OF ORDER, NO SUBS	EACH	\$
248	16478	BAG FERNO PROFESSIONAL INTRAVENOUS MINI-BAG, BLUE FERNO ITEM #0819819, OR RED FERNO ITEM #0819818, COLOR AND PART NUMBER TO BE SPECIFIED AT TIME OF ORDER, NO SUES.	EACH	\$
249	16479	BAG FERNO PROFESSIONAL INTUBATION MINI-BAG BLUE FERNO ITEM #0819816, OR RED FERNO ITEM #0819815, COLOR AND PART NUMBER TO BE SPECIFIED AT TIME OF ORDER, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
250	16480	BAG FERNO PROFESSIONAL BAG ONLY, BLUE FERNO ITEM #0819788, OR RED FERNO ITEM #0819787, COLOR AND PART NUMBER TO BE SPECIFIED AT TIME OF ORDER, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
251	16481	BOTTOM REPLACEMENT FOR FERNO BAG		

		MB5108, REPLACEMENT BOTTOM 5156, BLACK, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
252	16482	POUCH UTILITY, PROPAK MANUFACTURING 9" LONG X 9 1/4" WIDE X 2 3/4" DEEP, BLUE IN COLOR, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
253	16483	FORCEPS CHILD, 8" MAGILL, STAINLESS STEEL, AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC #315, 12/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
254	16484	TRANSPORT UNIT, GRAHAM, MEGAMOVER, WHIE WITH 14 HANDLES, 1000 LB CAPACITY 40" X 80", 10 PER CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
255	16486	CABLE 3 LEAD ECG CABLE FOR FR3, PHILLIPS #989803150041, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
256	16487	SOFTWARE FR3 SOFTWARE UPGRADE KIT SP02, PHILLIPS #989803184831, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
257	16488	CUFF BLOOD PRESSURE, AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORPORATION (ADC), BLACK ENAMEL 300 mmHg MANOMETER, CHROME PLATED BRASS AIR RELIEF VALVE, LEATHERETTE CARRYING CASE, CHILD, ADC #760-9CBK, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
258	16489	BACKBOARD PEDIATRIC IMMOBILIZER BOARDS WITH CASE, FROM 28" TO 54", FERNO #78, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
259	16490	TRIAGE KIT, ARIZONA TRIAGE SYSTEM INCILUDES: CUSTOM DESIGNED FANNY		

		PACK, CONTAINING 35 TRIAGE TAGS & TIES, 1 PR TRAUMA SHEARS, 15 REFLECTIVE "IMMEDIATE" DECALS, 3 PENS, 6 ORAL AIRWAYS.	EACH	\$
		REF: BOUNDTREE #681207. NO SUBS,	EACH	\$
260	16492	SPLINT TRACTION, CHILD, FERNO #443,		
		NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
261	16493	KENDRICK EXTRICATION DEVICE, GREEN,		
		FERNO #1E1250, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
262	16503	PEDIA TAPE PEDIATRIC EMERGENCY MEASURING TAPE, COLOR-CODED, LAMINATED, MEASURE LENGTH AND ESTIMATE WEIGHT, COMPATIBLE WITH		
		THE MOST RECENT BROSELOW TAPE, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
263	16504	WRENCH LARGE CYLINDER, FOR USE WITH CGA OXYGEN REGULATORS, METAL.	EACH	\$
264	16505	CONNECTOR 02, NIPPLE/NUT, SWIVEL, GREEN, BARB ADAPTER, FOR CONNECTING OXYGEN MASKS OR CANNULA TO OXYGEN	DAG	•
		FLOWMETER, 50/BAG.	BAG	\$
265	16506	BAG FERNO, AIRWAY MANAGEMENT/ OXYGEN, INCLUDES: TWO 5137 UTILITY POUCHES/ONE 5131 POUCH, AND 02 BAG WITH HANDLE, BLUE IN COLOR, FERNO		
		ITEM #0819770, NO SUBS.	EACH	>
266	16507	BOTTOM REPLACEMENT, REPLACEABLE		

		<b>BOTTOM TO PROTECT BAG FROM WET</b>		
		GROUND, FERNO, COMPATIBLE WITH		
	,	AIRWAY MANAGEMENT OXYGEN BAG		
		#MB5100, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
267	16508	ADAPTER/CONNECTOR QUICK CONNECT,		
		VACUUM OHMEDA, 1/4" HOSE BARB,		
		PRECISION, ITEM #2311, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
268	16509	FLOWMETER OXYGEN WITH OHMEDA QUIC	CK	
		CONNECT ADAPTER, 0-15 LPM, PRECISION		•
		ITEM #8MFA1005, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
269	16510	REGULATOR COMPACT, WITH NUT AND		
		NIPPLE, OXYGEN, BRASS (CGA-540/GR-540)		
		AMVEX, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
270	16511	LABEL BIOHAZARD, MEETS OSHA		
		REQUIREMENTS FOR BLOODBORNE		
		PATHOGENS, PEEL AND STICK, 6" X 6",		
		RED BACKGROUND, BLACK LETTERING,		
		WITH INTERNATIONAL BIOHAZARD		
		SYMBOL, 500/ROLL, NO SUBS.	ROLL	\$
271	16513	CANISTER SUCTION, HI-FLOW SUCTION		
		CANISTERS W/ AEROSTAT FILTERS AND		
		FLOAT VALVE SHUTOFF, 800CC WITH 6'		
		CONNECTING TUBE, BEMIS, PRODUCT		
		#8002K 055, 50/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
272	16514	TUBE VACUUM, LAERDAL SUCTION UNIT,		
		LCSU 4, LAERDAL #886106, EA, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
273	16515	BRACKET SHARPS CONTAINER, COVIDIEN,		

		ITEM #31158960, 20/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
274	16516	DISPENSER EMESIS BAG, WALL MOUNT,		
		HOLDS UP TO 24 BAGS, MEDLINE		
		#NON80328D, 6/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
275	16517	NASAL ATOMIZER, INTRANASAL MUCOSAL		
		ATOMIZATION DEVICE, LMA MAD NASAL,		
		TELEFLEX #MAD300, 25/BOX, NO SUBS.	BOX	\$
276	16518	NEEDLE STABILIZER, EZ-10, EZ-STABILIZER,		
		LATEX-FREE 5.75" X 5.25" X 1.25", MFG		
		ITEM #9066-VC-005, 5/BOX, NO SUBS.	BOX	\$
277	16519	SENSOR SP02, ADULT/PEDIATRIC FINGER		
		CLIP, DISPOSABLE, PHILLIPS #M1131A,		
		20 SENSORS/BOX, NO SUBS.	BOX	\$
278	16520	SENSOR SP02, INFANT, DISPOSABLE,		
		PHILLIPS #M1132A, 20 SENSORS/BOX,		
		NO SUBS.	BOX	\$
279	16521	CABLE NIBP BLOOD PRESSURE AIR HOSE,		
		1.5M LENGTH, PHILLIPS ITEM #M1598B,		
		NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
280	16523	SENSI WRAP, DYNAREX, SELF-ADHERENT,		
		LATEX-FREE, 2" X 5 YDS, RAINBOW COLOR,		
		36 PER CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
281	16524	PHILLIPS SMART CAPNOLINE PLUS 02,		
		ADULT/INTERMED, NON-INTUBATED DUAL		
		PURPOSE, ORAL/NASAL SAMPLE LINE,		
		25 SETS PER BOX, NO SUBS.	BOX	\$

282	17377	STETHOSCOPE PLATINUM PEDIATRIC ADSCOPE 614, PEDIATRIC, OVERALL LENGTH 30.5", ADC (AMERICAN DAIGNOSTIC CORPORATION) ITEM #614P, COLOR-PINK NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
283	17378	TRANSPORT RESTRAIN SYSYTEM, FERNO, MODEL 417-3, SHOULDER HARNESS, ITEM #031-4183, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
284	17379	TRANSPORT RESTRAIN SYSTEM, FERNO, MODEL 417-3, WAIST RESTRAINT, ITEM #031-4184, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
285	17380	RESTRAINT SHOULDER HARNESS, COT RESTRAINT, FERNO, MODEL 417-1, FEATURES TWO ADJUSTABLE SHOULDER STRAPS AND AN ADJUSTABLE TWO-PIECE TORSO STRAP, BLACK, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
286	17381	RESTRAINT COT, TWO-PIECE, ADJUSTABLE, FERNO, MODEL 430, 7' (FT) IN LENGTH, BLACK, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
287	17382	RESTRAINT COT, TWO-PIECE, ADJUSTABLE, FERNO, MODEL 430, 9' (FT) IN LENGTH, BLACK, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
288	17383	RESTRAINT COT, TWO-PIECE, ADJUSTABLE, FERNO, MODEL 430, 5' (FT) IN LENGTH, BLACK, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
289	17384	SMART CAPNOLINE 02, PEDIATRIC CO2		

		ORAL/NASAL SAMPLING SET WITH O2 TUBING MICROSTREAM, REF 007269, 25/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
290	17385	SMART CAPNOLINE PLUS 02, ADULT INTERMEDIATE CO2, ORAL/NASAL SAMPLING SET WITH 02 TUBING, MICROSTREAM, REF 009822, 25/BOX, NO SUBS.	вох	\$
291	17386	GLOVES MICROFLEX, LIFESTAR EC, NITRILE, EXTENDED CUFF, 100 GLOVES PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE, SIZE: XL PART #LSE-104-XL, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
292	17387	GLOVES MICROFLEX, LIFESTAR EC, NITRILE, EXTENDED CUFF, 100 GLOVES PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE, SIZE: LARGE, PART #LSE-104-L, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
293	17388	GLOVES MICROFLEX, LIFESTAR EC, NITRILE, EXTENDED CUFF, 100 GLOVES PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE, SIZE: MEDIUM, PART #LSE-104-M, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
294	17389	GLOVES MICROFLEX, LIFESTAR EC, NITRILE, EXTENDED CUFF, 100 GLOVES PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE, SIZE: SMALL, PART #LSE-104-S, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
295	17390	SENSOR SP02, REUSABLE, ADULT FINGER GLOVE, LENGTH 0.45M, 9-PIN (D-SUB) CONNECTOR, FOR PHILLIPS MRX, REF #M1191T, NO SUBS.	EACH	\$

296	17518	SODIUM CHLORIDE, 0.9% SODIUM CHLORIDE INJECTION USP 500 ML BAG, (24/CASE), BRAND OR MANUFACTURER MAY BE BRAUN, BAXTER OR HOSPIRA,		
		NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
297	17519	TUBING ADAPTER, HUDSON RCI (MFR#1423	3),	
		50/CASE, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
298	17520	02 MAX BITRAC ED MASK, W/NEB, ADULT LG, W/3-SET VALVE, OHMEDA CONNECTOR,	<i>.</i>	
		FIXED FLOW, 10 EA/CS, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
299	17521	02 MAX BITRAC ED MASK, W/NEB, ADULT MED, W/3-SET VALVE, OHMEDA CONNECTO	DR,	
		FIXED FLOW, 10 EA/CS, NO SUBS.	CASE	\$
300	17522	C PAP/CAPNOGRAPHY KIT, 02 MAX NEB BITRAC ED MASK, ADULT LG, 3-SET, OHMEDA CONNECT, CO2 SAMPLING LINE,		
		NO SUBS.	EACH	\$
301	17523	C PAP/CAPNOGRAPHY KIT, 02 MAX NEB BITRAC ED MASK, ADULT MED, 3-SET, OHMEDA CONNECT, CO2 SAMPLING LINE,		
		NO SUBS.	EACH	\$



## **BID NOTICE**

THE CITY OF MOBILE HAS ISSUED BID 5168
FOR EQUIPMENT MEDICAL.

FOR A COPY GO TO:

CITYOFMOBILE.ORG/BIDS

SELECT BID 5168 EQUIPMENT MEDICAL.

BID MUST BE RETURNED IN SEALED ENVELOPE

WITH BID NUMBER WRITTEN ON OUTSIDE OF

ENVELOPE.

DO NOT EMAIL OR FAX THIS BID BACK.



## PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

Potential bidders are responsible to check this site for any ADDENDUMS that are issued. It is the responsibility of the BIDDER to check for, download, and include with their BID RESPONSE any and all ADDENDUMS that are issued for a specific BID published by the City of Mobile. Failure to download and include ADDENDUMS in your BID RESPONSE may cause your bid to be rejected.

This is a sealed bid. Any responses faxed or e-mailed will be rejected.

This is a sealed bid. Any response must be submitted in a sealed envelope with the bid number and bid opening date on the outside of the envelope.

Any response that arrives improperly marked or with no bid number and opening date on the outside of the delivery or express package and opened in error will be rejected and not considered.

It is the responsibility of the bidder to insure that their bid response is delivered to and received in the Purchasing Department <u>before</u> the date and time of the bid opening.

Be sure to read the Terms and Conditions. All bids are F.O.B. Destination unless otherwise stated.

Be sure to sign your bid!

Package/Bid Delivery Address: Purchasing Department 205 Government St. Room S408 Mobile, AL 36644

(Request First Delivery)