

BID # 4880

VEST SAFETY

10:30AM WED

18 NOV 2015

2017

RITZ SAFETY

RAM TOOL & SUPPLY

REFLECTIVE APPAREL FACTORY INC

COMADE INC

TRANSAFE INC

ALABAMA INDUSTRIES FOR THE BLIND

1. 16311 CLASS 3 LIME GREEN

7.45 CORDOVA V3001

7.93 PROTECTIVE IND. PRODUCTS #303-MY624P

8.55 RAF-588-LM

9.95 MAJESTIC 75-3301

11.92 RADIANS LHV-5ANSIC3-K

23.00 150571902

2. 16312 CLASS 3 ORANGE

7.45 CORDOVA V3000

7.93 PROTECTIVE IND. PRODUCTS #303-MY624P

8.55 RAF-588-OR

9.95 MAJESTIC 75-3302

11.92 RADIANS OH4-5ANSIC3-PC

23.00 150571902046

3. 14105 CLASS 2 LIME GREEN

4.50 CORDOVA #VZ 241P

4.00 PROTECTIVE IND. PRODUCTS #302-0702 ZOR

6.25 RAF-581-LM

8.37 MAJESTIC 75-3231

7.04 RADIANS 54226M

21.00 150571802

4. 4700 CLASS 2 ORANGE

4.50 #VZ 240P

4.00 PROTECTIVE IND. PRODUCTS #302-0702 ZLY

8.95 VEA-501-OR

5.15 MAJESTIC 75-3202

7.04 RADIANS 54220M

21.00 150571802026

	SAF-T-GLOVE 1AL NO DOCUMENTATION	BOUND TREE MEDICAL NO DOCUMENTATION	AZARIS UNIFORMS NO DOCUMENTATION	FASTENAL NO DOCUMENTATION	PRIMUS ELECTRONICS COMP NO DOCUMENTATION	MES MUNICIPAL EMERGENCY SERVICES INC
1. 16311 CLASS 3 LIME GREEN	7.75 CORDOVA V3001	NO BID	13.25 OCCUNOMIX	16.99 BODY GUARD	10.00 ERGO DYNE 8320Z	NO BID
2. 16312 CLASS 3 ORANGE	7.75 V3000 CORDOVA	NO BID	13.25 OCCUNOMIX	16.99 BODY GUARD	10.00 ERGO DYNE 8320Z	NO BID
3. 14105 CLASS 2 LIME GREEN	5.00 V241P CORDOVA	NO BID	21.75 OCCUNOMIX	14.99 BODY GUARD	5.00 ERGO DYNE 8210Z	NO BID
4. 4700 CLASS 2 ORANGE	5.00 V240P CORDOVA	NO BID	21.75 OCCUNOMIX	14.99 BODY GUARD	5.00 ERGO DYNE 8210Z	NO BID